

Attachment S - Proposed Pricing and Campus Locations																											
Ivan's Site Services Inc											Liquid Environmental Solutions of Texas, LLC											OK Pump Service					
Contact name: Lidia Teliez Email: lidia@ivanesp.com Contact No: 915-859-3469											Contact name: Lidia Teliez Email: Lidia@lvanesp.com Contact No: 915-859-3469											Contact name: Edward Torres Email: Services@okpumpservice.com Contact No: 915-603-9737					
			Grease Trap Size	Grease Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Barrel Grease Removal - including spill clean up	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Annual Grease Interceptor Inspection	SAWS Grease Trap Inspection	SAWS Grease Interceptor Inspection	Extended Cost	Grease Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Barrel Grease Removal - including spill clean up	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Grease Intercept or Inspectio	SAWS Grease Trap Inspection	SAWS Grease Interceptor Inspection	Extended Cost	Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Grease Removal -including spill	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Annual Grease Interceptor Inspection	Grease Trap Inspection	Grease Intercept or Inspectio	
Region	Campus		In gallons	Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each		Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Extended Cost	Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each
Upper Rio Grande Valley	Idea Mission		2500									\$ 0.52	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,347.61								
	Idea McAllen		1500		\$ 0.54							\$ 0.54	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 3,358.89								
	Idea North Mission		2500									\$ 0.53	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,416.46								
	Idea Rio Grande City		3000									\$ 0.56	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 6,872.32								
	Idea Tres Lagos		3000									\$ 0.52	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 6,367.75								
	Idea Los Encinos		1500									\$ 0.55	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 3,381.30								
Middle Rio Grande Valley	Idea Palmview		2000									\$ 0.54	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 4,449.01								
	Idea La Joya		5000									\$ 0.56	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 11,268.30								
	Idea Quetz		3000									\$ 0.53	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 6,461.23								
	Idea Donna		2500									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,170.15								
	Idea San Juan		2500									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,234.82								
	Idea Pharr		3000									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 6,287.43								
Lower Rio Grande Valley	Idea Alamo		2500									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,218.62								
	Idea Edinburg		4500									\$ 0.53	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 9,607.56								
	Idea Toros		2500									\$ 0.52	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,341.55								
	Idea Owassa		2500									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,259.33								
	Idea Elsa		2500									\$ 0.51	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,229.92								
	Idea Frontier		2500									\$ 0.55	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,575.07								
East San Antonio	Idea San Benito		2500									\$ 0.53	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,393.28								
	Idea Weslaco		2500									\$ 0.3650	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 147.13	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 3,797.13								
	Idea Brownsville		2500									\$ 0.54	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,530.09								
	Idea Weslaco Pike		2500									\$ 0.3650	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 147.13	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 3,797.13								
	Idea Riverview		2500									\$ 0.54	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,536.68								
	Idea Robindale		2500									\$ 0.55	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,575.07								
West San Antonio	Idea Harlingen		2500									\$ 0.52	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,300.34								
	Idea Sports Park		2500									\$ 0.54	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,530.09								
	Idea Carver		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,518.95							
	Idea Monterrey Park		2500									\$ 0.23	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,412.98							
	Idea Walzem		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,552.62							
	Idea Eastside		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,500.72							
Austin	Idea Judson		2500									\$ 0.25	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,561.14							
	Idea Converse		3000									\$ 0.26	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 3,190.12							
	Idea Najim		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,510.00							
	Idea Mays		2500									\$ 0.22	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,359.98							
	Idea Ewing Halsell		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,503.84							
	Idea South Flores		2500									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,532.36							
El Paso	Idea Brackenridge		2500									\$ 0.23	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,445.41							
	Idea Ingram Hills		2000									\$ 0.25	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,109.14							
	Idea Burke		2500									\$ 0.22	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,359.98							
	Idea Hidden Meadow		3000									\$ 0.22	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 2,789.16							
	Idea Robinson		1800									\$ 0.24	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	\$ 125.00			\$ 1,854.95							
	Idea Montopolis		2500									\$ 0.26	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,718.75								
Permian Basin	Idea Rundberg		1500									\$ 0.30	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 1,898.33								
	Idea Bluff Springs		2500									\$ 0.27	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,768.22								
	Idea Pflugerville		2500									\$ 0.28	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,887.66								
	Idea Kyle		1500									\$ 0.30	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 1,936.23								
	Idea Health Professions		2000									\$ 0.28	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,357.60								
	Idea Parmer Park		2500									\$ 0.27	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,829.51								
Greater Houston	Idea Round Rock		2000									\$ 0.30	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 2,513.28								
	Idea Rio Vista		2500	\$ 0.85	free of charge	\$55.00 per 1,500 gal	Vendor does not provide service	SA service only			\$ 8,555.00	\$ 0.96	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 9,710.00	\$ 0.92			\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00			
	Idea Edgemere		2500	\$ 0.85	free of charge	\$55.00 per 1,500 gal	Vendor does not provide service	SA service only			\$ 8,555.00	\$ 0.96	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 9,710.00	\$ 0.92			\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00			
	Idea Mesa Hills		2500	\$ 0.85	free of charge	\$55.00 per 1,500 gal	Vendor does not provide service	SA service only			\$ 8,555.00	\$ 0.96	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 9,710.00	\$ 0.92			\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00			
	Idea Horizon Vista		2500	\$ 0.85	free of charge	\$55.00 per 1,500 gal	Vendor does not provide service	SA service only			\$ 8,555.00	\$ 0.96	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 9,710.00	\$ 0.92			\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00			
	Idea Mesquite Hills		1500	\$ 0.85	free of charge	\$55.00 per 1,500 gal	Vendor does not provide service	SA service only			\$ 5,155.00	\$ 0.96	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,870.00	\$ 0.92			\$ 650.00	\$ 175.00			
Tarrant County	Idea Travis		2000									\$ 0.63	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,150.00	\$ 2.10			\$ 850.00	\$ 225.00			
	Idea Yukon		2500									\$ 0.63	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 6,410.00	\$ 2.10			\$ 850.00	\$ 225.00			
	Idea Lopez		2000									\$ 0.63	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 5,150.00	\$ 2.10			\$ 850.00	\$ 225.00			
	Idea Henry		1500									\$ 0.63	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 3,890.00	\$ 2.10			\$ 850.00	\$ 225.00			
	Idea Hardy		1500									\$ 0.27	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ -	N/A	SA service on	\$ 1,759.33								
	Idea Spears		2500									\$ 0.26	NO COST TO IDEA AS LONG AS IDEA PROVIDES BIN														

South Texas Wastewater LLC Contact name: Melanie Russey Email: Melanier@shwngv.com Contact No: 956-855-7899 ext. 1001								Southwest Disposal LLC Contact name: Edgar Villarreal Email: Evillarreal@southwestdisposal.com Contact No: 713-927-1539								Trevino Residential and Commercial, LLC Contact name: Tayde Cruz Email: bids@trevinorepairs.com Contact No: 956-670-1322									
	Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Grease Removal - including spill	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Annual Grease Interceptor Inspection	SAWS Grease Trap Inspection	SAWS Grease Interceptor Inspection	Extended Cost	Grease Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Barrel Grease Removal - including spill clean up	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Annual Grease Interceptor Inspection	SAWS Grease Trap Inspection	SAWS Grease Interceptor Inspection	Extended Cost	Trap Waste Haul & Disposal	Barrel Grease Removal - including spill clean up	Septic Tank Cleaning	Hydro Jetting Services	Annual Grease Interceptor Inspection	SAWS Grease Trap Inspection	Grease Intercept or Inspectio	Extended Cost	
Extended Cost	Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Extended Cost	Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Extended Cost	Price per gallon	Price per each (Barrel)	Price per each (Tank)	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Price per each	Extended Cost
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 2,100.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 1,635.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 6,827.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 4,200.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 3,270.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 11,462.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 2,100.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 1,635.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 6,827.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 2,800.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,180.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 8,372.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 7,000.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 5,450.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 17,642.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 4,200.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 3,270.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 11,462.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 4,200.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 3,270.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 11,462.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 6,300.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 4,905.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 16,097.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0.35					SA service only	\$ 3,500.00										\$ 0.50	\$ 165.00	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 1,602.00	\$ 425.00	SA service only	\$ 9,917.00		
	\$ 0																								