
Line Item Description Unit of Measure Forecasted QTY Unit Price Extended Cost Notes Unit Price Extended Cost Notes Unit Price Extended Cost Notes Unit Price Extended Cost Notes Unit Price Extended Cost Notes
1 MARKERBOARD -  ALUMINUM TRIM WHITEBOARD - 3X4 FT Each 10 $76.99 $769.90 QRTS534 $62.28 $622.80 LLR19771 $350.21 $3,502.10 SSL # 608476, MooreCo, Mfg # 202AC-25, Each $0.00 $44.88 $448.80 24534087, TRU RED™ Melamine Dry Erase Board, Black Frame, 4' x 3' (TR59363)

2 CORRECTION TAPE, WHITE, PACK OF 10 Pack of 10 20 $4.78 $95.60  OFD699459QuoƟng a 6/pk $6.72 $134.40 ITA60233 $16.31 $326.20 SSL # 1272203, BIC, Mfg # WOTAP10, Pack of 10 $22.78 $455.60 BICWOTAP10 $7.48 $149.60 24474011, Staples Correction Tape, White, 10/Pack (ST59820)

3 BALLPOINT PEN MEDIUM 1.0MM ASSORTED COLORS, SET OF 60 Set of 60 50 $5.66 $283.00 BICGSM609AST $6.99 $349.50 BICGSM609AST $5.80 $290.00 SSL # 2005878, BIC, Mfg # GSM609-AST, Set of 60 $9.26 $463.00 BICGSM609AST $5.28 $264.00 24298912, BIC Round Stic Xtra-Life Ballpoint Pen, Medium Point, 1.0mm, Assorted Ink, 
60/Pack (GSM609-AST)

4 DIVIDERS INSERTABLE 1 SIDED 5 TAB ASSORTED COLORS, 1 SET 1 Set 100 $0.56 $56.00 OFD574929 $0.47 $47.00 BSN36692 $0.32 $32.00 SSL # 081940, School Smart, Mfg # 081940, 1 Set $2.36 $236.00 AVE11111 $0.48 $48.00 153049, Staples Insertable Dividers, 5 Tabs, Assorted Colors (13496/11270)

5 TAPE MASKING, 1IN X 60YD Each 100 $5.08 $508.00  OFD444611QuoƟng a 3/pk $2.70 $270.00 MMM260024ARL $1.70 $170.00 SSL # 040590, Highland, Mfg # 2600 1 X 60, Each $1.92 $192.00 MMM260018A $1.21 $121.00 468413, Staples Masking Tape, 0.94" x 60 yds., Natural, 4/Pack (468413-CC)

6 PUSH PIN 3/8 IN, ASSORTED COLORS/100 BX Pack of 100 40 $0.43 $17.20  OFD565308QuoƟng a 50/pk $1.05 $42.00 BSN81001 $0.64 $25.60 SSL # 003351, School Smart, Mfg # 003351, Pack of 100 $7.89 $315.60 UBR3087U0624 $1.24 $49.60 224147, Staples Push Pins, Assorted Colors, 100/Pack (10563-CC)

7 CLIPBOARD MASONITE LETTER Each 75 $1.38 $103.50 UNV40304 $0.91 $68.25 BSN16508 $1.54 $115.50 SSL # 1272480, School Smart, Mfg # 1272480, Each $24.72 $1,854.00 SAU22521 $1.31 $98.25 112383, Staples® Hardboard Clipboard, Letter Size, Brown (ST44290)

8 TAPE DISPENSER SCOTCH C-60 TWO TONE BLACK Each 45 $3.14 $141.30 MMMC60BK $2.91 $130.95 MMMC60ST $3.19 $143.55 SSL # 078588, Scotch, Mfg # C60-BK, Each $5.10 $229.50 MMMC60BK $3.29 $148.05 567885, Scotch Desktop Dispenser, 3", 1" Core, Black (C60-ST)

9 PAPER LEGAL PADS 5X8 WHITE 50 SHEETS, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 55 $3.59 $197.45 OFD306902 $8.26 $454.30 BSN63110 $5.14 $282.70 SSL # 027445, School Smart, Mfg # 027445, Pack of 12 $9.92 $545.60 UNV57300 $4.47 $245.85 163873, Staples Notepads, 5" x 8", Narrow Ruled, White, 50 Sheets/Pad, Dozen (ST57338)

10 FOLDER 2-POCKET W/FASTENERS ASSORTED, PACK OF 25 Pack of 25 65 $5.20 $338.00 OFD552456 $12.59 $818.35 MEA38048 $5.16 $335.40 SSL # 084901, School Smart, Mfg # 084901, Pack of 25 $37.29 $2,423.85 OXF57713 $4.19 $272.35 578546, Staples Smooth 2-Pocket Paper Folder, Navy, 25/Box (27539-CC)

11 LAMINATING POUCHES SCOTCH 8.9X11.4 IN 3 MIL, PACK OF 100 Pack of 100 100 $2.06 $206.00 OFD535704 $19.95 $1,995.00 MMMTP385450M $9.46 $946.00 SSL # 086081, School Smart, School Smart, Mfg # 086081, Pack of 
100

$19.25 $1,925.00 MMMTP3854100 $7.67 $767.00 2728674, Fellowes Thermal Laminating Pouches, Letter Size, 3 Mil, 100/Pack (5743301)

12 MARKER DRY ERASE, SET OF 4 Set of 4 30 $1.96 $58.80 ITA30015 $2.08 $62.40 ITA30015 $1.19 $35.70 SSL # 1400750, School Smart, Mfg # 1400750, Set of 4 $13.89 $416.70 SAN81505 $1.17 $35.10 2056102, Staples Remarx Dry Erase Markers, Chisel Point, Assorted, 4/Pack (29205)

13 PAPERCLIPS NON-SKID, PACK OF 1000 Pack of 1000 60 $2.82 $169.20 OFD308353 $2.15 $129.00 BSN65638 $8.49 $509.40 SSL # 1500603, School Smart, Mfg # 1500603, Pack of 1000 $12.29 $737.40 ODFN308114 $1.75 $105.00 472498, Staples #1 Paper Clips, Silver, 1,000 Clips/Pack (A7026599A/50452)

14 SCISSORS, 8 IN STRAIGHT, PACK OF 2 Pack of 2 25 $1.59 $39.75 OFD458612 $1.38 $34.50 BSN65647/ Sold by the each $15.02 $375.50 SSL # 1444381, Westcott, Mfg # 13901, Pack of 2 $5.25 $131.25 ODFN458612 $6.48 $162.00 24380514, TRU RED™ 8" Titanium Coated Scissors, Straight Handle, 2/Pack (TR55023)

15 PENCIL PRESHARPENED NO. 2 YELLOW, PACK OF 30 Pack of 30 60 $5.73 $343.80 DIX13830 $9.50 $570.00 DIX13830 $6.90 $414.00 SSL # 1396854, Ticonderoga, Mfg # X13830, Pack of 30 $8.88 $532.80 UNV55401 $3.24 $194.40 24424025, Staples Pre-Sharpened Wooden Pencil, 2.2mm, #2 Medium Lead, 48/Pack 
(ST62808-CC)

16 ZIP TIES REUSABLE, PACK OF 100 Pack of 100 40 $9.87 $394.80 STCCBMZT8B $12.13 $485.20 STCCBMZT8B $18.72 $748.80 SSL # 1588938, Jacquard, Mfg # ZIPB100, Pack of 100 $22.10 $884.00 ODFN4028487 $30.38 $1,215.20 2417995, C2G Releasable/Reusable Cable Ties Cable Tie

17 FIRST AID KIT - 25 PERSON Each 50 $23.04 $1,152.00 FAO223UFAO $19.42 $971.00 FAO25001 $26.21 $1,310.50 SSL # 2003340, School Smart, Mfg # 2003340, Each $29.88 $1,494.00 FAO223UFAO $17.54 $877.00 827446, First Aid Only Plastic First Aid Kit, 25 People, 106 Pieces (223-U/FAO)

18 TAPE DISPENSER DELUXE BLACK, 0.75 IN X 1296, PACK OF 6 Pack of 6 60 $7.34 $440.40  OFD520496This has a 8/pk of tape $2.18 $130.80 BSN32954 $16.89 $1,013.40 SSL # 1369041, tape, Scotch, Mfg # 810-6PK, Pack of 6 $19.68 $1,180.80 MMM810K6C38 $8.70 $522.00 130674, Staples Desktop Dispenser, Black (10566)

19 CARTRIDGE TAPE 1/2 IN X 26 FT Each 100 $6.99 $699.00 BRTM231 $12.59 $1,259.00 BRTTZE231/ Black imprint on white tape $8.79 $879.00 SSL # 1055964, Brother, Mfg # BRTM231, Each $10.29 $1,029.00 BRTM231 $10.12 $1,012.00 917860, Brother P-touch TZe-231 Laminated Label Maker Tape, 1/2" x 26-2/10', Black On 
White (TZe-231)

20 MARKER BLACK, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 66 $1.99 $131.34 OFD128817 $3.73 $246.18 ITA30016/ Permanent marker, fine tip $3.84 $253.44 SSL # 1354255, School Smart, Mfg # 1354255, Pack of 12 $12.99 $857.34 SAN37001 $2.73 $180.18 24376656, TRU RED™ Permanent Marker, Fine Tip, Black, 12/Pack (TR54533-CC)

21 BINDER 4 IN WHITE Each 100 $3.99 $399.00 OFD486416 $9.69 $969.00 BSN28444 $23.15 $2,315.00 SSL # 1330352, Avery, Mfg # AVE17145, Each $8.69 $869.00 ODFN486416 $6.98 $698.00 976178, Staples 4" 3-Ring View Binder, D-Ring, White (55414/26358)

22 URN COFFEE 100 CUP COMMERCIAL Each 25 $136.29 $3,407.25 CFPCP100 $201.85 $5,046.25 CFPCP100 $166.25 $4,156.25 SSL # 1592642, West Bend, Mfg # 33600, Each $209.83 $5,245.75 CFPCP100 $133.88 $3,347.00 2805986, Coffee Pro® 100 Cup Plastic Handle Percolating Coffee Urn, 13 1/2" x 23", 
Stainless Steel (CP100)

23 FILE CABINET - VERTICAL LETTER Each 4 $368.03 $1,472.12 LLR60650 $655.00 $2,620.00 H314.P.P/ 4 drawer, black, letter size $206.25 $825.00 SSL # 1447115, 15"Wx25"Dx52"H, Classroom Select, Mfg # 
1447115, Each

$132.59 $530.36 ALESVF1824BL  2DRAWERS 
ONLY

$123.49 $493.96 357416, Staples 2-Drawer Vertical File Cabinet, Locking, Letter, Black, 22"D (22335D)

24 FILE FOLDER LETTER 1/3 CUT MANILA, PACK OF 100 Pack of 100 100 $6.33 $633.00 OFD543280 $10.58 $1,058.00 BSN17525 $5.67 $567.00 SSL # 015741, School Smart, Mfg # 015741, Pack of 100 $12.83 $1,283.00 ODFN543280 $8.28 $828.00 116822, Staples 30% Recycled File Folders, 1/3-Cut Tab, Right Position, Letter Size, Manila, 
100/Box (ST116822/116822)

25 FILE FOLDER HANGING LETTER SIZE ASSORTED, PACK OF 25 Pack of 25 100 $11.12 $1,112.00 OFD991686 $15.99 $1,599.00 BSN5215AST $5.15 $515.00 SSL # 085107, School Smart, Mfg # 085107, Set of 25 $11.05 $1,105.00 UNV34112 $6.98 $698.00 875411, Staples® Heavy Duty Bright Colored Hanging File Folders, 1/5-Cut Tab, Letter Size, 
Assorted Colors, 25/Box (ST875411-CC)

26 HIGHLIGHTER ASSORTED, SET OF 36 Set of 36 70 $6.64 $464.80 OFD8214096 $31.57 $2,209.90 SAN2157487 $18.95 $1,326.50 SSL # 2047959, Sharpie, Mfg # 2157487, Set of 36 $29.85 $2,089.50 SAN2133496 $6.98 $488.60 24617942, Staples Hype Tank Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Assorted, 36/Pack (ST62946)

27 SHIPPING/PACKING COMMERCIAL GRADE TAPE, 1.88 X 49.2 YARDS, PACK OF 6 Pack of 6 90 $29.75 $2,677.50 MMM37506 $14.29 $1,286.10 BSN32946 $35.45 $3,190.50 SSL # 1466606, Scotch, Mfg # 3850-6-EFS, Pack of 6 $18.56 $1,670.40 DUC240053 $5.98 $538.20 467431, Staples Packaging Tape, 1.89" x 54.6 yds., Clear, 6/Pack (ST-A18SIMP)

28 3 HOLE PUNCH, 40 SHEET Each 20 $25.67 $513.40 OFD332608 $23.37 $467.40 BSN62897 $41.20 $824.00 SSL # 1493159, LockerMate By Bostitch, Mfg # 2240, Each $34.24 $684.80 ACI12240 $24.28 $485.60 24435445, Bostitch EZ Squeeze 3-Hole Punch, 40 Sheet Capacity, Silver/Black (HP40)

29 STAPLER STARTER KIT Each 50 $6.59 $329.50 SWI54551 $5.03 $251.50 BSN41880/ Includes stapler, staples, and staple remover $3.31 $165.50 SSL # 1274192, School Smart, Mfg # 1274192, Each $12.77 $638.50 SWI40501 $4.74 $237.00 24418185, TRU RED™ Desktop Stapler Kit, 20-Sheet Capacity, Black (TR58081)

30 SHEET PROTECTOR, CLEAR, PACK OF 100 Pack of 100 120 $3.24 $388.80 OFD624900 $4.94 $592.80 BSN74447 $3.73 $447.60 SSL # 067506, School Smart, Mfg # 2150999, Pack of 100 $7.19 $862.80 UNV21130 $4.48 $537.60 24617629, Staples Lightweight Sheet Protector, 8.5" x 11", Clear, 100/Pack (ST63080)

31 POCKET CHART, STANDARD Each 45 $16.42 $738.90 LRNLER2206 $17.99 $809.55 LRNLER2206 $16.65 $749.25 SSL # 1391741, Learning Resources, Mfg # LER2206, Each $23.60 $1,062.00 LRNLER2206 $22.48 $1,011.60 2323331, Teacher Created Resources, Black 10 Pocket Chart (TCR20744)

32 PENCIL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC Each 45 $55.45 $2,495.25 EPI1670X $12.26 $551.70 BSN84200 $17.68 $795.60 SSL # 084328, School Smart, Mfg # 084328, Each $18.18 $818.10 ODFN879174 $13.99 $629.55 24598440, Staples Classroom Electric Pencil Sharpener, Black (ST62629)

33 HEAVY DUTY FOLDING TABLE 30 X 72 IN Each 40 $116.38 $4,655.20 ALE65600 $134.71 $5,388.40 LLR66655 $109.20 $4,368.00 SSL # 676050, National Public Seating, Mfg # BT3072, Each $145.99 $5,839.60 ALE65600 $49.44 $1,977.60 470949, Staples 6' x 30" Heavy Duty Plastic Folding Table, Light Gray (79223/54272)

34 BINDER 2 IN WHITE Each 25 $3.56 $89.00 OFD212365 $3.58 $89.50 BSN09957 $6.82 $170.50 SSL # 086394, School Smart, Mfg # 086394, Each $4.50 $112.50 ODFN396241 $3.32 $83.00 374812, Staples 2" 3-Ring View Binder, White (ST23725-CC)

35 MEDIUM UTILITY HOOKS AND ADHESIVE STRIPS, 20 HOOKS, 24 STRIPS Pack of 20 40 $14.00 $560.00 MMM17001MPES $22.48 $899.20 MMM17001MPES/ Medium utility hook, white $18.38 $735.20 SSL # 1571928, Command, Mfg # 17001MPES, Pack of 20 $20.92 $836.80 MMM17001MPES $13.16 $526.40 2070277, Command Medium Utility Hooks Mega Pack, 3 lb., White, 20/Pack (17001-MPES)

36 PAPER CARDSTOCK 8.5X11 LUNAR BLUE 65 LB 250 SHEETS Pack of 250 120 $17.68 $2,121.60 WAU22721 $16.36 $1,963.20 WAU22521 $13.80 $1,656.00 SSL # 1280642, Astrobrights, Mfg # 22721, Pack of 250 $23.05 $2,766.00 ODFN925292 $10.28 $1,233.60 477581, Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Lunar Blue, 250/Pack (22721)

37 PAPER CARDSTOCK 8.5X11 SOLAR YELLOW 65 LB 250 SHEETS Pack of 250 120 $18.33 $2,199.60 WAU22731 $16.36 $1,963.20 WAU22531 $13.80 $1,656.00 SSL # 1280355, Astrobrights, Mfg # 22731, Pack of 250 $18.55 $2,226.00 WAU22731 $10.28 $1,233.60 477580, Astrodesigns 65 lb. Cardstock Paper, 8.5" x 11", Solar Yellow, 250 Sheets/Pack 
(22731)

38 PAPER CARDSTOCK 8.5X11 TERRA GREEN 65 LB 250 SHEETS Pack fo 250 120 $18.33 $2,199.60 WAU22781 $16.36 $1,963.20 WAU22581 $13.80 $1,656.00 SSL # 1284413, Astrobrights, Mfg # 22781, Pack of 250 $19.50 $2,340.00 WAU22781 $10.28 $1,233.60 404620, Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Terra Green, 250/Pack (22781)

39 PAPER CARDSTOCK 8.5X11 COSMIC ORANGE 65 LB 250 SHEETS Pack fo 250 120 $15.69 $1,882.80 WAU22581 $13.07 $1,568.40 WAU22651 $13.80 $1,656.00 SSL # 1301583, Astrobrights, Mfg # 22851, Pack of 250 $19.50 $2,340.00 WAU22851 $10.28 $1,233.60 495481, Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Cosmic Orange, 250/Pack (22851)

40 POST-IT NOTE SUPER STICKY 3 X 3 PACK OF 24 Pack of 24 150 $26.44 $3,966.00 MMM654R24SSNRPCP $32.18 $4,827.00 MMM65424SSCP $25.73 $3,859.50 SSL # 1327794, Post-it, Mfg # 654-24SSCP, Pack of 24 $25.98 $3,897.00 MMM65424SSAUCP $17.98 $2,697.00 2095545, Post-it Super Sticky Notes, 3" x 3", Supernova Neons Collection, 70 Sheet/Pad, 24 
Pads/Pack (654-24SSMIA-CP)

41 WALL CLOCK 10 INCH, WHITE DIAL/BLACK FRAME Each 10 $10.99 $109.90  OFD706685QuoƟng a 14" clock $16.57 $165.70 LLR60987 $10.61 $106.10 SSL # 1543108, School Smart, Mfg # 1543108, Each $53.79 $537.90 ILC67700002 $5.58 $55.80 687525, Staples Wall Clock, Plastic, 10" Diameter (32436)

42 HANGING, WALL FILE LETTER SIZE, BLACK, PACK OF 3 Pack of 3 50 $9.14 $457.00 UNV08121 $19.37 $968.50 LLR60002 $14.81 $740.50 SSL # 1368945, Officemate, Mfg # 26092, Pack of 3 $18.03 $901.50 UNV08121 $9.00 $450.00 24380791, TRU RED™ Unbreakable 3-Pocket Plastic Letter Wall File, Black (TR55344)

43 CALCULATOR HAND HELD POCKET ASSORTED COLOR - 1 BATTERY INCLUDED Each 80 $3.80 $304.00  TEXTI503SVSingle Color $3.88 $310.40 TEXTI503SV $3.90 $312.00 SSL # 1596818, School Smart, Mfg # 1596818, Each $4.53 $362.40 BAZ3009 $3.77 $301.60 24382889, Charles Leonard Hand Held Calculator, Assorted Colors, Pack of 12 
(CHL39100ST)

44 DUCT TAPE 1.88 IN X 55 YD GRAY Each 150 $7.63 $1,144.50 DUC394468 $7.85 $1,177.50 MMM1160A $4.28 $642.00 SSL # 1403117, Duck Brand, Mfg # 394468, Each $9.23 $1,384.50 DUC1118393 $3.22 $483.00 468389, Staples General Purpose Duct Tape, 2"W x 60 yds., Silver (468389-CC)

45 MARKER PERMANENT BLACK, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 80 $7.01 $560.80 AVE08888 $3.73 $298.40 ITA30016 $3.84 $307.20 SSL # 1354255, School Smart, Mfg # 1354255, Pack of 12 $6.81 $544.80 UNV07071 $2.58 $206.40 910000, Staples DuraMark Permanent Markers, Fine Tip, Black, 12/Pack (20468-CC)

46 MARKER PERMANENT RED, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 50 $9.31 $465.50 AVE07887 $4.06 $203.00 ITA30018 $3.84 $192.00 SSL # 1400755, School Smart, Mfg # 1400755, Pack of 12 $7.70 $385.00 UNV07072 $2.98 $149.00 24617963, Staples Duramark Permanent Marker, Fine Tip, Red, Dozen (ST62951)

47 MOISTENERS FINGERTIP 1.0 OZ Each 50 $2.05 $102.50  LEE101341.75 oz $1.48 $74.00 LEE10050 $1.64 $82.00 SSL # 073158, Lee Products, Mfg # 10400, Each $2.75 $137.50 LEE10400 $3.48 $174.00 371965, Lee Sortkwik 1 oz. Fingertip Moistener, Pink (10400)

48 RUBBER BAND SIZE NO. 33 1/4LB-PACK Each 120 $2.63 $315.60 OFD855883 $4.68 $561.60 BSN15743 $0.94 $112.80 SSL # 020871, Alliance Rubber Company, Mfg # 06337, Each $7.11 $853.20 UNV00133 $1.01 $121.20 112680, Staples Economy #33 Rubber Bands, 175/Pack (28617-CC)

49 NOTEBOOK MEMO 3X5, SIDE OPEN, 100 SHEETS Each 400 $0.89 $356.00  MEA4553460 sheets $1.14 $456.00 RED31220 $0.91 $364.00 SSL # 085208, School Smart, Mfg # 085208, Each $7.99 $3,196.00 85208 $0.58 $232.00 199992, Staples® Memo Books, 3" x 5", College Ruled, Assorted Colors, 75 Sheets/Pad, 5 
Pads/Pack (TR11493)

50 VINYL TACKBOARD - 2 H X 3 W FT Each 70 $17.39 $1,217.30 OFD836638 $112.40 $7,868.00 GHEATR23BK/ Black rubber tackboard $151.11 $10,577.70 SSL # 1362427, MooreCo, Mfg # 311AB-XX, Each $19.99 $1,399.30 ODFN181935 $83.88 $5,871.60 24484697, HON Mod Fabric Tackboard, 1.5' x 4' (HLPLTACK48.WM01)

51 RULER WOOD BRASS EDGE 12 IN Each 50 $0.39 $19.50 OFD692165 $0.45 $22.50 ACM10702 $0.19 $9.50 SSL # 015348, School Smart, Mfg # 015348, Each $3.06 $153.00 ACM05221 $0.59 $29.50 2773009, Staples 12" Wooden Imperial/Metric Ruler (51891)

52 LAPTOP CADDY METAL WORKSTATIONS Each 25 $245.66 $6,141.50  MLN950ANTSafco Brand $245.00 $6,125.00 MLN950ANT/ Steel frame and split top that tilts for 
ergonomic use. Rectangle Top - Adjustable Height - 27" 

$448.46 $11,211.50 SSL # 677897, MooreCo, Mfg # 89759, Each $217.88 $5,447.00 MLN950ANT $79.08 $1,977.00 24288089, Mount-It! Rolling Adjustable Laptop Tray and Projector Cart (MI-7945)

53 BATTERY - ALKALINE - AAA - DURACELL OR EQUIVALENT - 24 PACK Pack fo 24 200 $14.15 $2,830.00  EVEEN92Energizer Industrial $16.21 $3,242.00 EVEEN92 $4.91 $982.00 SSL # 1583439, School Smart, Mfg # 1583439, Pack of 24 $34.00 $6,800.00 DURMN2400B24Z $7.78 $1,556.00 479074, Procell Constant AAA Alkaline Battery, 24/Pack (PC2400/PC2400BK)

54 BATTERY - ALKALINE - AA - DURACELL OR EQUIVALENT - 24 PACK Pack fo 24 250 $13.53 $3,382.50  EVEEN91Energizer Industrial $17.13 $4,282.50 EVEEN91 $5.21 $1,302.50 SSL # 084985, School Smart, Mfg # 084985, Pack of 24 $24.43 $6,107.50 ODFN458914 $7.50 $1,875.00 479067, Procell Constant AA Alkaline Battery, 24/Pack (PC1500BKD01)

55 BATTERY - LITHIUM - 3 VOLT - DURACELL OR EQUIVALENT - 2 PACK Pack fo 24 150 $13.29 $1,993.50  DURDL123AB2BPKQuoƟng a 2/pk $93.72 $14,058.00 DURDL2032B2CT $0.56 $84.00 SSL # 1583436, School Smart, Mfg # 1583436, Pack of 2 $168.79 $25,318.50 DURDL123AB2BPK   
DESCRIPTION ASKS 24PCK

$27.20 $4,080.00 24554839, Duracell CR 2032 3V Lithium-Ion Battery, 6/Pack (DURDL2032B6PK)

56 TRIMMER PAPER SQUARE WOOD, 15 IN Pack of 2 50 $87.10 $4,355.00  EPI26615QuoƟng by the each. $158.93 $7,946.50 EPI26615 $81.09 $4,054.50 SSL # 1594988, Westcott, Mfg # 16874-001, Each $366.18 $18,309.00 EPI26615 $89.28 $4,464.00 108225, X-ACTO 15" Guillotine Trimmer, Maple/Black (26315)

57 BADGE HOLDER WITH CLIP 4X3IN - PACK OF 50 Pack of 50 300 $14.89 $4,467.00 UNV56006 $13.81 $4,143.00 AVT75456 $30.30 $9,090.00 SSL # 1402411, SICURIX, Mfg # 67840, Pack of 50 $21.52 $6,456.00 AVT75457 $11.18 $3,354.00 163326, Advantus ID Badge Holder - Horizontal with Clip, 4" x 3" Insert Size, 50/Pack 
(75456)

58 HORIZONTAL SEALABLE ZIP CLOSURE BADGE HOLDER, 3-3/4 x 2-5/8 INCHES, PACK OF 50 Pack of 50 300 $17.59 $5,277.00 BAU67830 $37.18 $11,154.00 BAU47830 $31.07 $9,321.00 SSL # 1403330, SICURIX, Mfg # 47830, Pack of 50 $75.02 $22,506.00 1403330 $16.66 $4,998.00 890380, Advantus ID Badge Holders, Clear, 50/Pack (75523)

59 MAGAZINE RACK, BLACK, 10 POCKET Pack of 10 15 $131.92 $1,978.80  SAF5579BLQuoƟng by the each. $145.60 $2,184.00 SAF5579BL $138.67 $2,080.05 SSL # 1125401, Safco, Mfg # 5579BL, Pack of 10 $127.99 $1,919.85 SAF5579BL $886.40 $13,296.00 733250, Safco Onyx 10-Pocket Steel Letter Size Wall File, Black (5579BL)

60 TAPE HOOK + LOOP, BLACK, 3/4 X 15 FT ROLL Each 120 $13.10 $1,572.00 VEK90081 $17.99 $2,158.80 VEK90081 $17.06 $2,047.20 SSL # 079074, VELCRO Brand, Mfg # 90081, Each $17.50 $2,100.00 VEK90081 $9.08 $1,089.60 613240, Velcro® Brand 3/4" x 15' Sticky Back Hook & Loop Fastener Roll, Black (90081)

61 BINDER 1 IN WHITE Each 50 $1.60 $80.00 OFD208819 $2.12 $106.00 BSN09953 $3.30 $165.00 SSL # 086388, School Smart, Mfg # 2006482, Each $3.23 $161.50 AVE05711 $2.34 $117.00 374815, Staples 1" 3-Ring View Binder, White (ST23735-CC)

62 STAPLE REMOVER Each 45 $0.44 $19.80 OFD427111 $0.45 $20.25 BSN65650 $0.44 $19.80 SSL # 2133015, School Smart, Mfg # 2133015, Each $22.34 $1,005.30 UNV00700 $0.48 $21.60 24418179, TRU RED™ Claw Staple Remover, Black, 3/Pack (TR58087)

63 STAPLES STANDARD 210/STRIP, PACK OF 5000 Pack of 5000 50 $0.42 $21.00 OFD749601 $0.94 $47.00 BSN65649 $0.62 $31.00 SSL# 2133001, School Smart, Mfg # 2133001, Pack of 5000 $1.61 $80.50 ODFN344279 $1.22 $61.00 514170, Swingline Standard Staples, 1/4" Length, 210 Per Strip, 5,000/Box, 3 Boxes 
(S7035104)

64 CLIP BINDER, MED 1-1/4 IN BLACK, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 80 $1.08 $86.40  OFD561339QuoƟng a 24/pk $0.79 $63.20 BSN36551 $0.45 $36.00 SSL# 2132999, School Smart, Mfg # 2132999, Pack of 12 $3.01 $240.80 OIC99050 $0.75 $60.00 103549, Staples Medium Binder Clips, 0.63" Capacity, Black, 12 Clips/Pack (15351)

65 CLIP BINDER, MINI 9/16 IN BLACK, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 80 $0.44 $35.20  OFD400866QuoƟng a 60/pk $0.27 $21.60 BSN65364 $0.16 $12.80 SSL # 2133014, School Smart, Mfg # 2133014, Pack of 12 $0.80 $64.00 UNV10199 $0.24 $19.20 566942, Staples Mini Binder Clips, 0.25" Capacity, Black, 144 Clips/Pack (ST15338/15338)

66 CLIP BINDER, SMALL 3/4 IN, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 80 $0.48 $38.40  OFD560394QuoƟng a 36/pk $0.35 $28.00 BSN36550 $0.19 $15.20 SSL # 2133007, School Smart, Mfg # 2133007, Pack of 12 $12.98 $1,038.40 ODFN825182 $0.32 $25.60 480114, Staples Small Binder Clips, 0.38" Capacity, Black, 144 Clips/Pack (ST32002/32002)

67 LAPTOP STAND ADJUSTABLE, BLACK Each 30 $19.34 $580.20 ASP32147 $45.49 $1,364.70 ASP30498 $258.71 $7,761.30 SSL # 1592040, Safco, Mfg # 2180BL, Each $47.92 $1,437.60 ASP30498 $33.48 $1,004.40 513381, 3M Adjustable Laptop Stand, Black, 2 in. of Height Adjustment, Compatible with 
Docking Stations (LX500)

68 MESH ZIPPER BAG 5X9 IN, PACK OF 10 Pack of 10 100 $21.10 $2,110.00  LEO73656PACK of 6ea $6.83 $683.00 SPR02867/ Clear zippered bag, 6" x 11", sold as a pack of 
2

$6.91 $691.00 SSL # 2018756, Sax, Mfg # 2018756, Pack of 10 $41.60 $4,160.00 2018756 $12.10 $1,210.00 24538838, Bazic Bright Color 3-Ring Pencil Pouch W/ Mesh Window, 7"X10", Assorted 
Colors

69 BINDER POUCH W/ZIPPER 10X7.5 IN ASSORTED COLOR, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 100 $3.44 $344.00  OXF68500QuoƟng and Sells by the each $2.14 $214.00 BSN18303 $7.82 $782.00 SSL # 081946, School Smart, Mfg # 081946, Pack of 12 $54.59 $5,459.00 81946 $8.16 $816.00 862437, Staples Poly Zipper Pouch, 3-Hole Punched, Clear (ST26190-CC)

70 LANYARD BLUE- 20 INCH, PACK OF 12 Pack of 12 250 $1.45 $362.50  BAU68903QuoƟng and Sells by the each $0.76 $190.00 BAU68903 $3.89 $972.50 SSL # 004705, Sportime, Mfg # 121772, Pack of 12 $11.17 $2,792.50 4705 $4.28 $1,070.00 810387, Staples Lanyards with Swivel Clip, Black, 36" Length, Nylon, Black, 12/Pack (37863)

71 MOUSE PAD, BLACK, ECONOMY Each 45 $1.36 $61.20 IVR52448 $1.22 $54.90 CCS23617 $2.75 $123.75 SSL # 1116813, Compucessory, Mfg # CCS23617, Each $4.19 $188.55 FEL58024 $0.92 $41.40 382955, Staples TECH Non-Skid Mouse Pad, Black (382955-CC)

72 COMPUTER CLEANER DUST OFF, 10 OZ Each 40 $11.99 $479.60 FALDPSXL $7.09 $283.60 BSN24305 $11.19 $447.60 SSL # 1498370, Dust-Off, Mfg # DPSXL, Each $10.43 $417.20 FALDPSXL $4.10 $164.00 712332, Staples®  Electronics Air Duster, 10 oz., 2/Pack (SPL10ENFR-2)

73 LAMINATOR, 12IN Each 35 $115.49 $4,042.15 FEL5736601 $75.63 $2,647.05 SWI1701867 $69.65 $2,437.75 SSL # 2049682, School Smart, Mfg # 2049682, Each $185.48 $6,491.80 FEL5736601 $32.48 $1,136.80 24588925, Staples® Thermal & Cold Laminator, 13" Width, White/Gray (OL312S)

74 PAPER PRINTING 8.5X14 IN, 500 SHTS Each 200 $7.25 $1,450.00 WMTWC814RM $13.99 $2,798.00 HAM103291 $16.49 $3,298.00 SSL # 1080626, Hammermill, Mfg # HAM105015, Ream $12.92 $2,584.00 HAM105015 $8.09 $1,618.00 127035, Staples Copy Paper, 8.5" x 14", 20 lbs., White, 500 Sheets/Ream (127035/08635-0)

76 POWER STRIP 6 STANDARD OUTLETS, 8 FOOT CORD Each 20 $16.16 $323.20  TRPTLP6066FT Cord $11.29 $225.80 CCS55155 $29.07 $581.40 SSL # 1498237, Copernicus, Mfg # 255153, Each $22.13 $442.60 BLKBE10600008R $11.73 $234.60 24373162, NXT Technologies™ 6-Outlet Surge Protector, 8' Cord, 900 Joules (NX54314)

77 TRIMMER PAPER GUILLOTINE, 12 IN Each 25 $26.98 $674.50 SWI9312 $58.92 $1,473.00 SWI9312 $29.30 $732.50 SSL # 1570425, Westcott, Mfg # 16559, Each $40.66 $1,016.50 ACM16559 $25.28 $632.00 818674, X-ACTO 12" Guillotine Trimmer, Black (26232)

79 FLASHLIGHT 3V Each 50 $3.99 $199.50 EVE2661305 $3.88 $194.00 RAYROVLC1L2D1 $2.92 $146.00 SSL # 060-0600, Dorcy, Mfg # 41-0360, Each $5.63 $281.50 060-0600 $37.61 $1,880.50 1012529, Streamlight® ProPolymer® LED Flashlight, Yellow

80 PUSH PIN CLEAR 3/8 IN L PACK OF 100 Pack of 100 70 $1.49 $104.30  OFD825265QuoƟng a 200/pk $1.01 $70.70 BSN81002 $0.56 $39.20 SSL # 003354, School Smart, Mfg # 003354, Pack of 100 $6.78 $474.60 UBR3087U0624 $0.50 $35.00 480117, Staples Push Pins, Clear, 500/Pack (32014)

81 SURGE PROTECTOR 6 OUTLET 6 FT CORD WHITE TRPTLP606 Each 20 $16.16 $323.20 TRPTLP606 $22.49 $449.80 TRPTLP606 $18.59 $371.80 SSL # 2136069, light grey, Tripp Lite, Mfg # 656271, Each $20.84 $416.80 TRPTLP606 $15.27 $305.40 2453328, Tripp Lite 6 Outlet Surge Suppressor, 6' Cord, 790 Joules (TLP606B)

82 CANON COLOR IMAGECLASS MF753CDW PRINTER Each 100 $649.99 $64,999.00 CNM5455C010 $698.94 $69,894.00 CNM5455C010 $735.71 $73,571.00 SSL # 1602910, Brother, Mfg # BRTHLL8260CDW, Each $649.00 $64,900.00 5455C010 $0.00 No Bid

83 CANON COLOR IMAGECLASS MF751CDW PRINTER Each 100 $599.99 $59,999.00 CNM5455C015 $574.00 $57,400.00 CNM5455C015 $735.71 $73,571.00 SSL # 1602912, Brother, Mfg # BRTHLL8360CDW, Each $602.00 $60,200.00 5455C015 $0.00 No Bid

84 YELLOW TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $111.35 $8,351.25 CNM5091C001 $167.99 $12,599.25 CNMCRTDG069HYW/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026705, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055Y, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5091c001 $99.94 $7,495.50 24559252, Canon 069 Yellow Standard Yield Toner Cartridge, Print Up to 1,900 Pages 
(5091C001)

85 MAGENTA TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $111.35 $8,351.25 CNM5092C001 $239.89 $17,991.75 CNMCRTDG069HMA/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026713, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055M, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5092c001 $99.94 $7,495.50 24559249, Canon 069 Magenta Standard Yield Toner Cartridge, Print Up to 1,900 Pages 
(5092C001)

86 CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $124.87 $9,365.25 CNM5093C001 $239.89 $17,991.75 CNMCRTDG069HCYN/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026657, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055C, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5093c001 $99.94 $7,495.50 24559250, Canon 069 Cyan Standard Yield Toner Cartridge, Print Up to 1,900 Pages 
(5093C001)

87 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 50 $94.07 $4,703.50 CNM5094C001 $197.68 $9,884.00 CNMCRTDG069BK/ Quoting high yield cartridges $98.91 $4,945.50 SSL # 2008901, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG051, Each $102.00 $5,100.00 5094c001 $85.24 $4,262.00 24559257, Canon 069 Black Standard Yield Toner Cartridge, Print Up to 2,100 Pages 
(5094C001)

88 HY YELLOW TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $225.99 $16,949.25 CNMCRTDG069HYW $239.89 $17,991.75 CNMCRTDG069HYW/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026705, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055Y, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5092c001 $191.54 $14,365.50 24559256, Canon 069 H Yellow High Yield Toner Cartridge (5095C001)

89 HY MAGENTA TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $225.99 $16,949.25 CNMCRTDG069HMA $239.89 $17,991.75 CNMCRTDG069HMA/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026713, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055M, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5091c001 $191.54 $14,365.50 24559253, Canon 069 H Magenta High Yield Toner Cartridge (5096C001)

90 HY CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 75 $225.99 $16,949.25 CNMCRTG069HCYN $239.89 $17,991.75 CNMCRTDG069HCYN/ Quoting high yield cartridges $148.70 $11,152.50 SSL # 2026657, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG055C, Each $121.00 $9,075.00 5093c001 $191.54 $14,365.50 24560887, Canon 069 H Cyan High Yield Toner Cartridge (5097C001)

91 HY BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE COMPATIBLE WITH CANON 069 Each 50 $183.64 $9,182.00 CNMCRTG069HBK $197.68 $9,884.00 CNMCRTDG069HBK/ Quoting high yield cartridges $98.91 $4,945.50 SSL # 2008901, Canon, Mfg # CNMCRTDG051, Each $102.00 $5,100.00 5094c001 $156.72 $7,836.00 24561335, Canon 069 H Black High Yield Toner Cartridge (5098C001)

92 MULTI-DEVICE SLIM WIRELESS KEYBOARD, BLUETOOTH/RECEIVER LOGITECH K585 OR 
EQUIVALENT

Each 50 $25.71 $1,285.50 LOG920007119 $43.51 $2,175.50 LOGK585 $83.16 $4,158.00 SSL # 2135241, Logitech, Mfg # YP4314, Each $58.66 $2,933.00 920-011479 $45.66 $2,283.00 24555561, Logitech K585 Slim Multi-Device Wireless Keyboard, Graphite (920-011479)
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93 WIRED KEYBOARD, PLUG AND PLAY, FULL-SIZE LOGITECH K120 OR EQUIVALENT Each 50 $10.65 $532.50 LOG920002478 $13.20 $660.00 LOG920002478 $17.25 $862.50 SSL # 2135306, Logitech, Mfg # DA4535, Each $14.99 $749.50 920-002478 $9.58 $479.00 869101, Logitech K120 USB Keyboard, Black (920-002478)

94 MULTI-DEVICE WIRELESS MOUSE, BLUETOOTH, USB UNIFYING RECEIVER, 1000 DPI, 6 
PROGRAMMABLE BUTTONS LOGITECH M720 OR EQUIVALENT

Each 50 $33.89 $1,694.50   LOG910004790 $47.89 $2,394.50 LOG910004790 $47.51 $2,375.50 SSL # 2135237, Logitech, Mfg # 4T7943, Each $12.73 $636.50 910-004790 $30.13 $1,506.50 2392528, Logitech M720 Triathlon Wireless Ergonomic Optical Mouse, Black (910-004790)

95 CORDED MOUSE, WIRED USB MOUSE LOGITECH B100 OR EQUIVALENT Each 50 $6.95 $347.50 LOG910001439 $7.69 $384.50 VER70733 $6.83 $341.50 SSL # 2136008, Verbatim, Mfg # 9U6166, Each $10.39 $519.50 910-001439 $6.48 $324.00 911687, Logitech B100 Ambidextrous Optical USB Mouse, Black (910-001439)

96 SILENT KEYBOARD AND MOUSE DELL KM555 OR EQUIVALENT Each 50 $73.32 $3,666.00 DELLKM555 $36.00 $1,800.00 VER99779/ Verbatim brand. $34.93 $1,746.50 SSL # 2136061, Verbatim, Mfg # 9U9419, Each $60.79 $3,039.50 KM555-BLK-US $28.24 $1,412.00 24562847, Logitech MK295 Silent Wireless Keyboard and Optical Mouse Combo, Graphite 
(920-009782)

97 PERFORMANCE WIRELESS KEYBOARD AND MOUSE COMBO LOGITECH MK850 OR 
EQUIVALENT 

Each 50 $79.53 $3,976.50 LOG920008219 $107.79 $5,389.50 LOG920008219 $107.04 $5,352.00 SSL # 2135301, Logitech, Mfg # 4U0328, Each $117.56 $5,878.00 920-008219 $67.98 $3,399.00 2676142, Logitech MK850 Performance Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo, Black (920-
008219)

98 CAT 6 RJ45 ETHERNET CABLE 10 FT Each 50 $6.34 $317.00 TRPN201010BL $7.49 $374.50 BLKA3L98010BLUS $29.88 $1,494.00 SSL # 2136122, 25 foot, Tripp Lite, Mfg # GA5108, Each $5.30 $265.00 N6PATCH10BL $4.98 $249.00 2418277, C2G 4241 10' RJ-45 Male/Male Cat6 Non-Booted Unshielded Ethernet Network 
Patch Cable, White

99 ADDRESS LABELS, RECTANGLE, 1" X 2-5/8", MATTE WHITE, PACK OF 750 Each 5 $2.69 $13.45 OFD612221 $2.51 $12.55 BSN26109 $11.14 $55.70 SSL # 067678, Avery, Mfg # 8160, Pack of 750 $12.90 $64.50 AVE5260 $7.49 $37.45 415489, Avery Easy Peel Inkjet Address Labels, 1" x 2-5/8", White, 750 Labels/Pack (8160)

100 ADDRESS LABELS, 3 1/2" X 1 1/2", WHITE, PACK OF 400 Each 5 $36.26 $181.30  AVE05223QuoƟng 2 x 4 500/pk $7.29 $36.45 BSN26120 $38.10 $190.50 SSL # 1597358, 3 1/2 x 5, Avery, Mfg # 5168, Pack of 400 $16.24 $81.20 BRTDK1201 $9.12 $45.60 569102, Brother DK-1201 Standard Address Paper Labels, 3-1/2" x 1-1/10", Black on White, 
400 Labels/Roll (DK-1201)

101 DOUBLE-SIDED TAPE, 1/2" X 500", CLEAR, PACK OF 6 ROLLS Each 5 $18.99 $94.95 MMM6137H2PCMP $2.06 $10.30 MMM136 $5.01 $25.05 SSL # 090021, 1/2"x250", pk/3, Scotch, Mfg # 3136, Pack of 3 $10.45 $52.25 NOTM211947 $2.20 $11.00 24611575, Scotch Permanent Double Sided Tape With Dispensers, 0.5" x 13.9 yds., Clear, 
6/Pack (6137H-2PC-MP)

102 CONCEALED BLADE LETTER OPENER Each 5 $0.28 $1.40 OFD800332 $0.53 $2.65 BSN11818 $0.73 $3.65 SSL # 1333010, Sparco, Mfg # BSN11818, Each $4.20 $21.00 UNV31803 $1.41 $7.05 587390, Officemate .75" Handle Letter Opener, Blue (OIC30310)

103 9" STAINLESS STEEL LETTER OPENER Each 5 $0.75 $3.75 OFD313692 $0.77 $3.85 BSN32376 $1.00 $5.00 SSL # 1376773, Business Source, Mfg # BSN32376, Each $2.08 $10.40 UNV31750 $0.41 $2.05 458232, Staples 9" Handle Letter Opener, Chrome (ST10618-CC)

104 INSTANT HAND SANITIZER PUMP, 8 OZ Each 325 $4.90 $1,592.50  GOJ365912EA12 OZ pump boƩle $6.58 $2,138.50 GOJ365912 $5.79 $1,881.75 SSL # 1383328, 12oz, Purell, Mfg # GOJ365912, Each $7.16 $2,327.00 GOJ365912EA $3.84 $1,248.00 24388638, Perk 70% Alcohol Gel Hand Sanitizer, 8 oz. (PK55489)

105  DISINFECTING WIPES, 7" X 8", 80 WIPES PER CANISTER, CASE OF 3 CANISTERS Each 325 $15.30 $4,972.50 RAC84251PK $23.90 $7,767.50 RAC84251 $23.15 $7,523.75 SSL # 2027187, Lysol, Mfg # RAC84251, Pack of 3 $19.23 $6,249.75 RAC84251PK $3.49 $1,134.25 24411134, Perk™ Disinfecting Wipes, Lemon, 75 Wipes/Pack (PK56665)

106 FACIAL TISSUE CUBE FOR BUSINESS, ONE BUNDLE OF 6 BOXES Each 50 $2.21 $110.50  KCC21270BXQuoƟng and sells by the bx. $10.67 $533.50 KCC21271 $20.24 $1,012.00 SSL # 1480472, Kleenex, Mfg # KCC21271, Case of 6 $17.32 $866.00 KCC21271 $1.05 $52.50 24405546, Perk™ Ultra Soft Tissue, 2-Ply, 95 Sheets/Box, 6 Boxes/Pack (PK57779)

107 POP UP NOTES DISPENSER, 3 IN X 3 IN, 1 DISPENSER, 1 PAD, 50 SHEETS/PAD Each 5 $7.06 $35.30 MMMDS330BK $9.18 $45.90 MMMDS330BK $9.66 $48.30 SSL # 1593218, 45 sheets/pad, Post-it, Mfg # STL-330-B, Each $15.80 $79.00 MMMDS330BK $7.68 $38.40 458419, Post-it Pop-up Notes Dispenser for 3" x 3" Notes, Black/Clear (DS330-BK)

108 SUPER STICKY POP UP NOTES, 18 PADS, 3 IN X 3 IN Each 5 $25.31 $126.55 MMMR33018CP $31.93 $159.65 MMMR33018SSMIAC/ Supernova Neons Color $25.35 $126.75 SSL # 1571906, floral fantasy, Post-it, Mfg # R330-18AUCP, Pack of 
18

$31.97 $159.85 MMMR33018SSAUCP $1.14 $5.70 24597229, Post-it Pop-up Super Sticky Notes, 3" x 3", Supernova Neons Collection, 90 
Sheets/Pad, 18 Pads/Pack (R330-18SSMIACP)

109 SHIPPING LABEL PRINTER BLUETOOTH - THERMAL SHIPPING LABEL PRINTER 4X6 Each 3 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $258.99 $776.97 BRTQL1100 $144.98 $434.94 SSL # 1573352, Brother, Mfg # BRTQL800, Each $259.99 $779.97  QL-1100c $156.98 $470.94 24499874, Dymo LabelWriter 5XL Portable Label Printer (2112554)

110 SHIPPING LABEL PRINTER PAPER - THERMAL LABELS FOR 4X6 SHIPPING LABEL PRINTER,  
EASY TO PEEL BACKING PAPER, 500 LABELS/ROLL, 2 ROLL

Each 5 $48.23 $241.15 AVE4131 $104.99 $524.95 AVE4157 $41.61 $208.05 SSL # 1118464, each, roll/200, Brother, Mfg # BRTDK1241, Pack of 
200

$95.63 $478.15 UNV598342 $42.39 $211.95 807177, DYMO LabelWriter 1744907 Extra Large Shipping Labels, 4" x 6", Black on White, 
220 Labels/Roll (1744907)

111 PAPER PRINTING 8.5X11 IN XER3R11760 500 SHTS Each 400 $14.07 $5,628.00 OFD544016 $19.64 $7,856.00 XER3R11760 $18.76 $7,504.00 SSL # 1315398, Xerox, Mfg # XER3R11760, Ream $9.71 $3,884.00 HAM105031 $12.44 $4,976.00 635560, Xerox Bold Digital Bond Paper, 28 lbs., 8.5" x 11", 100 Brightness, 500 Sheets/Ream 
(3R11760)

112 WIRELESS BLUETOOTH NOISE CANCELLING HEADPHONES BEATS STUDIO PRO OR 
EQUVALENT

Each 50 $48.06 $2,403.00 MHSHP9350B $125.00 $6,250.00 96066/Ekosphear ANC Headphones - Includes Idea Public 
Schools Full Color Imprint or Etched Plates

$48.13 $2,406.50 SSL # 1596023, iLive, Mfg # IAHN40B, Each $389.99 $19,499.50  MQTP3LL/A $264.98 $13,249.00 24571515, Beats Studio Pro Wireless Active Noise Canceling Bluetooth Surround Sound 
Over-the-Ear Headset, Sandstone (MQTR3LL/A)

113 ADHESIVE NAME BADGES, 2-1/3 x 3-3/8 INCHES, WHITE, PACK OF 400 Each 5 $3.93 $19.65 OFD108549 $56.78 $283.90 AVE5395 $51.03 $255.15 SSL # 067672, Avery, Mfg # 5395, Pack of 400 $44.84 $224.20 ODFN108549 $19.48 $97.40 465914, Avery Flexible Laser/Inkjet Name Badge Labels, 2 1/3" x 3 3/8", White, 400 Labels 
Per Pack (5395)

114 SPIRAL COIL WRIST KEYCHAINS  (ASSORTED COLORS) 50 pk 650 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $4.79 $3,113.50 SPR02884 $0.88 $572.00 SSL # 1428727, The Pencil Grip, Mfg # TPG-260, Each $45.44 $29,536.00 UNV56051 $0.00

115 SWIVEL SNAP HOOKS WITH KEY RINGS, 1.25INCHES/32MM 100 pk 325 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $7.99 $2,596.75  SSP-US-02 $5.29 $1,719.25 SSL # 2049964, Carl Mfg, Mfg # CUI81020, Pack of 20 $25.99 $8,446.75 SSP-US-50x2 $0.00

116  WHITE BLANK MAILING LABELS, 2 1/3" X 3 3/8", 8 LABELS PER SHEET, 25 SHEETS 200 labels 325 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $11.47 $3,727.75 BSN26144 $51.03 $16,584.75 SSL # 067672, Avery, Mfg # 5395, Pack of 400 $13.77 $4,475.25 AVE5261 $0.00

117 TRADING CARD SLEEVE PAGES, 100 PACK 9 POCKET, TO FIT 3 RING BINDER 100 pk 260 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $78.69 $20,459.40 AVE76016/Quoted as a carton  of 240 sheets $4.52 $1,175.20 SSL # 2150088, Samsill, Mfg # 41217, Pack of 50 $25.99 $6,757.40 CA100 $0.00

118 WIRE KEYCHAIN CABLE LARGE, 5 INCH/10 INCH 100 pk 455 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $18.99 $8,640.45 WR443/Quoted as a 100 pack of 5 inch. 10 inch pack is 
$26.99

$2.92 $1,328.60 SSL # 036981, School Smart, Mfg # 036981, Pack of 50 $34.99 $15,920.45 Pawfly-UL283 $0.00

119

120

Total Cost $329,877.91 $451,016.95 $398,965.23 $490,376.27 $191,263.88

Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive

112/118 items 95% 118/118 items 100% 118/118 items 100% 117/118 items 99% 105/118 items 89%

Responsive and Responsible


