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1 Paper Dispenser 
Automatic Paper Towel 

Dispenser 

Automatic (motion), battery powered, 

large roll  capacity (350 length), Black 

colored, Approx. Dimensions 

16x13x10

30 $150.83 $4,524.90 San Jamar T8300TBK $209.62 $6,288.60

SJMT8490TBK

San Jamar

Oceans Smart Essence 

Electronic Towel Dispenser, 

11.88 x 9.1 x 14.4, Black

$45.00 $1,350.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 SJM-T1390TBK $0.01 $0.30

6932745- Highmark® Roll 

Towel Electronic 

Dispenser, 16-5/8""H x 11-

1/2""W x 8-3/4""D, Dark 

Gray.

$0.01 with the use of the 

roll towels. Installation 

included.

$35.26 $1,057.80 $118.33 $3,549.90

GEORGIA PACIFIC 1 54338A 

54338A OPAQUE PUSH PADDLE 

TOWEL DISP,1 EA/EA,MANUAL 

NOT AUTOMATIC/ CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 1 

ALT T8400TBK T8400TBK BLK 

UNIV SENSOR ROLL TOWEL DISP,1 

EA/EA,

$94.78 $2,843.40 PALMER FIXTURE #TD024502 **MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 30 EA**
$101.48 $3,044.40 $73.00 $2,190.00

ELECTRONIC UNIVERSAL 

TOWEL DISPENSER BLACK 

PALMER TD023502/ PRICED 

BY EACH

2 Paper towel roll  
Paper Towel Rolls to fit the 

above 12/350

Must fit the above, at least 50% post 

consumer recycled, natural not 

bleached

150 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $56.57 $8,486.10

BWK16GREEN

Boardwalk 

Green Universal Roll Towels, 1-

Ply, 8"" x 800 ft, Natural, 6 

Rolls/Carton

Contains a minimum of 50% 

post-consumer recycled 

content, 100% total recycled 

content. Processed chlorine-

free, free of additives and 

contaminants that are 

reproductive toxins.

$41.73 $6,259.50 Changed to $43.73 $24.89 $3,733.50 BWK-6252 $27.20 $4,080.00

468815- Highmark® ECO 

Hardwound 1-Ply Paper 

Towels, 100% Recycled, 

Natural, 350' Per Roll, 

Case Of 12 Rolls

$33.44 $5,016.00

GEORGIA PACIFIC 2 26401 26401 

7-7/8"X350' NAT ROLL TOWEL,12 

EA/CS,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

12EA

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID $36.98 $5,547.00 $22.65 $3,397.50
KRAFT ROLL TOWEL 12/350 

MORCON R12350 PRICED BY 

CASE

3 Trash Can Trash can 32 Gallon, Blue

Plastic, heavy duty, impact resistance, 

rodent and water proof, Blue in color 

and fade resistant, 32 gallon in size 

that can use a trash dolly wheel 

system

120 $29.25 $3,510.00 Rubbermaid 

FG263200BLUE 
$67.98 $8,157.60

NFG263200BLUE

32G *BRUTE TRSH CONT HD 

USE BLUE

$57.00 $6,840.00 $46.09 $5,530.80 GJO-60464 $43.93 $5,271.60

5305763- Rubbermaid 

Commercial Brute Vented 

Recycling Container - 32 

gal Capacity - Round - 

27.3" Height x 22" Width 

x 22" Depth - Plastic, 

Stainless Steel - Blue - 6 

/ Carton

$28.59 $3,430.80 $21.49 $2,578.80

RUBBERMAID 3 FG263200BLUE 

2632 BRUTE 32GAL DARK BLU 

CONT,1 EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE 

BY QTY OF 6EA/ CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 3 

ALT 84103214 32 GAL BRONCO 

RND TRASH CAN BLUE,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE CASE QTY 

OF 4EA

$25.59 $3,070.80 RUBBERMAID #FG263200BLUE **MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 120 EA**
$73.30 $8,796.00 $22.50 $2,700.00

32 GAL ROUND TRASH CAN 

BLUE BRONCO 8410324 

PRICED BY EACH

5 Trash can 41 QT Rect W/B

Plastic, heavy duty, impact resistance, 

rodent and water proof, Grey or Black 

in color and fade resistant, 41 qtr. in 

size Rectangle in shape

25 $17.78 $444.50 Rubbermaid 

FG295700BLA 
$17.66 $441.50

BWK41QTWBBLA 

Boardwalk

Soft-Sided Wastebasket, 41 

qt, Plastic, Black

$15.00 $375.00 $8.94 $223.50 GJO-60464 $13.99 $349.75

6917985- Rubbermaid 

Commercial 41 QT Large 

Deskside Wastebaskets - 

10.25 gal Capacity - 

Rectangular - Dent 

Resistant, Durable, Rust 

Resistant, Easy to Clean - 

20" Height x 11.3" Width 

x 15.3" Depth - Plastic - 

Black - 12 / Carton

$12.48 $312.00 $8.28 $207.00 $8.28 $207.00

RUBBERMAID 5 FG295700BLA 2957 

41QT BLK TRASH CAN,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

12EA/ HOSPECO 5 ALT 7703-5 

7703-5 41QT BLK PINCH'M 

BASKET,12 EA/CS,MUST 

PURCHASE QTY OF 12EA/ 

HOSPECO 5 ALT 7703-3 7703-3 

41QT GRY PINCH'M BASKET,12 

EA/CS,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

12EA

$11.98 $299.50 RUBBERMAID #FG295700BLA **MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 25 EA**
$196.56 $4,914.00 $10.50 $262.50

41  QT. WASTE BASKET 

BLACK NEXSTEP 6815 

PRICED BY EACH

6 Dust Pan  BLACK PLASTIC LOBBY DST PAN 

Dust pan for Lobby, 36in height, 3-5 

qtr. capacity, black, hard plastic, l ight 

weight

200 $19.47 $3,894.00 Rubbermaid 

FG253100BLA 
$28.49 $5,698.00 $10.62 $2,124.00

BWK02600

Boardwalk

Lobby Dust Pan, 11.75 x 37, 

34"" Handle, Plastic/Aluminum, 

Black/ ADP00204EH

Abco

Black Dust Pan with Metal 

Handle in Black

30in Handle Length

$11.00 $2,200.00 $6.86 $1,372.00 GJO-85236 $21.91 $4,382.00 397151- Rubbermaid® 

Lobby Dustpan
$12.32 $2,464.00 $12.06 $2,412.00 $11.20 $2,240.00

ODELL 6 LDP1 LDPI12 12"LOBBY 

DUST PAN,1 EA/EA,MUST 

PURCHASE QTY OF 6EA/ 

THUNDERGROUP 6 ALT PLDP345 

13" LOBBY DUST PAN WITH 

WINDOWBREAK COVER,1 EA/EA,/ 

CFS BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN 

JAMAR 6 ALT 36141003 36141003 

12"BLK LOBBY DUSTPAN W/HNDL,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE CS QTY 

OF 6EA

$7.89 $1,578.00 ABCO #DP00204EH **12 EA/CS, FULL 

CASES ONLY**
$15.37 $3,074.00 $7.25 $1,450.00

BLACK LOBBY DUSTPAN 

WITH HANDLE DP- ABCO DP-

00204EH PRICED BY EACH

7 Cart 3 Shelf
Three tier util ity service Cart - 

41 x 20 x 38", Black

41 x 20 x 38", Black, durable plastic 

shelves, food safe, 450lb weight l imit 

Min. replaceable castors and brakes. 

l ightweight, dual handles, easy 

assembly

70 $134.59 $9,421.30 Winco UC-3019K $502.32 $35,162.40 $109.89 $7,692.30

FG409100BLA

Rubbermaid 

Xtra Black 300 lb. Three Shelf 

Utility Cart / Bus Cart 40"" x 

20"" x 37""Free shipping/ 

109CARTBLGBK

Choice Black Utility / Bussing 

Cart with Three Shelves - 

42"" x 20""

$170.00 $11,900.00 $86.05 $6,023.50 GJO-02335 (BLUE) $352.81 $24,696.70

430331- Rubbermaid® 3-

Shelf Utility Cart, 37 

3/4"H x 33 5/8"W x 18 

5/8"D, Black

$202.92 $14,204.40 $142.26 $9,958.20 $100.74 $7,051.80

RUBBERMAID 7 FG409100BLA 4091 

XTRA THREE SHELF BLK UTILITY 

CART,1 EA/EA,/ HOSPECO 7 ALT 

7006 CART BUSSING LARGE,1 

EA/EA,/ THUNDERGROUP 7 ALT 

PLBC3316B 33 1/2" X 16 1/8" X 

37" 3-TIER BUS CART, BLACK ,1 

EA/EA,

$249.98 $17,498.60 RUBBERMAID #FG409100BLA $183.00 $12,810.00 $213.00 $14,910.00
UTILITY CART 3 SHELVES 

BLACK 96995 PRICED BY 

EACH

8  Wet sign CAUTION WET FLOOR SIGN

Plastic, bright safety yellow, OSHA & 

HD compliant, durable, and fade 

resistant

150 $12.70 $1,905.00 Chef Supreme 

CHEFWETFLR 
$15.40 $2,310.00

IMP9152W

Impact

Bilingual Yellow Wet Floor 

Sign, 12.05 x 1.55 x 24.3

$7.00 $1,050.00 $8.27 $1,240.50 GJO-85117 $18.61 $2,791.50
5738366- Carlisle Wet 

Floor Sign, 24" x 8", 

Yellow

$6.26 $939.00 $10.31 $1,546.50 $8.27 $1,240.50

ODELL 8 B-132 WET FLOOR SIGN 

24",1 EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE QTY 

OF 6EA/ RUBBERMAID 8 ALT 

FG611277YEL 611277 26-1/2"YEL 

CAUTION WET FLOOR SIGN,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

6EA/ THUNDERGROUP 8 ALT 

PLWFC024 WET FLOOR CAUTION 

SIGN, YELLOW, 24" H X 12" W,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY CS OF 

10EA

$7.98 $1,197.00 ABCO #WS0001 **10 EA/CS, FULL CASES 

ONLY**
$10.31 $1,546.50 $7.10 $1,065.00

PLASTIC YELLOW CAUTION 

WET FLOOR SIGN ABCO WS-

0001 PRICE BY EACH

9 Smartmop
MD400 SMARTMOP MICROMOP 

7.0 GRN/WHITE 5/PK

Replaceable mop heads for table 

cleaning system, must work with the 

above system

1000 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $20.88 $20,880.00

UMD400

Unger

SmartColor MicroMop 7.0, 

16"", Green/White

Price per unit, not per pack or 

case. Must be ordered by 

increments of 5 units

$57.00 $57,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $6.30 $6,300.00 $2.17 $2,170.00

RUBBERMAID 9 FGQ41000GR00 

Q410 18"BLU W/GRN TRIM 

MICROFIBER PAD,1 EA/EA,MUST 

PURCHASE BY QTY OF 12EA/ 

HOSPECO 9 ALT 2504-SPH-MFP-

16G SPHERGO 16"GRN 

MICROWORKS FLAT PAD,12 

EA/DZ,MUST PURCHASE BY QTY 

OF 12EA

$13.49 $13,490.00 UNGER #MD400 $20.77 $20,770.00 $87.00 $87,000.00
MICROFIBER PAD GRN/WHT 

UNGER MD400 PRICED BY 

CASE

10
 HANDI HANDLE 

5/CS

HH240 HENRY'S HANDI HANDLE 

5/CS

Extruded aluminum, nylon handle, 

l ightweight durability and ergonomic 

grip, locking cone with press fit, screw 

fit or snap fit. 24 inch long

100 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $22.73 $2,273.00

UHH240

Unger

Henry's Handi Handle, with 

ErgoTec Locking Cone, 2 ft, 

Green/Silver

Price per unit, not per pack or 

case. Must be ordered by 

increments of 5 units

$30.00 $3,000.00 Changed to $31.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $9.23 $923.00 $12.40 $1,240.00

RUBBERMAID 10 ALT 

FGQ74500YL00 Q745 YEL QUICK 

CONNECT EXTENSION HNDL,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

6EA/ HOSPECO 10 ALT POLE 2505-

SWPOLE SPHERGO SWIVEL 

ALUMINUM EXTENSION POLE, 1 

EA,1 EA/EA,MUST SELL BY QTY 

OF 12EA. USE WITH 2505-

SWBASE

$14.79 $1,479.00 UNGER #HH240 $18.97 $1,897.00 $79.50 $7,950.00
HENRY'S HANDI HANDLE 24" 

UNGER HH240 PRICED BY 

CASE

11 Mopholder
SM40G SMARTCOLOR 

MOPHOLDER 5/CS

Flat mop holder with pivoting, low-

profile head. Telescoping handle, 

color gray.  Diameter 16' handle 

length 96, Polypropylene 

150 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $64.76 $9,714.00

USM40G

Unger

EZ Flat Mop Holders, Plastic 

Head, 16"", Gray

Price per unit, not per pack or 

case. Must be ordered by 

increments of 5 units

$42.00 $6,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $61.70 $9,255.00
Rubbermaid Commercial 

Adaptable Flat Mop Kit - 

Black - 1 Each

$17.18 $2,577.00 $8.63 $1,294.50

RUBBERMAID 11 ALT 

FGQ56000YL00 Q560-00 18"QUICK 

CONNECT WET/DRY FRAME,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE CS QTY 

OF 6EA/ HOSPECO 11 ALT 2505-

SWBASE SPHERGO SWIVEL 

ALUMINUM BASE FOR 18-20" PAD, 

1 EA,1 EA/EA,MUST SELL BY QTY 

OF 12EA. USE WITH 2505-

SWPOLE.

$39.98 $5,997.00 UNGER #SM40G $62.34 $9,351.00 $261.50 $39,225.00
FLAT MOP HOLDER EZ 

FRAME UNGER SM40G 

PRICED BY CASE

12 Dolly DOLLY

Mobility and maneuverability of 

heavy loads.  Heavy-duty wheels 

w/swivel. Plastic, resists rust, 

chipping and denting. Hold up to 

350lb. color-black must fit the above 

trash cans. 

200 $46.80 $9,360.00 Rubbermaid 

FG264000BLA 
$60.83 $12,166.00

BWKDOLLY

Boardwalk

Refuse Container Utility Dolly, 

300 lb Capacity, 18.25"" 

Diameter, Gray

$43.00 $8,600.00 $29.98 $5,996.00 BWK-DOLLY $39.99 $7,998.00

6736595- Alpine 

Industries Twist-Lock 

Trash Can Dolly With 

Swivel Wheels, 32 Gallon, 

Black

$34.92 $6,984.00 $32.57 $6,514.00

RUBBERMAID 12 FG264000BLA 

2640 BRUTE BLK CONT DOLLY,1 

EA/EA,MUST BUY BY CS OF 

2EA/CFS BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN 

JAMAR 12 ALT 3691103 3691103 

BRONCO DOLLIE F/TRASH CAN,1 

EA/EA,MUST BUY CASE QTY OF 

2EA 

$25.98 $5,196.00
ABCO #BS-DOLLY **6 EA/CS, FULL CASES 

ONLY…FITS RUBBERMAID, IMPACT & 

CARLISLE CANS**

$104.61 $20,922.00 $23.00 $4,600.00
DOLLY FOR 32, 44 & 55 GAL 

RND TRASH CAN ABCO BS-

DOLLY PRICED BY EACH

13 Lids Blue LID 

Available to fit 32, 44 gallon 

containers, Meets NSF 2.21/ USDA. Self-

draining, prevent water from pooling, 

reducing stil l  water buildup. never 

fade, warp, crack or crush

10 $16.65 $166.50

Rubbermaid 

FG263100BLUE  (Must 

be orderedi case packs 

of 6)

$33.83 $338.30

RCP263100BE

Rubbermaid 

BRUTE Self-Draining Flat Top 

Lids for 32 gal Round BRUTE 

Containers, 22.25"" Diameter, 

Blue

$23.50 $235.00 $21.86 $218.60 RCP-1788376 $25.19 $251.90

140839- Rubbermaid 32 

gal Single Stream Recy. 

Lid - Plastic - Blue - 1 

Each

$18.12 $181.20 $9.35 $93.50 $7.09 $70.90 $12.06 $120.60

RUBBERMAID 13 1779636 1779636 

44GAL BLU BRUTE LID,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY QTY 

OF 4EA/RUBBERMAID 13 ALT 

FG263100BLUE BRUTE® 32 Gal Lid 

Blue,1 EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE 

QTY OF 6EA/CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 13 

ALT 84103323 32 GAL RND TRASH 

CAN LID GRAY,1 EA/EA,MUST 

PURCHASE CASE QTY OF 4EA/CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 13 

ALT 84104523 44 GAL RND TRASH 

CAN LID GRAY,1 EA/EA,MUST 

PURCHASE CASE QTY OF 3EA

$10.98 $109.80 RUBBERMAID #FG263100BLUE **6 EA/CS, 

FULL CASES ONLY**
$30.02 $300.20 $11.50 $115.00

ROUND WASTE BIN LID NO 

HOLD BRONCO  84103314 

PRICED BY EACH

14  Tilt
DARK BLUE STANDARD DUTY 1/2 

CU YD TILT TRUCK

Standards duty plastic ti lt 1/2 Cu. Yd. 

Cap, 850, blue.  Two 9" roller rubber 

wheel, and Two 4' rubber swivel 

casters.  Push handle, trash bags 

hooks, and lift handle.

30 $939.65 $28,189.50 Rubbermaid 

FG130573BLUE 
$734.17 $22,025.10

NFG130400BLA

Rubbermaid

1304 Series 450 lb. 1/2 cu. 

yd. Plastic and Steel Tilt 

Truck in Black

$555.00 $16,650.00 $890.00 $26,700.00 RCP-131400BK (BLACK) $779.86 $23,395.80

1695421- Rubbermaid 

Commercial 850lb 

Capacity Utility Tilt Truck 

- 850 lb Capacity - 

33.50" Width x 72.20" 

Depth x 43.80" Height - 

Black - 1 Each

$527.33 $15,819.90
RUBBERMAID 14 FG130573BLUE 

1305-73 1/2YD3 BLU TILT TRUCK 

WE RECYCLE,1 EA/EA,

$469.98 $14,099.40 RUBBERMAID #FG130573BLUE **MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 10 EA**
$1,323.40 $39,702.00 $495.00 $14,850.00

BLACK STANDARD DUTY 1/2 

CU YD TILT TRUCK 

RUBBERMAID 9T14 BLACK 

PRICE BY EACH

15  Mop Bucket Mop Bucket:  7588BL

Mop and wringer system, tubular steel 

ans Structural web molded plastic. 

Length: 20.1 in 51.1 cm Width 15.7 in 

39.9cm Height: 36 1/2 in 92.7cm  Blue 

in Color

30 $89.86 $2,695.80 Rubbermaid 

FG758888BLUE 
$125.43 $3,762.90

3485205

Boardwalk

35 qt Mop Bucket and 

Wringer, Yellow/Silver, 

Plastic/Metal

$68.00 $2,040.00 $65.42 $1,962.60 BWK-2635COMBOYEL $86.45 $2,593.50

500264- Rubbermaid® 

Bucket/Wringer Combo 

Pack, 17 5/8"H x 16 

1/16"W x 20 1/4"D, 35 

Quarts

$112.50 $3,375.00 $87.39 $2,621.70

RUBBERMAID 15 FG758888BLUE 

7588-88 BLU WAVEBRAKE SIDE 

PRESS COMBO,1 EA/EA,/CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 15 

ALT 8690414 MOP BUCKET COMBO 

W/SIDEPRESS WRINGER - BLUE,1 

EA/EA,

$129.98 $3,899.40 RUBBERMAID #7588BL $75.30 $2,259.00 $110.00 $3,300.00

35 QT MOP BUCKET WITH 

WRINGER 7588BL 

RUBBERMAID PRICED BY 

EACH

16 Squeeges
Wipe'n 18 in. Dry Floor 

Squeegee with 53 inc. handle

Cell foam rubber blade, clean grout, 

bricks, or ti le. blade length: 18 inch , 

handle lenght:5 ft, product height 54 

in, handle aluminum and head steel

40 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $52.79 $2,111.60

UNGMW450 Unger Water 

Wand Standard Floor 

Squeegee, 18"" Wide Blade

+

UNGAL14A Unger Pro 

Aluminum Handle for Floor 

Squeegees, Acme, 58""

$21.13 $845.20 Changed to $31.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $76.11 $3,044.40

5414615- SKILCRAFT® 

FlexSweep Squeegee 

with Handle - 58" 

Aluminum Handle - 3" 

Height x 2.5" Width x 24" 

Length - Heavy Duty, 

Durable, Changeable 

Blade - Black - 1Each

$9.76 $390.40

ODELL 16 SQF-18PW FLOOR 

SQUEEQUEE, 18" IN WHITE,1 

EA/EA. ODELL 16 HANDLE 0160M-

Y 0160M-Y 60"YEL METAL HNDL 

W/METAL THREAD,1 EA/EA. 

POLLOCK SELLS THESE 

SEPERATELY BUT ARE PRICING 

THEM TOGETHER PER BID 

REQUEST. BOTH 12EA/CASE

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID $35.65 $1,426.00 $7.50 $300.00

18" FLOOR SQUEEGUEE/ 54" 

METAL HANDLE W/THREAD 

96816-S & 97159 ITEMS 

PRICED EACH TOGETHER 

BUT SOLD SEPARATLY

17 Angled Broom
 ANGLER BROOM (WOOD 

HANDLE) V-- ANGLE

Sturdy plastic bristles, 53" wood 

handle, Angled cut, Brush length: 13 in
300 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $1.00 $300.00 $9.53 $2,859.00

BWK932ACT 

Boardwalk

Angler Broom, 53"" Handle, 

Yellow, 12/Carton

Price per unit, not per carton. 

Must be ordered by 

increments of 12 

units/OF11601 

The O’Dell

53 in. Fiber and Plastic Broom

$10.99 $3,297.00 $7.28 $2,184.00 BWK-932AEA $12.92 $3,876.00

1392418- Boardwalk 

Angler Broom, Plastic 

Bristles, 53" Wood 

Handle, Yellow

$7.00 $2,100.00

ODELL 17 F11601 LG ANGLE 

BROOM W/WOODEN HNDL,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE QTY OF 

6EA

$5.49 $1,647.00 ABCO #BR1024WH $10.69 $3,207.00 $4.50 $1,350.00

ANGLE BROOM WITH METAL 

HANDLE 48" ABCO BR-

1024MH METAL HANDLE 

PRICE BY EACH

18

High Duster - For 

AC vents, and 

Hood

HIGH DUSTER
Extendable duster pole 30 inch to 100 

inch. Bendable head, Detachable pole, 

washable material.

60 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $8.76 $525.60
LS82EPPD

Lambskin Specialties

82 PP EXT FLEX DUSTER

$7.50 $450.00 $38.87 $2,332.20 UNG-95021 (UP TO 132") $44.06 $2,643.60

8762846- Rubbermaid 

Commercial Angled Head 

Overhead Dusting Tool - 

51" Handle Length - Vinyl 

Handle - 1 Each - Gray

$7.23 $433.80 $22.46 $1,347.60

ODELL 18 MFD23 MFD23 23"WHT 

MICROFEATHER DUSTER,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY QTY 

OF 24EA, HEAD MUST BE 

HANDWASHED NOT LAUNDERABLE. 

ODELL 18 HANDLE TH-BM60 TH-

BM60 3-5' TELESCOPIC HNDL,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY QTY 

OF 12EA. POLLOCK SELLS THESE 

SEPERATELY BUT ARE PRICING 

THEM TOGETHER PER BID 

REQUEST./ RUBBERMAID 18 ALT 

FGT12000GY00 T120 HI DUSTER,1 

EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY QTY 

OF 12EA. POLE NOT DETACHABLE

$6.98 $418.80
LAMBSKIN SPEC #S82EPPD **ITEM 

EXTENDS 51" TO 82"…12 EA/CS, FULL 

CASES ONLY**

$26.33 $1,579.80 $9.00 $540.00
52"-81" TELESCOPING 

WOOL DUSTER CFS 

36315600 PRICED BY EACH

19

Deck Brush (Scrub 

Brush) to scrub 

kitchen floors

DESK BRUSH Stiff crimped polypropylene bristles 

60' wood handle 
30 $14.85 $445.50 Carlise 3617514  and 

4026200 
$12.89 $386.70

BWK3310 Boardwalk Deck 

Brush Head, 2"" Cream 

Polypropylene Bristles, 10"" 

Brush

+

BWK122 Boardwalk Threaded 

End Broom Handle, Lacquered 

Wood, 0.94"" dia x 60"", 

Natural

$18.00 $540.00 $9.17 $275.10
BRUSH/BWK-3310 $4.03 

EA + HANDLE/BWK-136 

$5.14 EA

$46.45 $1,393.50

7498994- Rubbermaid 

Commercial Poly Bristle 

Medium Push Broom - 3" 

Polypropylene Bristle - 

1.13" Handle Diameter - 

Lacquered Wood Handle - 

1 Each

$7.21 $216.30 $11.46 $343.80

ODELL 19 DSBCP10 10" DECK 

BRUSH CREAM PLASTIC AND 

ODELL 19 HANDLE 360 0360 

15/16"X60"WOOD THREADED 

HNDL. POLLOCK SELLS THESE 

SEPERATELY BUT ARE PRICING 

THEM TOGETHER PER BID 

REQUEST. BOTH 12EA/CASE/ CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 19 

ALT 3617514 Flo-Pac® Stiff 

Polypropylene Deck Scrub 10" - 

Blue - MUST SELL BY 6EA. CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 19 

ALT HANDLE 4027100 4027100 

60"X15/16"THREADED WOOD 

HANDLE - MUST SELL BY 12EA. 

POLLOCK SELLS THESE 

SEPERATELY BUT ARE PRICING 

THEM TOGETHER PER BID 

REQUEST.

$7.99 $239.70 ABCO #00011 & 01102 **12 EA/CS, FULL 

CASES ONLY**
$19.71 $591.30 $6.50 $195.00

10" BLUE PLASTIC DECK 

BRUSH/60" THREADED 

WOOD HANDLE BETTER 

BRUSH 230810 & 140160. 

ITEMS PRICE TOGETHER BY 

EACH BUT SOLD 

SEPARATLY

20
Scraper for Gum 

on café tables
SCRAPER

Heavy Duty floor Scraper 48in long.  

Stainless steel blade, remove debris 

and other caked on deposit on floor. 

Steel tube with aluminum head, Angled 

head, replacement 4 in blades

100 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $35.87 $3,587.00

UNGLH12C

Unger

Light-Duty Scraper w/48"" 

Handle, One 4"" Reversible 

Blade

$18.99 $1,899.00 $34.30 $3,430.00 UNG-LH12C $29.15 $2,915.00 801057- Unger® Long 

Handle Floor Scraper, 48"
$27.44 $2,744.00 $22.15 $2,215.00

UNGER / ESSENDANT 20 

UNGLH12C LH12C 48"LONG HNDL 

SCRAPER,1 EA/EA,CAN SELL BY 

EACH OR CASE OF 10EA/ 

HOSPECO 20 ALT 3411 3411 

12"SCRAPER W/4"BLADE,6 

EA/CS,MUST PURCHASE CASE 

QTY OF 6EA

$8.98 $898.00 ABCO #CT08010 **12 EA/CS, FULL CASES 

ONLY**
$87.36 $8,736.00 $8.00 $800.00

48" ALUMINUM SCRAPER 

W/4 INCH BLADE ABCO 

CT08010 PRICED BY EACH 

21 Section Pole 4' OPTILOC 2 SECTION POLE UNIT 15 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $53.22 $798.30

UNGEZ250

Unger

Opti-Loc Extension Pole, 8 ft, 

Two Sections, Green/Silver

$40.00 $600.00 $36.82 $552.30 UNG-EZ120 $38.52 $577.80
8016545- Gritt 

Commercial Aluminum 

Pole, 20", Blue/Silver

$31.48 $472.20 $10.09 $151.35

UNGER / ESSENDANT 21 

UNGEZ120 EZ120 OPTILOC 4' 

TELESCOPIC POLE,1 EA/EA,CAN 

SELL BY EACH OR CASE OF 10EA/ 

HOSPECO 21 ALT 2505-MFMH-

3871 MicroWorks® Aluminum 

Extension Pole, Extends 38" - 

71",1 EA/EA,MUST PURCHASE BY 

QTY OF 24EA

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID $38.46 $576.90 $32.25 $483.75
4' TELESCOPIC POLE 2 

SECTION UNGER EZ120 

PRICED BY EACH

22 Table Cleaning Kit

TABLE CLEANING KIT -16"L 

MICROFIBER PRODUCT 

DIMENSIONS: 23 X17.2 X20.4 

INCHES; 18 POUNDS

CASE 20 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $399.69 $7,993.80
CK047

Unger 

Desk and Table Cleaning Kit

$440.00 $8,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $321.56 $6,431.20
UNGER / ESSENDANT 22 CK047 

CK047 DESK & TABLE CLEANING 

KIT,1 KIT/KIT,

$259.98 $5,199.60 UNGER #CK047 $391.16 $7,823.20 $330.00 $6,600.00
DESK AND TABLE CLEANING 

KIT UNGER CK047 PRICE BY 

KIT

Vendor #9

Southwestern Mill Dist.

Contact: Sean Sterling

Email: seans@swmill.net

Tabulation- #32-CNPJS-0525 IFB for Janitorial Supplies

32-CNPJS-0525: Janitorial Supplies

Vendor #1 

Ace Mart

Contact: Angela Hirsch

Email: schools @acemart.com

Vendor #2

Competitive Choice

Contact: Isabelle Duclaye

Email: isabelle@competitivechoice.net

Vendor #3

Dream Ranch

Contact: Warren Mckamey

Email: sheri@dreamranchtx.org

Vendor #4

Gateway Printing

Contact: Chris Diaz

Email: cdiaz@gatewayp.com

Vendor #5

ODP Business Solutions

Contact: Federico Collazo

Email: federico.collazo@odpbusiness.com

Vendor #6

Pollock Paper

Contact: Melissa Williams

Email:

Vendor #7

Pyramid School Products

Contact: Kenneth Miller

Email: kenny@pyramidsp.com

Vendor #8

Sam Tell and Son

Contact: Kevin Tenn

Email: governmentsales@samtell.com



23 Utility Knife 

BOX CUTTER RETRACTABLE 

UTILITY KNIFE 4/PK -HEAVY DUTY 

UTILITY KNIVES 

UNIT 64 $9.56 $2,523.84 Dexter Russell 42065 $0.90 $57.60 $23.58 $1,509.12
RAP10520

RAPTOR

Lucian Utility Knife

$10.25 $656.00 $4.13 $264.32 COS-091467 $7.51 $480.64

277946- Safety First 

System Pacific EZ4 Self-

retractable Guarded 

Safety Cutter - Self-

retractable, Safety 

Guard, Spring-loaded 

Blade, Finger Guard, 

Durable, Lightweight, 

Ergonomic Handle - 

Plastic - Black, Blue - 1 

Each

$18.03 $1,153.92

SHEFFIELD / ESSENDANT 23 

GNS12113 Sheffield Folding 

Lockback Knife, 1 Utility Blade, 2" 

Blade, 3.5" Aluminum Handle, 

Blue,1 EA/EA,CAN SELL BY EACH 

OR CASE OF 48EA

$4.89 $312.96 EXCELL #16009 **ITEM IS 3/PK…12/CS, 

FULL CASES ONLY**
$4.39 $280.96 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

24 Odor Eliminator
GRANULAR DEODORANT, 

MOISTURE ABSORBENT
UNIT 35 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $66.74 $2,335.90

BGD150

Big D Industries

Granular Deodorant, Lemon, 

16 oz, Shaker Can, 12/Carton

$46.10 $1,613.50 $37.92 $1,327.20 BGD-150 (PRICED & SOLD 

IN CASE OF 12)
$8.72 $305.20

648189- Fresh Products 

Super-Sorb Liquid Spill 

Absorbent, Lemon Scent, 

12 Oz

$4.57 $159.95 $3.85 $134.75

BIG D / ESSENDANT 24 BGD150 

150 BIG D GRANULAR LEMON 

SCENT DEODORANT, ITEM PACKED 

12-16OZ/CS, MUST PURCHASE 

CASE QTY OF 12EA, PRICING PER 

UNIT AS REQUESTED./ HOSPECO 

24 ALT 920NGCN NILOSORB 

ABSORBENT, CORN COB BASED, 

ORIGINAL, 12OZ,12 - 12OZ/CS, 

MUST PURCHASE CS QTY OF 

12EA. PRICING PER UNIT AS 

REQUESTED

$3.59 $125.65 TOLCO #260099 $72.66 $2,543.10 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

25

 

Jumbo Toilet 

Tissue Dispenser 
Jumbo Toilet Tissue Dispenser Each 5 $46.50 $232.50 San Jamar R4000TBK $32.22 $161.10

BWK1519

Boardwalk

Single Jumbo Toilet Tissue 

Dispenser, 11 x 6.25 x 12.25, 

Black

$36.00 $180.00 $21.39 $106.95 SJM-R2000TBK $0.01 $0.05

8327060- Highmark® 

Jumbo Bathroom Tissue 

Dispenser, 1 Roll, 13-

3/4"H x 10-3/4"W x 5-

5/8"D, Dark Gray

$28.03 $140.15 $23.75 $118.75

GEORGIA PACIFIC 25 59210 59210 

9" 2 ROLL JUMBO BLK TT DISP,1 

EA/EA,/ CFS 

BRANDS/CARLISLE/SAN JAMAR 25 

ALT R2090TBK R2090TBK 

SOLOETTE SINGLE ROLL TT 

DISP,1 EA/EA,

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID $60.06 $300.30 $20.00 $100.00
TISSUE DISPENSER- 9" JRT 

PALMER BRAND RD001602 

PRICE BY EACH

26 Jumbo Bath Tissue Jumbo Bath Tissue Case 45 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $48.99 $2,204.55

GENJRT1000

GEN

JRT Jumbo Bath Tissue, 

Septic Safe, 2-Ply, White, 

3.3"" x 1,000 ft, 12 

Rolls/Carton

$30.00 $1,350.00 $27.34 $1,230.30 GEN-1516 $24.95 $1,122.75

5900150- Highmark® ECO 

JRT 2-Ply Jumbo Toilet 

Paper, 1250' Per Roll, 

100% Recycled, Pack Of 

6 Rolls

$32.04 $1,441.80
GEORGIA PACIFIC 26 13728 13728 

ACCLAIM JUMBO JR 2PLY WHT 

TT,8 ROL/CS,

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID $42.86 $1,928.70 $28.00 $1,260.00

9" TOILET TISSUE 2 PLY 

STERLING BRAND 

3.55*1000 JRT92100 PRICE 

BY CASE

Total Cost $67,313.34 $158,165.65 $14,184.42 $144,030.20 $68,453.37 $101,424.99 $79,267.82 $38,497.35 $10,810.20 $120.60 $79,599.61 $163,926.36 $194,643.75



Ace Mart
Competitive 

Choice
Dream Ranch

Gateway 

Printing

ODP 

Business
Pollock Paper

Pyramid School 

Products
Sam Tell 

Southwestern 

Mill Dist. 

Region  Campus  Address  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N  Service Y/N 

Idea Quest  14001 N Rooth Rd, Edinburg, TX 78541 

Idea Mission  1600 S Schuerbach Rd, Mission, TX 78572 

Idea Mcallen  201 N Bentsen Rd, McAllen, TX 78501 

Idea North Mission  2706 N Holland Ave, Mission, TX 78574 

Idea Rio Grande City  2803 Monarch Ln, Rio Grande City, TX 78582 

Idea Tres Lagos  5200 Tres Lagos Blvd, McAllen, TX 78504 

Idea Los Encinos  5400 S Ware Rd, McAllen, TX 78503 

Idea Palmview  4100 N Schuerbach Rd, Palmview, TX 78572 

Idea La Joya  725 E Expressway 83, La Joya, TX 78560 

Idea Donna  401 S 1st St, Donna, TX 78537 

Idea San Juan  600 E. Sioux Rd. San Juan, Texas 78589 

Idea Pharr  600 E. Las Milpas Rd. Pharr, Texas 78577 

Idea Alamo  325 Kansas Rd, Alamo, TX 78516 

Idea Edinburg  2753 N. Roegiers Rd. Edinburg, Texas 78541 

Idea Toros College Prep  3300 East Texas Road Edinburg, Texas 78542 

Idea Owassa  1000 East Owassa Road Pharr, Texas 78577 

Idea Elsa  411 South Fannin Elsa, Texas 78543 

Idea Frontier  2800 S. Dakota Ave. Brownsville, Texas 78521 

Idea San Benito  2151 Russell Ln. San Benito, Texas 78586 

Idea Weslaco  2931 E Sugar Cane Dr. Weslaco, Texas 78599 

Idea Brownsville  4395 Paredes Line Road Brownsville, Texas 78526 

Idea Weslaco Pike  1000 E Pike Blvd. Weslaco, Texas 78596 

Idea Riverview  30 Palm Blvd. Brownsville, Texas 78520 

Idea Robindale  3802 E. Ruben Torres Sr. Blvd Brownsville, Texas 78521 

Idea Harlingen  24240 Chester Park Rd. Harlingen, Texas 78552 

Idea Sports Park  6650 Old Alice Rd. Brownsville, Texas 78526 

Idea Carver  217 Robinson Pl. San Antonio, Texas 78202 

Idea Monterrey Park  222 SW 39th St. San Antonio, Texas 78237 

Idea Walzem  6445 Walzem Rd. San Antonio, Texas 78239 

Idea Eastside  2519 Martin Luther King Dr. San Antonio, Texas 78203 

Idea Judson  13427 Judson Rd. San Antonio, Texas 78233 

Idea Converse  5490 FM 1516 Converse, Texas 78109 

Idea Harvey E. Najim  926 S WW White Rd. San Antonio, Texas 78220 

Idea Mays  1210 Horal Dr. San Antonio, Texas 78245 

Idea Ewing Halsell  2523 W Ansley Blvd. San Antonio, Texas 78224 

Idea South Flores  6919 S Flores St. San Antonio, Texas 78221 

Idea Brackenridge  5555 Old Pearsall Rd San Antonio, TX 78242 

Idea Ingram Hills  3115 Majestic Dr. San Antonio, Texas 78228 

Idea Burke  10434 Marbach Rd San Antonio, Texas 78245 

Idea Hidden Meadow  10138 Culebra Rd. San Antonio, Texas 78251 

Idea Ambrose & Freda Robinson  10170 Kriewald Road San Antonio, TX 78245 

Idea Montopolis  1701 Vargas Road Austin, Texas 78741 

Idea Rundberg 
9504 North Interstate 35 Frontage Road Austin, Texas 

78753 

Idea Bluff Springs  1700 E. Slaughter Lane Austin, Texas 78747 

Idea Pflugerville  1901 E Wells Branch Pkwy Pflugerville, Texas 78660 

Idea Kyle  640 Philomena Dr. Kyle, Texas 78640 

Idea Health Professions  5816 Wilcab Austin, Texas 78721 

Idea Parmer Park  1438 East Yager Lane Austin, Texas 78753 

Idea Round Rock  3301 Greenlawn Blvd Round Rock, Texas 78664 

Idea Rio Vista  210 N Rio Vista Rd Socorro, Texas 79927 

Attachment "M"- Service Locations
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Idea Edgemere  15101 Edgemere Blvd. El Paso, Texas 79938 

Idea Mesa Hills  405 Wallenberg Dr. El Paso, Texas 79912 

Idea Horizon Vista  201 Horizon Crossing St. Horizon City, Texas 79928 

Idea Mesquite Hills  11881 Dyer St., El Paso, Texas 79934 

Idea Travis  900 E Gist Ave. Midland, Texas 79701 

Idea Yukon  7300 East Yukon Road Odessa, Texas 79765 

Idea Lopez  3401 W. 5th St., Odessa, TX 79763 

Idea Hardy  1930 Little York Rd. Houston, Texas 77093 

Idea Spears  2010 Spears Rd. Houston, Texas 77067 

Idea Lake Houston  5627 S Lake Houston Parkway Houston, Texas 77049 

Idea Rise  3000 S. Cherry Lane Fort Worth, Texas 76116 

Idea Achieve  1900 Thomas Road Haltom City, Texas 76117 

Idea Edgecliff  1640 Altamesa Blvd. Fort Worth, Texas 76134 

Idea Southeast  2935 E Seminary Drive Fort Worth, Texas 76119 

Southern Dallas  Idea AW Brown  5701 Red Bird Center Dr, Dallas, TX 75237  Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N
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