



IDEA
Public Schools

IFB #4-HVAC-0523 Bid Summary			
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.			
Campus	Lowest Bid Amount	Intended Awarded Vendor	Notes:
Texas			
El Paso			
Edgemere	\$ 12,094.50	JAG El Paso	
Rio Vista	\$ 12,320.00	JAG El Paso	
Mesa Hills	\$ 12,022.50	JAG El Paso	
Horizon Vista	\$ 11,697.50	JAG El Paso	
Mesquite Hills	\$ 9,347.50	JAG El Paso	
Total	\$ 57,482.00	JAG El Paso	
Tarrant County			
Achieve	\$ 16,540.00	APS Building Services	
Rise	\$ 16,540.00	APS Building Services	
Edgecliff	\$ 15,950.00	APS Building Services	
Southeast	\$ 16,540.00	APS Building Services	
Total	\$ 65,570.00	APS Building Services	
Houston			
Lake Houston	\$ 16,020.00	APS Building Services	
Hardy	\$ 16,020.00	APS Building Services	
Spears	\$ 24,130.00	APS Building Services	
Total	\$ 56,170.00	APS Building Services	
Florida			
Tampa Bay			
Hope	NO BID		
Victory			
Total			
Jacksonville			
Bassett	NO BID		
River Bluff			
Total			
Louisiana			
Baton Rouge			
Bridge	\$ 4,545.00	Louisiana Controls	
Innovation	\$ 3,830.00	Louisiana Controls	
University Prep	\$ 3,915.00	Louisiana Controls	
Total	\$ 12,290.00	Louisiana Controls	
Ohio			
Cincinnati			
Price Hill	\$ 11,800.00	Triton Services, Inc.	
Valley View	\$ 7,900.00	Triton Services, Inc.	
Total	\$ 19,700.00	Triton Services, Inc.	



IFB #4-HVAC-0523 TX

Campus	IFB does not meet evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.										Notes			
	JAG El Paso	Air Force One	RECA Services	Gray Mechanical Contractors	Sanjaya Controls	PC Automated	Vitrox Services, Inc.	APS Building Services	Synovate Environmental Services	CMC Corporate Solutions				
Edinburg	\$	12,094.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	29,311.00	\$	-	24,130.00	\$	-	\$	-
Elgin Vista	\$	12,830.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	29,311.00	\$	-	24,261.00	\$	-	\$	-
Elgin West	\$	22,022.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	29,321.00	\$	-	26,631.00	\$	-	\$	-
Elgin Vista	\$	11,697.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	29,920.00	\$	-	26,560.00	\$	-	\$	-
Marquette Hills	\$	6,847.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	20,403.00	\$	-	18,230.00	\$	-	\$	-
Total	\$	57,489.00	\$	\$	\$	\$	138,966.00	\$	-	129,592.00	\$	-	\$	-
Bidding 1-15 (1=lowest priced/15=highest priced)	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3	NO BID	-	2	NO BID	-	NO BID	-
Tarrant County														
Adrian	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	\$	-	\$	-	16,540.00	\$	-	17,016.00	\$
Bluff	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	\$	-	\$	-	16,540.00	\$	-	17,016.00	\$
Chaparral	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	\$	-	\$	-	15,500.00	\$	-	16,000.00	\$
Southwest	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	\$	-	\$	-	16,540.00	\$	-	17,016.00	\$
Total	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	\$	-	\$	-	65,120.00	\$	-	67,048.00	\$
Bidding 1-15 (1=lowest priced/15=highest priced)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	1	NO BID	-	2	NO BID
Houston														
Lake Houston	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	21,970.00	\$	-	\$	-	16,000.00	\$	-	\$
North	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	27,720.00	\$	-	\$	-	16,000.00	\$	-	\$
Opeta	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	29,340.00	\$	-	\$	-	16,000.00	\$	-	\$
Total	\$	-	\$	\$	\$	77,430.00	\$	-	\$	-	48,000.00	\$	-	\$
Bidding 1-15 (1=lowest priced/15=highest priced)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID
GRAND TOTAL	\$	57,489.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$	77,430.00	NO BID	\$	-	188,646.00	NO BID	\$	249,176.00	NO BID