
Campus Lowest Bid Amount Intended Awarded Vendor Notes:

Edgemere 12,094.50$                                               JAG El Paso
Rio Vista 12,320.00$                                               JAG El Paso
Mesa Hills 12,022.50$                                               JAG El Paso
Horizon Vista 11,697.50$                                               JAG El Paso
Mesquite Hills 9,347.50$                                                 JAG El Paso
Total 57,482.00$                                               JAG El Paso

Achieve 16,540.00$                                               APS Building Services
Rise 16,540.00$                                               APS Building Services
Edgecliff 15,950.00$                                               APS Building Services
Southeast 16,540.00$                                               APS Building Services
Total 65,570.00$                                               APS Building Services

Lake Houston 16,020.00$                                               APS Building Services
Hardy 16,020.00$                                               APS Building Services
Spears 24,130.00$                                               APS Building Services
Total 56,170.00$                                               APS Building Services

Hope
Victory
Total

Bassett
River Bluff
Total

Bridge 4,545.00$                                                 Louisiana Controls
Innovation 3,830.00$                                                 Louisiana Controls
University Prep 3,915.00$                                                 Louisiana Controls
Total 12,290.00$                                               Louisiana Controls

Price Hill 11,800.00$                                               Triton Services, Inc.
Valley View 7,900.00$                                                 Triton Services, Inc.
Total 19,700.00$                                               Triton Services, Inc.
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Campus JAG El Paso Air Force One RIECK Services Gray Mechanical Contractors Louisiana Controls PC Automated Triton Services, Inc. APS Building Services Synergy Environmental Services CMC Corporate Solutions Notes:

Bridge -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          4,545.00$                                                 -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          25,526.00$                                              
Innovation -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          3,830.00$                                                 -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          15,710.00$                                              
University Prep -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          3,915.00$                                                 -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          16,280.00$                                              
Total -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          12,290.00$                                              -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          -$                                                          57,516.00$                                              
Rating 1-10 (1=Lowest priced/10=Highest price) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2
GRAND TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12,290.00$                                              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 57,516.00$                                              
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