
Texas Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Upper Rio Grande Valley $11,550 /month - $138,600 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services
Lower Rio Grande Valley $13,200 / month - $158,400 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services
San Antonio $16,500 / month - $198,00 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services
Austin $8,250 / month - $99,000 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services
El Paso NO BID NO BID
Tarrant County $8,000 / month - $96,000 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services
Houston $6,000 / month - $72,000 / yr. South Texas Horticultural Services

Louisiana Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Baton Rouge - Bridge 17,545.50$                                          Rotolo Consultants, Inc.
Baton Rouge - Innovation 17,545.50$                                          Rotolo Consultants, Inc.

Florida Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Tampa - Hope
Tampa - Victory Vinik
Jacksonville - Bassett
Jacksonville - River Bluff

NO BID NO BID



CAMPUS
South Texas Horticultural 

Services LLC.
VENDOR 2 VENDOR 3 Notes:

Mission 1,650.00$                                    
*SOUTH TEXAS HORTICULTURAL PRICED 
PER MONTH

Tres Lagos 1,650.00$                                    
Rio Grande 1,650.00$                                    
Owassa 1,650.00$                                    
Los Encinos 1,650.00$                                    
Toros 1,650.00$                                    
Palmview 1,650.00$                                    
Total 11,550.00$                                  -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Weslaco 1,650.00$                                    
Weslaco Pike 1,650.00$                                    
Sports Park 1,650.00$                                    
Frontier 1,650.00$                                    
Riverview 1,650.00$                                    
Elsa 1,650.00$                                    
Robindale 1,650.00$                                    
Harlingen 1,650.00$                                    
Total 13,200.00$                                  -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Eastside 1,650.00$                                    
Carver 1,650.00$                                    
Robinson 1,650.00$                                    
Ewing Halsell 1,650.00$                                    
Brackenridge 1,650.00$                                    
Najim 1,650.00$                                    
Ingram Hills 1,650.00$                                    
Burke 1,650.00$                                    
Hidden Meadows 1,650.00$                                    
Converse 1,650.00$                                    
Total 16,500.00$                                  -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Bluff Springs 1,650.00$                                    
Kyle 1,650.00$                                    
Pflugerville 1,650.00$                                    
Parmer Park 1,650.00$                                    
Roundrock 1,650.00$                                    
Total 8,250.00$                                    -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Edgemere NO BID
Rio Vista NO BID
Mesa Hills NO BID
Horizon Vista NO BID
Mesquite Hills NO BID
Total -$                                              -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Achieve 2,000.00$                                    
Rise 2,000.00$                                    
Edgecliff 2,000.00$                                    
Southeast 2,000.00$                                    
Total 8,000.00$                                    -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Hardy 2,000.00$                                    
Spears 2,000.00$                                    
Lake Houston 2,000.00$                                    
Total 6,000.00$                                    -$                                               -$                    

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

IFB #3-UIL-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Houston

Upper Rio Grande Valley

Lower Rio Grande Valley

San Antonio 

Austin

El Paso

Tarrant County



GRAND TOTAL 63,500.00$                                  -$                                               -$                    



CAMPUS Rotolo Consultants, Inc. VENDOR 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Notes:

Bridge 17,545.50$                                  
Innovation 17,545.50$                                  
Total 35,091.00$                                  -$                                               
Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1
Grand total 35,091.00$                                  -$                                               

IFB #3-UIL-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Baton Rouge



CAMPUS VENDOR 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Notes:

Hope
Victory 
Total -$                                              

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 

Bassett Rd
River Bluff
Total -$                                              

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 
Grand total -$                                              

NO BID

IFB #3-UIL-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Tampa

Jacksonville

NO BID
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