IDEA

¥ Public Schools

ATTACHMENT L NON-FOOD DESCRIPTIONS
Brady Plus ‘Gulf Coast Paper Co. Southwestern Mill Distributors
3-NFOODTX- 1224 Non-Food Items Tabulation 1510 Cornerway 3705 Houston Highway 310 Dallas St.
San Antonio, TX 78219 Victoria, TX 77901 El Paso, TX 79901
MONTHLY Alternate
Total C it | # ti d rticipati Alte ite Ite -
Item Description Case Size ount imes use particlpation | - - ntities | Unit Price | Extended Price Notes Unit Price | Extended Price Notes/ Alternates Items - Unit ernate ftems Unit Price | Extended Price | Notes
per case per cycle enrollment ) Extended Price
Reauested Price
1 Parchment Baking Paper/Liner Sheet, to fit 16"x26" sheet pans, 1000 600 $ 3895 23,370.00 $ 5200|$  31,200.00 |VB25Q $ 52.00 | $ 31,200.00 |$58.85 $35,310.00
white, packed 1000 ct.
2 Plastic Film, 24" PVC Cling Film, in dispenser box with serrated 1/2000 ft 100 S 1885|$ 1,885.00 S 2078[$  2,078.00 [24x2M $ 2078 2,078.00 [$25.65 $2,565.00
edge nacked 2000 f
3 Plastic Film, 12" PVC Cling Film, in dispenser box with serrated 1/2000 ft 50 s oa3s 47150 S 1137 s 568.50 [12X2M $ 1137 [ § 568.50 [$12.25 $612.50
edge nacked 2000 f1
4 Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheets, 9"x10-3/4" packed 6/500ct. 6/500 ct 75 S 4052 3,039.00 S 7352($ 551400 [29100 $ 7352|'$ 5,514.00 [$66.45 $4,983.75
B Aluminum Foil, heavy weight, .001 gauge, 24", in dispenser box with serrated edge, |1/ 1000 ft 300 S 7299 21,897.00 $ 11832 ($  35496.00 (12408 $ 77.00 | $ 23,100.00 [$91.50 $27,450.00
nacked 1000 ft/rall AIT ITEM# D2ATHD PRICE 477
6 Aluminum Foil, heavy weight, .001 gauge, 12", in dispenser box with serrated edge, [1/1000 ft 75 S 2616 (S 1,962.00 [STANDARD, NOT HEAVY | $ 3101 [$  2,325.75 [vB620 $ 2755 [ s 2,066.25 [$25.20 $1,890.00
nacked 1000 ft/rall DTV ALT ITEM# N121S0 PRICE 77 S5
7 Beard Cover, nylon, black, packed 200 ct. 1/100ct 10 S 4684 468.40 [WHITE, ONLYSOLDBY [ 2315$ 231.50 [MBCW/104980 s 1599 [ § 159.90 [$4.25 $42.50 per box
THE CASE AIT ITEM# DARCINN PRICE 415 Q9
8 Bag for Ice, clear, unprinted, drawstring closure, poly, 10 Ib 1/1000 ct 75 s 3023 2,267.25 |PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $  50.50 [ $  3,787.50 [10PDS s 50.50 [ $ 3,787.50 [$68.70 $5,152.50
capacity, packed 1000 ct
9 Brown Hair Net 100/ct 10 bags / cs 100 ct 150 s ss4s 1,326.00 |PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 12450 | $  18,675.00 [HN500/28747 S 12450 | $ 18,675.00 [$154.00  [523,100.00
10 Bouffant Cap, 24", white, fire retardant, packed 100 ct 100 ct 10 s 23448 234.40 |ONLY SOLD BY THE S 40435 404.30 [MB24W/BOUFFANT24 s 4043 s 404.30 [ $5.60 $56.00 per box
CASE 21" NOT 22"
1 Bun Rack Covers, plastic, 52"x80", minimum .0005 mil, packed 50 50ct 200 s 1180 2,360.00 |PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 1610 [ S 3,220.00 |BOR5280/552808PRCS s 16.10 [ $ 3,220.00 [$23.50 $4,700.00
o
12 Gloves - Black or Blue - Small, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly 10/100ct 400 S 2406 S 9,624.00 S 2272[$  9,088.00 [PFVS/64V3000PFS s 28523 11,408.00 | $29.50 $11,800.00
tovtured wrict lonoth nacked 100 ct ALT ITEMS# RITIENGS PRICE $9R 62
13 Gloves - Black or Blue - Medium, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly 10/100ct 400 S 2406 (S 9,624.00 [PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 2272 [$  9,088.00 [PFVM/64V3000PFM $ 28523 11,408.00 |$29.50 $11,800.00
tovtured wrict lonoth nacked 100 ct AL T ITEMSRILIENGM PRICE $98 59
14 Gloves - Black or Blue - LARGE food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly 10/100ct 600 S 2406 (S 14,436.00 [PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 2272 [$  13,632.00 [PFVL/64V3000PFL $ 28523 17,112.00 |$29.50 $17,700.00
tovtured wrict lonoth nacked 100 ct ALT ITEM# RITIENGI PRICE 492 59
15 Gloves - Black or Blue - Extra Large, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly | 10/100ct 600 S 2406 (S 14,436.00 S 2272($  13,632.00 | PFVXL/643000PFXL $ 28523 17,112.00 |$29.50 $17,700.00
tovtured wrict lonoth nacked 100 ct AIT ITEMS# RITIENGYI PRICE 492 89
16 10403 Heavy Duty White plastic Aprons 28X46 5/100 5/100 150 S 4884 7,326.00 $ 1875|$ 2,812.50 | AP15F2846/2846WHITE $ 1875 [ $ 2,812.50 |$59.00 $8,850.00
17 DP57 6.5X7 SADDLE SANDWICH BAGS 2000/CS 2000 1000 S 856(S 8,560.00 S 748[$  7,480.00 [67558/DPE57 s 748 $ 7,480.00 [$8.12 $8,120.00 per case
18 510161 6X9 GRN MED DTY SCRUB 3/20 60/cs 450 s 3178 14,301.00 [PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 472 [$  2,124.00 [vB96MSP s 2728 2,124.00 [$20.05 $9,022.50 per case
19 HR243308N 24X33 8MC HI-D CAN LINERS 20/50 100/cs 100 s 18213 1,821.00 [6MICINSTEAD OF 8MIC [ $ 22.03 [ §  2,203.00 [24338/R2433N6 s 2033 2,203.00 [$27.65 $2,765.00
20 PGR3858X3B 38X58 BLACK 1.5MIL LINERS 10/10 100/cs. 3375 $ 18218 61,458.75 $  2291|$  77,321.25 |3858X3B $ 22918 77,321.25 |$26.00 $87,750.00
21 89460 ENMOTION WHT HI-CAPACITY ROLL TOWEL 6/800' 6/cs 175 s 7500 13,125.00 S 6726[$  11,770.50 [GP89460/89460 $ 67.26 | $ 11,770.50 $0.00 NO BID
22 Bags, Freezer, Gallon Size 10 9/16 X 10 3/4, 200/ case 200 ct 175 s 1135 1,986.25 [PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE | $ 2269 [$  3,970.75 [RF1011 s 1465 [ $ 2,563.75 [$16.05 $2,808.75
AITITEM# E21012G PRICE $14 65
23 Bags, Freezer, Quart Size, Zipper Seal 100 $ 1320 (% 1,320.00 S 2022(S  2,422.00 |RS78 $ 1455 [ $ 1,455.00 [$19.37 $1,937.00
AIT ITEM# EI07020 PRICE $14 85
1 Lunch Tray, 5 Compartment, laminated foam, BLACK, 8.25"x10.25", must withstand |500 500 15 64000 1920 s 4136 s 79,411.20 [WHITE S 2060|$  39,552.00 105008 s 2723 43,622.40 [$31.50 $60,480.00
heat up to 200F, break resistant, FDA approved, meets Food Grade HACCP ALT ITEM YTHBOS00 PRICE $22.72
2 9" Square Hinged Foam Container, 3 Compartment, , break resistant, FDA approved, [ 150 ct 150 5 64000 2133 s 1942($ 41,429.33 S 17.11($ 3650133 |VBFMHI3VW s 1711 36,501.33 [$31.50 $67,200.00
meote
3 Large 1 Compartment Hinged, clear plastic, perimeter seal, snap 200 ct 200 15 64000 4800 s 4400 $  211,200.00 S 4815 (S  231,120.00 |C95PSTL s 4815 [ $ 231,120.00 [$69.95 $335,760.00
clociire_nnenino tahe with clin rocictant orin R.7/2"v0.2/2"v3"
4 5" Square Hinged clear, Container, 1 Compartment, white, break resistant, FDA 500 ct 500 3 64000 384 s 4300]$ 16,512.00 S 49.15|$  18,873.60 |CS3PSTL s 49.15 [ 18,873.60 | $55.60 $21,350.40
annroved meet Eand Grade HACCP cartification narked §00 ct
B Flatware Banquet Pack: individually wrapped full size, heavyweight fork, spoon, 5 |500 500 15 64000 1920 NO BID S 1249 S 23,980.80 |810001826 s 1249 [ 3 23,980.80 [$17.15 $32,928.00
/4" ctraw _and 2-nly 12"v13" white nankin_made fram ar
6 Flatware Fork KIT W/ BLACK FORK AND 13X17 NAPKIN 1000 ct 1000 15 64000 960 s 14263 13,689.60 S 3105[$  29,808.00 [PLOOIEKIT $ 3105 [ $ 29,808.00 $0.00 NO BID
7 Bags for Sack Lunch, paper, brown/kraft, with gusset, Heavy Duty, 4/250 ct 1000 3 64000 192 s 14303 2,745.60 | PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE S 1505|$  2,889.60 | D6BG/VB6SOB s 15.05 [ $ 2,889.60 $26.95 $5,174.40
Glh 4/780ct
8 POLY BAGS 6x3x12500/CS 500 500 15 64000 1920 $ 1630 31,296.00 | PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE $ 1492 |$  28646.40 |6312POB/FO912RC $ 1492 % 28,646.40 | $19.30 $37,056.00
9 Plastic Drink Cup, 9 oz Capacity, clear, squat 1/1000ct  |1000 3 64000 192 s 4465 8,572.80 S 5202|$  9,987.84 |TPOR/PTCO9DI2 s 5202 s 9,987.84 | $68.60 $13,171.20
10 10.5" PFAS Free Compostable Fiber Blend 3-Compartment Round School Lunch Tray[500ct 500 1 64000 64 s 5455($ 3,491.20 S 2353[$ 150592 [m310sLT s 253 (s 1,505.92 |NO BID
11 Portion tray, 10 0z Offer vs Servem, plastic ivex 1000 1000 10 64000 640 s 3713($ 23,763.20 | PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE S 3746 |$  23,974.40 (21746 $ 37.46 [ $ 23,974.40 [NO BID
AITRID ITEM 21746 PACKED 1125 PER
12 Bento Box, clear plastic, 4 compartment 1000 1000 1 64000 64 s 7535($ 4,822.40 [PACKSIZEDIFFERENCE, | § 65.05 | $  4,163.20 |V65324C s 65.05 [ $ 4,163.20 [NO BID
NOT STOCKED IN 6070 OR
13 Flatware Soup spoon kit w/ spoon and napkin 1000 1000 2 64000 128 NO BID S 1450 [$  1,856.00 [810002739 s 1450 [ s 1,856.00 |NO BID
14 VERSAtainer 12 oz. Oval PP Container and Lid 500ct 500 2 64000 256 NO BID S 3312($ 847872 [oc128 s 36.00 [ $ 9,216.00 [NO BID
AITITEM CRR11R PRICE $26 00
15 Biodegradeable 5 compartment school lunch tray 500ct 500 05 64000 64 s asas s 2,908.80 S 3050 (S  1,952.00 |GFTS s 26.47 [ § 1,694.08 |NO BID
AT ITEM MCSRONNSRR PRICE $96 47
16 CR-815B BLACK 160Z CONTAINERW/LID 7X4.85X1.5 150/CS 150 150 05 64000 213 s 2353($ 5,019.73 S 3543[$  7,558.40 |CR81SB s 35.43 [ 8 7,558.40 [NO BID




17 407 Offer vs Serve Deep Tray, black, plastic, 3-1/2"x3-1/2"x1-1/4", 1/2500ct 2500 15 64000 384 S 5063 [$ 19,441.92 [MIL DIFFERENCE s 3729[$ 1431936 |R4196 29.79 [ s 19,119.36 [NO BID.
7.5 mil_nacked 2500 ct AIT ITEM 20479 PRICE 440 7Q

18 Souffle/portion Cup Lids To 4 Oz Cups, Clear, 2400/carton 1/2400ct  |2400 10 64000 267 S 3150 $ 8,400.00 [PACK SIZEDIFFERNCE2500 | § 29.13 [ 7,768.00 [VBPCLID345 PACKED 2500 2013 [$ 7,768.00 | $37.50 $10,000.00

19 PET Cup Inserts PF35C1 SINGLE COMPARTMENT CUP INSERT 1/1000 1000 05 64000 32 S 2043 [$ 653.76 [SIMILAR TO PF325C1 S 6806 (S  2177.92 [PF3sc 68.06 | $ 2,177.92 [NO BID

20 Plastic Drink Cup, 12 oz Capacity, clear, packed 1000 ct. 1/1000ct  [1000 3 64000 192 S 45.00$ 8,640.00 S 5200[$  9,984.00 [vGi2cF 58.06 | $ 11,147.52 | $54.65 $10,492.80

AITITEM TP12 PRICE 458 N6

21 Lid tofit 12 oz Clear Plastic Drink Cup listed above, clear, flat, WITH STRAW SLOT,  [1/1000ct  |1000 3 64000 192 S 2050 $ 5,664.00 S 3100 [$ 595200 [F9HCF 3316 [ 6,366.72 | $26.25 $5,040.00
nacked 1000 ct AITITEM REITS PRICE $22 16

2 Lid to fit 9 0z Clear Plastic Drink Cup , clear, flat, without straw slot, 1/1000ct  |1000 3 64000 192 S 3600[$ 6,912.00 S 4105|$  7,881.60 |662TP/VBI2NS 41.05 [ § 7,881.60 | $38.25 $7,344.00
narked 1000 ¢t

23 Portion Cups, 207, Translucent, 10/250 ct 2500 7 64000 179 S 2080 [$ 3,727.36 S 2196 |$ 393523 |vPBC201PP 21.96 [ § 3,935.23 | $30.30 $5,429.76

24 PET Plastic Soufflé Portion Cup Lids 2 0Z. 10/250ct 2500 7 64000 179 S 2080 [$ 3,727.36 S 2163|$  3,876.10 [VBPCLID250 2163 [ $ 3,876.10 | $29.10 $5,214.72

25 Portion Cup, 1 0z Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant, 2500 ct 2500 1 64000 2 S 1750 $ 448.00 s 1703 435.97 [VBPC100PP 17.03 [ 435.97 [$23.65 $605.44
narked 9500 ¢t

26 Lid tofit 1 0z Portion Cup, clear, plastic, snap closure, packed 2500 2500 ct 2500 1 64000 26 S 1250 $ 320.00 s 15203 389.12 |VBPCLID100 1520 [ 389.12 [$20.50 $524.80
o

27 Portion Cup, 4 oz Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant 2500 ct 2500 10 64000 256 S 3200[$ 8,192.00 S 3924|$  10,045.44 |VBPCAO1PP 39.24 s 10,045.44 [$59.25 $15,168.00

28 Lid to fit 4 0z Portion Cup, clear, plastic, snap closure, packed 2500 2500 ct 2500 10 64000 256 s 2700 $ 6,912.00 s 2013[$  7457.28 |vBpCLID34S 2013 s 7,457.28 | $37.50 $9,600.00
o

29 8 0z Offer vs Serve, clear plastic, 4-15/1"x3-5/16"x1-5/8", 12.5 mil, packed 1000 ct. |1000 ct 1000 7 64000 448 S 3214$ 14,398.72 S 3268 (S  14,640.64 |21878 3268 [ 14,640.64 |NO BID

30 Bags to fit sandwich/burger, brown/natural paper, unprinted, with clear window, |2000 ct 2000 7 64000 224 S 3744 8,386.56 S 9500 $  21,280.00 [300115 87.50 [ $ 19,600.00 [NO BID:

S"v7"_ecannmical chaice for hat and AIT ITEM 200100 PRICE $87 50

31 Foil Cushion Wrap for Sandwiches/Burgers, no design or logo, for 1000 1000 5 64000 320 S 12369 [ 39,580.80 S 87.00[$  27,840.00 [300806 87.00 [ $ 27,840.00 [NO BID
fand handline tn racict oreace and maistire 12man

32 Bags to fit sandwich/burger, Foil/Paper Honeycomb Insulated 2/1000 ct 2000 10 64000 320 NO BID S 11117 [$  35574.40 [300829 11117 [ $ 35,574.40 [$75.00 524,000.00
Wran 13" lenoth v 10.1/2" Width Rliie Check miict withetand heat 1in ta

33 12 0z. Compostable Soup Containers 1000 ct 1000 3 64000 192 NO BID S 90.00$  17,280.00 |[VB12FCW 90.00 [ $ 17,280.00 [NO BID:

34 Round Clear Lid-32 oz. PRIMEWARE, 300 300 ct 300 1 64000 213 S 49.09[$ 10,472.53 S 67.00|$  14,293.33 [TBL32/VBLIDPET 67.00 [ $ 14,203.33 [$78.00 $16,640.00

35 TAN BOWL-32 OZ. PRIMEWARE 300 300 ct 300 1 64000 213 S 39248 8371.20 $ 7500 [$  16,000.00 [TB32/VB32PB 75.00 [ $ 16,000.00 | $78.00 $16,640.00

36 Tray, Food, Paper, poly lined/coated, 1/2 Ib, natural brown, packed 1000 ct 1000 05 64000 32 s 227$ 712.64 S 1609 514.88 |VBTHK 16.09 [ $ 514.88 [$27.50 $880.00
1000+

37 Tray, Food, Paper, poly lined/coated, 1/4 Ib, natural brown, packed 1000 ct 1000 05 64000 32 NO BID s 13a8$ 42176 [7125v8 1318 s 421.76 [NO BID
1000+

38 12 0z Bowl, round, black plastic, 4-5/8"x1-3/16" packed 500 ct. 500 ct 500 2 64000 256 NO BID S 7250 |$  18,560.00 [24013 7250 [ $ 18,560.00 [NO BID:

39 Lid to fit 12 0z bowl, clear plastic, flat, 4-5/8" packed 500 ct. 500 ct 500 2 64000 256 NO BID S 5500 [$  14,080.00 [24100 55.00 [ $ 14,080.00 [NO BID

40 Jr. Fry Scoop 3.5 0z - Red Plaid print, 4 x 3.75 x 3.375 x 1.938 (front) 10/100 ct 1000 05 64000 32 NO BID S 4000 [$  1,280.00 [8070 40.00 [ $ 1,280.00 [NO BID
15 v 1 (side)l nacked 10/100 et

41 Hinged Hot Dog, 400/ct 400 ct 400 05 64000 80 S 3437$ 2,749.60 |PACK SIZE S 3400[$  2720.00 [02452 34.00 [ $ 2,720.00 [NO BID

DIFFERENCE/FOAM ALTITEM VTH10008 PRICE $34 00

42 Large Sandwich Wedge, Hinged, clear plastic, 6-1/2"x3-3/8"x3- 500 ct 500 05 64000 64 s 7143 (s 2,571.52 |PACKSIZE DIFFERENCE. ALT| §  54.26 | $  3,472.64 | 21508/DVH1101 54.26 | S 3,472.64 | $55.60 $3,558.40
1/2"nacked S00 ct ITEM 4511019

43 Bowls/Food Containers, 8 0z Capacity, Round, white laminated 1000 ct 1000 10 64000 640 s 5027 $ 32,172.80 S SL12|$  32,716.80 |8820 5112 [ $ 32,716.80 [$65.45 $41,888.00
foam nacked 1000+

44 Bowls/Food Containers, 10 0z Capacity, Round, white laminated 1000 ct 1000 10 64000 640 S 5048 $ 32,307.20 S 5404 S 3458560 [10820 54.04 [ $ 34,585.60 [ $65.00 $41,600.00
foam nacked 1000+

45 Lid to it Bowls, 6 0z, 8 0z, 10 0z, & 12 oz Capacity, Round, clear 1000 ct 1000 10 64000 640 S 33.04[$ 21,145.60 [PACK SIZE DIFFERENCE S 7185 |$  45984.00 [20CLR 3250 [ $ 20,800.00 $40.90 $26,176.00
nlactic_nn vent nacked 1000 ct AIT ITEM 2011 PRICE 39 50

46 Foil Bags to fit sandwich/burger, white paper with foil lining, 1000 ct 1000 10 64000 640 NO BID S 5030 [$  32,192.00 [300533 50.30 [ $ 32,192.00 [NO BID
unnrinted 7" et withetand heat un t0 900E_nacked 1000 o+

47 Portion Cup, 5.5 oz Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant, 1000 ct 1000 3 64000 192 s 5001[$ 9,601.92 [PACKSIZE 4697 'S 9,018.24 |VBPCSS1PP 26.97 | $ 9,018.24 | $55.00 $10,560.00
nacked 2500 ot DIFFERENCE/2500CS

48 traditional spork kit 1000 ct 1000 B 64000 320 s 1438]$ 4,601.60 S 1345[$  4,304.00 [810001522 1345 [ § 4,304.00 [$17.15 $5,488.00

49 Sandwich bags, clear, fold over size 7x7 1/2000ct 2000 1 64000 32 s 725[$ 232.00 S 766($ 245.12 |HDO7 7.66 | S 245.12 [$8.90 $284.80

50 8 0z foam drink cup 1/1000 ct 2000 2 64000 64 S 2547]$ 1,630.08 S 2590[$  1,657.60 [8I8 2590 [ § 1,657.60 [$30.60 $1,958.40

51 4.0z styrofoam portion cup 1000 2 64000 128 s 2349[$ 3,006.72 S 2008[$ 372224 (46 2008 [ s 3,722.24 | $33.60 $4,300.80

52 125120 DART 1207 STYRO CONT500/CS 500 500 10 64000 1280 S 3023 [$ 38,694.40 s 3142[$  40,217.60 [125120 6212 [ $ 79,513.60 [$39.60 $50,688.00

AILTITEM 19R2) PRICE $62 19
53 300827 10.5X13 RED CHK FOIL4/500 2000 2000 05 64000 16 S 13621 $ 2,179.36 S 11665 S  1,866.40 |300827 116.65 | $ 1,866.40 [NO BID
54 7 3/4" Giant Red and White Striped Wrapped Straw’ 1000 1000 05 64000 32 S 6135[$ 1,963.20 S 8100[$  2592.00 [815T24 81.00 [ $ 2,592.00 | $49.95 $1,598.40
AWARDED VENDOR
TOTAL COST $  971,977.27 $ 1,201,174.03 $ 1,221,032.93 $ 1,174,915.82




Southwestern

I D E A Brady Plus | SUIf Coast Mmill
Paper Co. Distributors
~ Public Schools
REGION CAMPUS ADDRESS Y/N Y/N Y/N
IDEA QUEST 14001 N Rooth Edinburg Texas 78541
IDEA MISSION 1600 S Schuerbach Rd Mission Texas 78572
IDEA MCALLEN 201 N Bentsen Rd McAllen Texas 78501
Upper Rio Grande IDEA NORTH MISSION 2706 N Holland Ave Mission Texas 78572
Valley IDEA RIO GRANDE CITY 2803 W Monarch Ln Rio Grande City]Texas 78582 Y Y N
IDEA TRES LAGOS 5200 Tres Lagos Blvd McAllen Texas 78504
IDEA LOS ENCINOS 5400 S. Ware Rd McAllen Texas 78503
IDEA PALMVIEW 4100 N Schuerbach Rd Mission Texas 78572
IDEA LA JOYA 725 E. Expressway 83 La Joya Texas 78560
IDEA DONNA 401 S 1St St Donna Texas 78537
IDEA SAN JUAN 600 E Sioux Rd San Juan Texas 78589
IDEA PHARR 600 E Las Milpas Rd Pharr Texas 78577
Middle Rio Grande |IDEA ALAMO 325 E. Fm 495 Alamo Texas 78516 v Y N
Valley IDEA EDINBURG 2553 N Roegiers Rd Edinburg Texas 78541
IDEA TOROS COLLEGE PREP3300 E. Texas Road Edinburg Texas 78542
IDEA OWASSA 1000 E Owassa Rd Pharr Texas 78577
IDEA ELSA 420 S Fannin Elsa Texas 78543
IDEA FRONTIER 2800 S Dakota Ave Brownsville Texas 78521
IDEA SAN BENITO 2151 Russell Ln San Benito Texas 78586
IDEA WESLACO 2931 E Sugar Cane Drive Weslaco Texas 78599
Lower Rio Grande IDEA BROWNSVILLE 4395 Paredes Line Rd Brownsville Texas 78526
Valley IDEA WESLACO PIKE 1000 E Pike Blvd Weslaco Texas 78596 Y Y N
IDEA RIVERVIEW 30 Palm Blvd Brownsville Texas 78520
IDEA ROBINDALE 3802 Ruben M Torres Blvd Brownsville Texas 78520
IDEA HARLINGEN 24240 Chester Park Rd Harlingen Texas 78550




|iDEA SPORTS PARK l6650 01d Alice Rd IBrownsville  |texas 78520

IDEA CARVER 217 Robinson Pl San Antonio Texas 78202

IDEA MONTERREY PARK  |222 Sw 39Th St San Antonio  |Texas 78236

IDEA WALZEM 6445 Walzem Rd San Antonio Texas 78239

East San Antonio IDEA EASTSIDE 2519 Martin Luther King Dr  |San Antonio Texas 78220
IDEA JUDSON 13427 Judson Rd San Antonio Texas 78233

IDEA CONVERSE 5490 Fm 1516 N Converse Texas 78109

IDEA NAJIM 926 S Ww White Rd San Antonio Texas 78220

IDEA MAYS 1210 Horal Dr San Antonio Texas 78245

IDEA EWING HALSELL 2523 W Ansley Blvd San Antonio  |Texas 78224

IDEA SOUTH FLORES 6919 S Flores St San Antonio Texas 78221

West San Antonio IDEA BRACKENRIDGE 5555 Old Pearsall Rd San Antonio  |Texas 78242
IDEA INGRAM HILLS 3115 Majestic Dr San Antonio Texas 78228

IDEA BURKE 10434 Marbach Road San Antonio  |Texas 78245

IDEA HIDDEN MEADOW 10138 Culebra Road San Antonio Texas 78250

IDEA ROBINSON 10170 Kriewald Rd San Antonio  |Texas 78245

IDEA MONTOPOLIS 1701 Vargas Rd Austin Texas 78741

IDEA RUNDBERG 9504 N |h 35 Austin Texas 78753

IDEA BLUFF SPRINGS 1700 E Slaughter Ln Austin Texas 78747

Austin IDEA PFLUGERVILLE 1901 E Wells Branch Pkwy Pflugerville Texas 78660
IDEA KYLE 640 Philomena Dr Kyle Texas 78640

IDEA HEALTH PROFESSIONY5816 Wilcab Road Austin Texas 78721

IDEA PARMER PARK 1438 E Yager Lane Austin Texas 78753

IDEA ROUND ROCK 3301 Greenlawn Blvd Round Rock Texas 78664

IDEA RIO VISTA 211 N Rio Vista Rd Socorro Texas 79927

IDEA EDGEMERE 15101 Edgemere Blvd El Paso Texas 79938

El Paso IDEA MESA HILLS 405 Wallenberg El Paso Texas 79912
IDEA HORIZON VISTA 201 Horizon Crossing St Horizon City  |Texas 79928

IDEA MESQUITE HILLS 11881 Dyer S B El Paso Texas 79934

Permian Basin IDEA TRAVIS 900 E Gist Ave Midland Texas 79701
IDEA YUKON 7300 E Yukon Rd Odessa Texas 79762




IDEA HARDY 1930 Little York Road Houston Texas 77093

Greater Houston IDEA SPEARS 2010 Spears Road Houston Texas 77067
IDEA LAKE HOUSTON 5677 S Lake Houston Parkway|Houston Texas 77049
IDEA RISE 3000 S Cherry Ln Fort Worth Texas 76116
IDEA ACHIEVE 1900 Thomas Rd Haltom City Texas 76117

Tarrant County
IDEA EDGECLIFF 1640 Altamesa Blvd Fort Worth Texas 76134
IDEA SOUTHEAST 2935 Seminary Dr Fort Worth Texas 76119

Southern Dallas  |IDEA A.W. BROWN |5701 Red Bird Dr. |pallas |Texas 75237




