
Region (Texas): Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Upper Rio Grande Valley 224,574.00$                 GrandRiver Landscaping LLC
Lower Rio Grande Valley 205,821.00$                 GrandRiver Landscaping LLC
San Antonio 283,076.91$                 BrightView Landscape Services
Austin 190,061.56$                 BrightView Landscape Services
El Paso 153,951.39$                 Brilar
Tarrant County 103,334.26$                 BrightView Landscape Services

Houston 91,293.33$                   

Brilar
*According to Scope of Work in IFB #2-LAWN-
0523, vendor(s) will be awarded by region - Brilar 
is awarded in Houston based on ability to service 
all schools in region according to Bid Sheet.

Region (Louisiana): Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Baton Rouge - Bridge 37,653.82$                   Rotolo consultants, Inc.
Baton Rouge - Innovation 22,517.62$                   Brilar

Region (Ohio): Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Cincinnati - Price Hills 45,650.12$                   Brilar
Cincinnati - Valley View 13,200.00$                   Brilar

Region (Florida): Lowest Bid Amount: Intended Awarded Vendor:
Tampa - Hope 7,602.74$                     Brilar
Tampa - Victory Vinik 29,527.93$                   Brilar
Jacksonville - Bassett 23,939.98$                   Brilar
Jacksonville - River Bluff 9,751.40$                     Brilar



Alvarado's Maintenance 
Services

BrightView Landscape Services Brilar
GrandRiver Landscaping LLC 

(Upper/Lower RGV bid)

Jerry's Landscaping & 
Tree Trimming 

(UNRESPONSIVE: 
provided pricing per visit - 
did not price according to 

Scope)

*Maldonado's Nursery & 
Landscaping Inc.

Olympia Landscape 
Development 

South Texas Landscapes Irrigation 
& Pest Control (UNRESPONSIVE: 

provided pricing per hour, per tree, 
per square footage - did not price 

according to Scope)

Notes:

Lawn Maintenance 435,000.00$                                   260,931.80$                                    336,443.93$      174,594.00$                                    10,650.00$                            441,194.04$                                           478,800.00$                                  
*Maldonado's Nursery did not bid on San 
Juan CP, Sports Park, & Hardy. 

Tree Maintenance 18,000.00$                                     7,690.82$                                         8,276.66$           23,730.00$                                      1,890.00$                              19,357.82$                                              52,560.00$                                     
Irrigation System Maintenance 27,000.00$                                     43,598.65$                                      54,000.00$         14,070.00$                                      975.00$                                  63,092.88$                                              54,000.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion 60,000.00$                                     91,868.50$                                      114,736.74$      12,180.00$                                      1,532.00$                              211,128.70$                                           45,000.00$                                     
Total 540,000.00$                                  404,089.77$                                    513,457.33$      224,574.00$                                   15,047.00$                            734,773.44$                                           630,360.00$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 4 2 3 1 UNRESPONSIVE 6 5 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID 178,608.51$                                    308,277.81$      167,916.00$                                    8,090.00$                              346,418.71$                                           351,120.00$                                  
Tree Maintenance NO BID 5,863.99$                                         6,521.66$           18,060.00$                                      1,370.00$                              14,940.00$                                              38,544.00$                                     
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID 32,935.23$                                      39,600.00$         10,395.00$                                      685.00$                                  60,124.92$                                              39,600.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID 71,842.86$                                      119,096.68$      9,450.00$                                        1,245.00$                              171,159.23$                                           33,000.00$                                     
Total -$                                                 289,250.59$                                    473,496.15$      205,821.00$                                   11,390.00$                            592,642.86$                                           462,264.00$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 2 4 1 UNRESPONSIVE 5 3 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID 199,160.07$                                    243,485.16$      NO BID NO BID 332,257.70$                                           478,800.00$                                  
Tree Maintenance NO BID 5,515.54$                                         7,182.46$           NO BID NO BID 15,183.80$                                              52,560.00$                                     
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID 25,483.40$                                      54,000.00$         NO BID NO BID 47,506.56$                                              54,000.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID 52,917.90$                                      65,358.78$         NO BID NO BID 134,690.88$                                           45,000.00$                                     
Total -$                                                 283,076.91$                                    370,026.40$      -$                                                  -$                                        529,638.94$                                           630,360.00$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1 2 3 4 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID 129,324.94$                                    138,833.36$      NO BID NO BID 182,686.21$                                           255,360.00$                                  
Tree Maintenance NO BID 4,674.06$                                         4,095.01$           NO BID NO BID 12,190.14$                                              28,032.00$                                     
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID 25,755.64$                                      28,800.00$         NO BID NO BID 21,283.08$                                              28,800.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID 30,306.92$                                      26,763.42$         NO BID NO BID 147,082.25$                                           24,000.00$                                     
Total -$                                                 190,061.56$                                    198,491.79$      -$                                                  -$                                        363,241.68$                                           336,192.00$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1 2 4 3 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID NO BID 131,167.21$      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tree Maintenance NO BID NO BID 2,502.50$           NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID NO BID 18,000.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID NO BID 2,281.68$           NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total -$                                                 -$                                                   153,951.39$      -$                                                  -$                                        -$                                                          -$                                                 

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID 86,484.28$                                      74,360.04$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tree Maintenance NO BID 1,136.02$                                         1,695.41$           NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID 7,768.32$                                         14,400.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID 7,945.64$                                         27,668.35$         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total -$                                                 103,334.26$                                    118,123.80$      -$                                                  -$                                        -$                                                          -$                                                 

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1 2 UNRESPONSIVE

Lawn Maintenance NO BID 58,765.95$                                      63,707.63$         NO BID NO BID 56,039.28$                                              NO BID
Tree Maintenance NO BID 1,675.38$                                         910.00$              NO BID NO BID 1,875.30$                                                NO BID
Irrigation System Maintenance NO BID 8,760.99$                                         10,800.00$         NO BID NO BID 5,215.56$                                                NO BID
Fertilizer Applicataion NO BID 23,682.20$                                      15,875.70$         NO BID NO BID 12,297.25$                                              NO BID
Total -$                                                 92,884.52$                                      91,293.33$        -$                                                  -$                                        75,427.39$                                             -$                                                 

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 3 2 1 UNRESPONSIVE
GRAND TOTAL 540,000.00$                                  1,362,697.61$                                1,918,840.19$  430,395.00$                                   26,437.00$                            2,059,176.00$                              

IFB #2-LAWN-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Houston

Upper Rio Grande Valley

Lower Rio Grande Valley

San Antonio 

Austin

El Paso

Tarrant County



Rotolo Consultants, Inc. Brilar Vendor 3 Vendor 4
Jerry's Landscaping & Tree 

Trimming
Maldonado's Nursery & 

Landscaping Inc.
Olympia Landscape Development

South Texas Landscapes Irrigation & 
Pest Control

Notes:

Lawn Maintenance 24,364.05$                                  46,876.31$                                   
Tree Maintenance 1,196.34$                                    536.25$                                         
Irrigation System Maintenance 2,961.45$                                    3,600.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion 9,131.98$                                    5,085.42$                                     
Total 37,653.82$                                  56,097.98$                                   

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1 2

Lawn Maintenance 14,935.40$                                  14,778.77$                                   
Tree Maintenance 799.97$                                       135.42$                                         
Irrigation System Maintenance 2,970.40$                                    3,600.00$                                     
Fertilizer Applicataion 6,955.18$                                    4,003.43$                                     
Total 25,660.95$                                  22,517.62$                                   

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 2 1
Grand total 63,314.77$                                  78,615.60$                                   

IFB #2-LAWN-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Bridge

Innovation



Brilar Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Notes:

Lawn Maintenance 31,592.53$                                  
Tree Maintenance 498.33$                                       
Irrigation System Maintenance 3,600.00$                                    
Fertilizer Applicataion 9,959.26$                                    
Total 45,650.12$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Lawn Maintenance 8,555.38$                                    
Tree Maintenance 100.00$                                       
Irrigation System Maintenance 3,600.00$                                    
Fertilizer Applicataion 945.38$                                       
Total 13,200.76$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1
Grand total 58,850.88$                                  

IFB #2-LAWN-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Price Hills

Valley View



Brilar Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Notes:

Lawn Maintenance 26,820.00$                                  
Tree Maintenance 425.00$                                       
Irrigation System Maintenance 7,200.00$                                    
Fertilizer Applicataion 2,685.67$                                    
Total 37,130.67$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1

Lawn Maintenance 19,882.09$                                  
Tree Maintenance 419.58$                                       
Irrigation System Maintenance 7,200.00$                                    
Fertilizer Applicataion 6,189.71$                                    
Total 33,691.38$                                  

Rating 1-8 (1=lowest priced /8=highest priced) 1
Grand total 70,822.05$                                  

IFB #2-LAWN-0523
IFB does not merit evaluation criteria. Award will be based on lowest cost only.

Tampa

Jacksonville
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