IDEA

¥ Public Schools
#01-IFB-CNP-2021: Invitation for Bids for Solid Waste & Recycling Services
Frequency - Republic Texas Disposal Waste Frequency - Republic Texas Disposal Waste
Region Campus CNP Frontier K2 LLC Services Systems Management Facilities Frontier K2 LLC Services Systems Management

AUSTIN IDEA Montopolis 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | S 658.00 | $ 536.90
AUSTIN IDEA Bluff Springs 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90
AUSTIN IDEA Runberg 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | S 658.00 | $ 536.90
AUSTIN IDEA Kyle 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90
AUSTIN IDEA Pflugerville 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | S 658.00 | $ 536.90
AUSTIN IDEA Parmer ParK 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 4x weekly No Bid S 727.44 | S 543.00 | $ 429.56
AUSTIN IDEA Health Profess. 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 4x weekly No Bid S 727.44 | S 543.00 | $ 429.56
AUSTIN IDEA Round Rock 5x weekly No Bid S 909.30 | $ 658.00 | $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid S 571.56 | $ 434.00 | $ 322.14
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Brackenridge 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Robinson 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid S 44166 | $ 590.00 | $ 322.14
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Carver 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Eastside 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Ewing Halsell 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Judson 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Mays 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Monterrey Park 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Najim 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA South Flores 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Walzem 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Ingram Hills 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Burke 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 4x weekly No Bid S 588.88 | $ 736.00 | $ 429.52
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Hidden Meadow 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid S 44166 | $ 590.00 | $ 322.14
SAN ANTONIO IDEA Converse 5x weekly No Bid S 736.10 | $ 880.00 | $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid S 44166 | S 590.00 | $ 322.14
HOUSTON IDEA Spears 5x weekly S 888.52 | $ 631.95 No Bid $ 536.90 3x weekly S 533.11 | $ 390.45 No Bid $ 322.14
HOUSTON IDEA Hardy 5x weekly S 888.52 | $ 631.95 No Bid $ 536.90 3x weekly S 533.11 | $ 390.45 No Bid S 322.14
RIO GRANDE VALLEY IDEA Owassa 5x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid $ 536.90
RIO GRANDE VALLEY IDEA Quest 5x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid $ 536.90 5x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid S 536.90
RIO GRANDE VALLEY IDEA Harlingen 5x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid FRANCHISE No Bid $ 322.14
TARRANT COUNTY IDEA Achieve 5x weekly No Bid S 751.20 No Bid $ 536.90 4x weekly No Bid S 610.70 No Bid S 429.52
TARRANT COUNTY IDEA Rise 5x weekly No Bid S 751.20 No Bid $ 536.90 4x weekly No Bid S 610.70 No Bid $ 429.52
TARRANT COUNTY IDEA Edgecliff 5x weekly No Bid S 751.20 No Bid $ 536.90 3x weekly No Bid S 474.70 No Bid $ 322.14
EL PASO IDEA Rio Vista No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EL PASO IDEA Edgemere No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EL PASO IDEA Mesa Hills No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EL PASO IDEA Horizon Vista No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EL PASO IDEA Mesquite Hills No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




