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(In unit cases)
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Cost Part# Description Notes

1

Paper Dispenser Automatic Paper Towel Dispenser 
(free w/buying paper towels) 

Automatic (motion), battery powered, large 
roll capacity (350 length), Black colored, 
Approx. Dimensions 16x13x10

Unit 70 $79.69 $5,578.30
 WC-

WC0164BLK 

 WESTCRAFT ELECTRONIC 
HRT DISPENSER W/ STUB 

ROLL HOLDS UP TO 8" TOWEL 
TRANSLUCENT BLACK NO BID $0.00

2

paper towel roll Paper Towel Rolls to fit the above 
12/350

Must fit the above, at least 50% post 
consumer recycled, natural not bleached

Case 0 $35.89 $0.00  MC-W6800 
 UNIVERSAL ROLL TOWEL 
WHITE 800FT/RL 6RL/CS NO BID $0.00

3

Trash Can Trash can 32 Gallon, Blue Plastic, heavy duty, impact resistance, rodent 
and water proof, Blue in color and fade 
resistant, 32 gallon in size that can use a 
trash dolly wheel system Unit 280 $55.43 $15,520.40  RM-2632BLU 

 32GAL BRUTE CONTAINER 
BLUE $22.98 $6,434.40

5

Trash can 41 QT Rect W/B Plastic, heavy duty, impact resistance, rodent 
and water proof, Grey or Black in color and 
fade resistant, 41 qtr. in size Rectangle in 
shape Unit 70 $12.24 $856.80  IMP77035 

 Soft-Sided Wastebasket, 
Rectangular, Polyethylene, 41 

qt, Black $7.19 $503.30

6

Dust Pan  BLACK PLASTIC LOBBY DST PAN Dust pan for Lobby, 36in height, 3-5 qtr. 
capacity, black, hard plastic, light weight

Unit 70 $8.67 $606.90  IMP2600 

 LobbyMaster Plastic Dust 
Pan, 12w x 37h, Plastic, Black 

Pan/White Handle $7.99 $559.30

7

Cart 3 Shelf Three tier utility service Cart - 41 x 20 
x 38", Black

41 x 20 x 38", Black, durable plastic shelves, food 
safe, 450lb weight limit Min. replaceable castors 
and brakes. lightweight, dual handles, easy 
assembly Unit 70 $502.32 $35,162.40  RCP409100BLA 

 Open Sided Utility Cart, 
Three-Shelf, 40.63w x 20d x 

37.81h, Black NO BID $0.00

8

 Wet sign CAUTION WET FLOOR SIGN Plastic, bright safety yellow, OSHA & HD 
compliant, durable, and fade resistant

Unit 70 $7.95 $556.50  IMP9152W 
 Bilingual Yellow Wet Floor 
Sign, 12.05 x 1.55 x 24.3 $6.99 $489.30

9

Smartmop MD400 SMARTMOP MICROMOP 
7.0 GRN/WHITE 5/PK

Replaceable mop heads for table cleaning 
system, must work with the above system

Unit 140 $19.21 $2,689.40  UG-MD400 
 SMARTMOP MICROMOP 
GREEN/WHITE 5EA/CS 

 Price is for Eaches not 
cs / Must order in 
multiples of 5 per 

location $11.99 $1,678.60

10

 HANDI HANDLE 
5/CS

HH240 HENRY'S HANDI HANDLE 
5/CS

Extruded aluminum, nylon handle, lightweight 
durability and ergonomic grip, locking cone with 
press fit, screw fit or snap fit. 24 inch long

Unit 70 $22.07 $1,544.90  HH240 
 Extension Pole, Silver, 

Green, 24 in. 

 Price is for Eaches not 
cs / Must order in 
multiples of 5 per 

location NO BID $0.00

11

Mopholder SM40G SMARTCOLOR 
MOPHOLDER 5/CS

Flat mop holder with pivoting, low-profile head. 
Telescoping handle, color gray.  Diameter 16' 
handle length 96, Polypropylene 

Unit 70 $64.05 $4,483.50  UG-SM40G 
 16" SMART COLOR MOP 

HOLDER 5EA/CS 

 Price is for Eaches not 
cs / Must order in 
multiples of 5 per 

location $34.99 $2,449.30

12

Dolly Blue LID mobility and maneuverability of heavy loads.  
Heavy-duty wheels w/swivel. Plastic, resists rust, 
chipping and denting. Hold up to 350lb. color-black 
must fit the above trash cans. 

Unit 280 $33.38 $9,346.40  CN-3255 

 HUSKEE ROUND 
RECEPTACLE DOLLY BLACK 

1/EA $19.98 $5,594.40

13

Lids DARK BLUE STANDARD DUTY 1/2 
CU YD TILT TRUCK

available to fit 32, 44 gallon containers, Meets NSF 
2.21/ USDA. Self-draining, prevent water from 
pooling, reducing still water buildup. never fade, 
warp, crack or crush Unit 280 $18.29 $5,121.20  RM-2017965 

 32GAL BRUTE LID OPEN TOP 
BLUE 6EA/CS NO BID $0.00

14

 Tilt Mop Bucket Standards duty plastic tilt 1/2 Cu. Yd. Cap, 850, 
blue.  Two 9" roller rubber wheel, and Two 4' 
rubber swivel casters.  Push handle, trash bags 
hooks, and lift handle.

Unit 70 $723.69 $50,658.30  RM-1304BLA 

 1/2 CU YD TILT 
TRUCK,UTILITY DUTY 

(ROTATIONAL MOLDED)-
BLACK 1/CS $699.98 $48,998.60

15

 Mop Bucket Mop Bucket:  7588BL Mop and wringer system, tubular steel ans 
Structural web molded plastic. Length: 20.1 in 51.1 
cm Width 15.7 in 39.9cm Height: 36 1/2 in 92.7cm  
Blue in Color

Unit 70 $51.33 $3,593.10

 
BWK2635COMB

OYEL 

 Pro-Pac Side-Squeeze 
Wringer/Bucket Combo, 

8.75 gal, Yellow $81.98 $5,738.60

BID TAB: 06-IFB-CNP-2122 Janitorial Supplies
Pyramid School Products                                                                                  

6510 N. 54th St. Tampa, FL. 33610                                                               
Kenneth Ritler 800-792-2644 xtn. 225  

biddept@pyramidsp.com

Competitive Choice, Inc.                                                                                   
9303 Kirby Dr. Houston, TX. 77235                                                                

Julia Suan 713-838-1144  bids@competitivechoice.net
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16

Squeeges Wipe'n 18 in. Dry Floor Squeegee 
with 53 inc. handle

Cell foam rubber blade, clean grout, bricks, or tile. 
blade length: 18 inch , handle lenght:5 ft, product 
height 54 in, handle aluminum and head steel

Unit 70 $39.87 $2,790.90
 MD-60252024 & 

AB-T08114 

 24" STEEL H-DUTY FLOOR 
SQUEEGEE & FIBERGLASS 

THREADED HANDLE 
54"X15/16" BLUE 12/BDL NO BID $0.00

17

Angled Broom  ANGLER BROOM (WOOD 
HANDLE) V-- ANGLE

Sturdy plastic bristles, 53" wood handle, 
Angled cut, Brush length: 13 in

Unit 140 $7.95 $1,113.00
 OD-

MATF11601M 
 MAXI SLANT ANGLE BROOM, 

YELLOW, 6/CS $4.98 $697.20

18

High Duster - For 
AC vents, and Hood

Extendable duster pole 30 inch to 100 inch. 
Bendable head, Detachable pole, washable 
material.

Unit 70 $7.91 $553.70 LS-S82EPPD

 EXTENDABLE SYNTHETIC 
DUSTER 82" W/ FLEXIBLE 

HEAD #S83EPPD 72/CS $5.99 $419.30

19

Deck Brush (Scrub 
Brush) to scrub 
kitchen floors

Stiff crimped polypropylene bristles 60' wood 
handle 

Unit 70 $9.76 $683.20
 LW-610 & AB-

01102 

 10" POLY DECK SCRUB 
BRUSH BLUE CRIMPED 12/CS 

& 60" THREADED WOOD 
HANDLE 12/CS EA  $6.99 $489.30

20

Scraper for Gum on 
café tables

Heavy Duty floor Scraper 48in long.  Stainless steel 
blade, remove debris and other caked on deposit 
on floor. Steel tube with aluminum head, Angled 
head, replacement 4 in blades Unit 70 $32.19 $2,253.30 UG-LH12C

 48" LONG HANDLE SCRAPER 
1/EA $7.99 $559.30

Notes:  Vendor provided price for all items requested Notes:  Vendor responded with pricinf for 14 of the 20 items 
requested

Estimated Yearly Spend $143,112.20 $74,610.90
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