
Item Description Case Size
Annual Quantities 

Requested LA
Unit Price Extended Price Notes Unit Price Extended Price Notes

1 Parchment Baking Paper/Liner Sheet, to fit 16"x26" sheet pans,
white, packed 1000 ct.

1000 80 44.09$                  3,527.20$                DPI-QPL-25 40.75$            3,260.00$                

2 Plastic Film, 24" PVC Cling Film, in dispenser box with serrated
edge, packed 2000 ft.

1/2000 ft 48 17.63$                  846.24$                   IG-FSW2402K 25.56$            1,226.88$                

3 Plastic Film, 12" PVC Cling Film, in dispenser box with serrated
edge, packed 2000 ft

1/2000 ft 26 8.81$                     229.06$                   IG-FSW1202K 12.75$            331.50$                   

4 Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheets, 9"x10-3/4" packed 6/500ct. 6/500 ct 80 47.73$                  3,818.40$                IG-FS9-6PK 97.79$            7,823.20$                

5 Aluminum Foil, heavy weight, .001 gauge, 24", in dispenser box with serrated edge, packed 
1000 ft/roll.

1/ 1000 ft 48 68.38$                  3,282.24$                IG-AWF24X1000 132.50$         6,360.00$                

6 Aluminum Foil, heavy weight, .001 gauge, 12", in dispenser box with serrated edge, packed 
1000 ft/roll.

1/ 1000 ft 26 43.47$                  1,112.83$                WP-222 26.13$            668.93$                   

7 Beard Cover, nylon, black, packed 200 ct. 1/100 ct 3 1.748$                  5.59$                        TI-BRD1000 (SOLD BY CASE - 10/100) 4.73$              15.14$                     

8 Bag for Ice, clear, unprinted, drawstring closure, poly, 10 lb
capacity, packed 1000 ct

1/1000 ct 3 49.80$                  159.36$                   LK-H19PDS (PRINTED; PK 500) 83.75$            268.00$                   

9 Brown Hair Net 100/ct 10 bags / cs 10/100 ct 80 52.90$                  4,232.00$                CEL-K220HNBR 13.92$            1,113.60$                

10 Bouffant Cap, 24", white, fire retardant, packed 100 ct 100 ct 3 2.733$                  8.75$                        CEL-BIX4B (SOLD BY CASE - 10/100) 28.42$            90.94$                     

11 Bun Rack Covers, plastic, 52"x80", minimum .0005 mil, packed 50
ct

50 ct 80 10.04$                  803.20$                   IG-BUNRACK5280 20.23$            1,618.40$                

12 Gloves - Black or Blue - Small, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly
textured, wrist length, packed 100 ct.

10/100ct 10 3.52$                     35.20$                     IG-GL-SMALL 89.90$            899.00$                   

13 Gloves - Black or Blue - Medium, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly
textured, wrist length, packed 100 ct.

10/100ct 64 3.52$                     225.28$                   IG-GL-MED 89.90$            5,753.60$                

14 Gloves - Black or Blue - LARGE  food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly
textured, wrist length, packed 100 ct.

10/100ct 80 3.52$                     281.60$                   IG-GL-LG 89.90$            7,192.00$                

15 Gloves - Black or Blue - Extra Large, food handling, single use, clear, plastic, poly
textured, wrist length, packed 100 ct.

10/100ct 64 3.52$                     225.28$                   IG-GL-XLG 89.90$            5,753.60$                

16 10403 Heavy Duty White plastic Aprons 28X46 5/100 5/100 32 32.62$                  1,043.84$                TI-P28462/5 6.63$              212.16$                   

17 DP657 6.5X7 SADDLE SANDWICH BAGS 2000/CS 2000 160 7.64$                     1,222.40$                LK-DP657 17.62$            2,819.20$                

18 510161 6X9 GRN MED DTY SCRUB 3/20 60/cs 22 13.53$                  303.07$                   ACS-S096 (PK 6/10) 16.75$            375.20$                   

19 HR243308N 24X33 8MC  HI-D CAN LINERS 20/50 100/cs 40 21.65$                  866.00$                   BP-HR243308N 21.61$            864.40$                   

20 PGR40X46 BLACK 1.5MIL LINERS 10/10 100/cs 360 21.70$                  7,812.00$                BerryBP-PGR4046X3B 85.56$            30,801.60$              

21 89460 ENMOTION WHT HI-CAPACITY ROLL TOWEL 6/800' 6/cs 80 69.60$                  5,568.00$                GP-89460 (PK 6/800') 88.42$            7,073.60$                
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22 Bags, Freezer, Gallon Size 10 9/16 X 10 3/4 , 200 / case 200 ct 19 21.16$                  406.27$                   IG-GFRZIP-GAL (PK 250) 36.61$            702.91$                   

23 Bags, Freezer, Quart Size, Zipper Seal 19 20.07$                  385.34$                   IG-GFRZIP-QT (PK 500) 30.03$            576.58$                   

1 Lunch Tray, 5 Compartment, laminated foam, BLACK, 8.25"x10.25", must withstand heat up to 
200F, break resistant, FDA approved, meets Food Grade HACCP certification, packed 500 ct

500 1000 23.51$                  23,510.00$              PT-YTHB0500SGBX 37.58$            37,580.00$              

2 9" Square Hinged Foam Container, 3 Compartment, , break resistant, FDA approved, meets
Food Grade HACCP certification

150 ct 256 15.23$                  3,898.88$                PT-YTD1-9903ECN 33.38$            8,545.28$                

3 Large 1 Compartment Hinged, clear plastic, perimeter seal, snap
closure, opening tabs with slip resistant grip, 8-7/8"x9-3/8"x3"

200 ct 32 47.00$                  1,504.00$                DA-C95PST1 74.59$            2,386.88$                

4 5" Square Hinged clear, Container, 1 Compartment, white, break resistant, FDA approved, 
meets Food Grade HACCP certification, packed 500 ct.

500 ct 32 43.29$                  1,385.28$                DA-C53PST1 40.31$            1,289.92$                

5 Flatware Banquet Pack: individually wrapped full size, heavyweight fork, spoon, 5-3/4" straw, 
and 2-ply 13"x13" white napkin, made from polypropylene or polystyrene plastic, break 

500 1000 45.25$                  45,250.00$              MAX-4615-50-B -$                -$                          NO BID

6 Flatware Fork KIT W/ BLACK FORK AND 13X17 NAPKIN 1000 ct 256 45.34$                  11,607.04$              MAX-609F-B4 -$                -$                          NO BID

7 Bags for Sack Lunch, paper, brown/kraft, with gusset, Heavy Duty,
6 lb. 4/ 250 ct

4/250 ct 64 19.37$                  1,239.68$                DU-70206 (PK 400) 15.44$            988.16$                   

8 POLY BAGS 6x3x12500/CS 500 800 15.06$                  12,048.00$              LK-7G063015 (6X3X15 - PK 1000) 11.75$            9,400.00$                

9 Plastic Drink Cup, 9 oz Capacity, clear, squat 1/ 1000 ct 64 43.32$                  2,772.48$                DA-TP9R 91.44$            5,852.16$                

10 10.5" PFAS Free Compostable Fiber Blend 3-Compartment Round School Lunch Tray 500ct 640 51.99$                  33,273.60$              DA-10FBRP3 87.20$            55,808.00$              

11 Portion tray, 10 oz Offer vs Servem, plastic ivex 1000 100 37.43$                  3,743.00$                PAR-21746 (PK 1125) 78.45$            7,845.00$                

12 Bento Box, clear plastic, 4 compartment 1000 32 64.89$                  2,076.48$                DA-SBTG4 (PK 300) 108.75$         3,480.00$                

13 Flatware Soup spoon kit w/ spoon and napkin 1000 64 21.16$                  1,354.24$                WAL-3604 (INCLUDES STRAW) -$                -$                          NO BID

14 VERSAtainer 12 oz. Oval PP Container and Lid 500ct 100 21.75$                  2,175.00$                KAR-MT6110B (PK 150) 71.70$            7,170.00$                

15 Biodegradeable 5 compartment school lunch tray 500ct 640 49.38$                  31,603.20$              WAL-USP-MFST-5 37.58$            24,051.20$              

16 CR-815B BLACK 16OZ CONTAINERW/LID 7X4.85X1.5 150/CS 150 96 33.20$                  3,187.20$                KAR-SR8168B (PK 150) 98.69$            9,474.24$                

17 4oz Offer vs Serve Deep Tray, black, plastic, 3-1/2"x3-1/2"x1-1/4",
7.5 mil, packed 2500 ct

1 / 2500 ct 704 51.29$                  36,108.16$              PAR-29427 133.69$         94,117.76$              

18 Souffle/portion Cup Lids To 4 Oz Cups, Clear, 2400/carton 1/ 2400 ct 576 27.96$                  16,104.96$              DA-PL4N (PK 2500) 75.91$            43,724.16$              

19 PET Cup Inserts PF35C1 SINGLE COMPARTMENT CUP INSERT 10/1000 ct 80 57.84$                  4,627.20$                DA-PF35C1 127.03$         10,162.40$              

20 Plastic Drink Cup, 12 oz Capacity, clear, packed 1000 ct. 1/ 1000 ct 0 51.96$                  51.96$                     DA-TP12 58.73$            -$                          NO BID

21 Lid to fit 12 oz Clear Plastic Drink Cup listed above, clear, flat, without straw slot, packed 1000 
ct

1/ 1000 ct 80 25.82$                  2,065.60$                DA-662TP 30.45$            2,436.00$                

22 Lid to fit 9 oz Clear Plastic Drink Cup , clear, flat, without straw slot,
packed 1000 ct

1/ 1000 ct 26 25.82$                  660.99$                   DA-662TP 113.16$         2,896.90$                

23 Portion Cups, 2oz, Translucent, 10/250 ct 128 20.67$                  2,645.76$                DA-P200N 194.30$         24,870.40$              

24 PET Plastic Soufflé Portion Cup Lids 2 OZ. 128 20.37$                  2,607.36$                DA-PL200N (PK 2500) 52.66$            6,740.48$                

25 Portion Cup, 1 oz Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant,
packed 2500 ct.

2500 ct 2 17.98$                  28.77$                     DA-P100N 21.53$            34.45$                     

26 Lid to fit 1 oz Portion Cup, clear, plastic, snap closure, packed 2500
ct

2500 ct 2 13.73$                  21.97$                     DA-PL100N 18.20$            29.12$                     
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27 Portion Cup, 4 oz Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant 2500 ct 2 38.45$                  61.52$                     DA-P400N 89.73$            143.57$                   

28 Lid to fit 4 oz Portion Cup, clear, plastic, snap closure, packed 2500
ct.

2500 ct 2 27.96$                  44.74$                     DA-PL4N (PK 2500) 75.91$            121.46$                   

29 8 oz Offer vs Serve, clear plastic, 4-15/1"x3-5/16"x1-5/8", 12.5 mil, packed 1000 ct. 1000 ct 360 32.63$                  11,746.80$              PAR-21878 120.86$         43,509.60$              

30 Bags to fit sandwich/burger, brown/natural paper, unprinted, with clear window, 
approximately 5"x7", economical choice for hot and

2000 ct 48 70.84$                  3,400.32$                DPI-BSN65285 (6.5 X 2 X 8.5 - PK 1000) 116.62$         5,597.76$                

31 Foil Cushion Wrap for Sandwiches/Burgers, no design or logo, for
food handling to resist grease and moisture, approximately 12"x12"

1000 64 59.84$                  3,829.76$                WP-5532 (10.5 X 14 - PK 2000) 57.06$            3,651.84$                

32 Bags to fit sandwich/burger, Foil/Paper Honeycomb Insulated
Wrap, 13" Length x 10-1/2" Width, Blue Check , must withstand heat up to 200&#8304, 

2/1000 ct 64 86.00$                  5,504.00$                BA-300829 112.90$         7,225.60$                

33 12 oz.  Compostable Soup Containers 1000 ct 80 40.54$                  3,243.20$                DA-12BFBRR 61.36$            4,908.80$                

34 Round Clear Lid-32 oz. PRIMEWARE, 300 300 ct 32 52.93$                  1,693.76$                RP-TBL-32 79.10$            2,531.20$                

35 TAN BOWL-32 OZ. PRIMEWARE 300 300 ct 96 43.63$                  4,188.48$                RP-TB-32 120.16$         11,535.36$              

36 Tray, Food, Paper, poly lined/coated, 1/2 lb, natural brown, packed
1000 ct.

1000 ct 64 16.51$                  1,056.64$                SQP-7150 20.66$            1,322.24$                

37 Tray, Food, Paper, poly lined/coated, 1/4 lb, natural brown, packed
1000 ct.

1000 ct 64 15.28$                  977.92$                   SQP-7140 17.82$            1,140.48$                

38 12 oz Bowl, round, black plastic, 4-5/8"x1-3/16" packed 500 ct. 500 ct 160 43.16$                  6,905.60$                DA-B12SB (PK 504) 60.23$            9,636.80$                

39 Lid to fit 12 oz bowl, clear plastic, flat, 4-5/8" packed 500 ct. 500 ct 6 37.09$                  237.38$                   DA-C816BDL (PK 504) 46.84$            299.78$                   

40 Jr. Fry Scoop 3.5 oz - Red Plaid print, 4 x 3.75 x 3.375 x 1.938 (front)
1.5 x 1 (side), packed 10/100 ct.

10/100 ct 13 39.68$                  507.90$                   SQP-8070 85.91$            1,099.65$                

41 Hinged Hot Dog, 400/ct 400 ct 16 24.31$                  388.96$                   DA-72HT1 (PK 500) 54.23$            867.68$                   

42 Large Sandwich Wedge, Hinged, clear plastic, 6-1/2"x3-3/8"x3-
1/8"packed 500 ct

500 ct 16 63.44$                  1,015.04$                PAR-21508 72.28$            1,156.48$                

43 Bowls/Food Containers, 8 oz Capacity, Round, white laminated
foam, packed 1000 ct

1000 ct 200 50.12$                  10,024.00$              DA-8B20 77.65$            15,530.00$              

44 Bowls/Food Containers, 10 oz Capacity, Round, white laminated
foam, packed 1000 ct

1000 ct 160 61.18$                  9,788.80$                DA-10B20 80.68$            12,908.80$              

45 Lid to fit Bowls, 6 oz, 8 oz, 10 oz, & 12 oz Capacity, Round, clear
plastic, no vent, packed 1000 ct.

100 ct 80 34.30$                  2,744.00$                DA-20JL (PK 1000) 48.50$            3,880.00$                

46 Foil Bags to fit sandwich/burger, white paper with foil lining,
unprinted, approximately 7"x7", must withstand heat up to 200F, packed 1000 ct

1000 ct 32 47.03$                  1,504.96$                DPI-BSF6765 82.88$            2,652.16$                

47 Portion Cup, 5.5 oz Capacity, clear, plastic, durable, crack resistant,
packed 2500 ct.

1000 ct 100 52.11$                  5,211.00$                DA-P550N (PK 2500) 60.93$            6,093.00$                

48 traditional spork kit 1000 ct 800 14.10$                  11,280.00$              WAL-6408 - PUNCTURE STRAW 23.45$            18,760.00$              

49 Sandwich bags, clear, fold over size 7x7 1/2000ct 2 7.47$                     11.95$                     LK-HD07 17.62$            28.19$                     

50 8 oz foam drink cup 1/1000 ct 30 28.19$                  845.70$                   DA-8J8 44.27$            1,328.10$                

51 4 oz styrofoam portion cup 0 32 30.92$                  989.44$                   DA-4J6 (PK 1000) 38.50$            1,232.00$                

52 12SJ20 DART 12OZ STYRO CONT500/CS 500 32 33.36$                  1,067.52$                DA-12SJ20 46.91$            1,501.12$                

53 300827 10.5X13 RED CHK FOIL4/500 2000 16 86.00$                  1,376.00$                BA-300827 218.15$         3,490.40$                

54 Tray, Food, Paper Board, .5 LB Clay Coated White & Red Checkered 4/250 ea. 40  $                  16.75 670.00$                   SQP-8708  $           20.66 826.40$                   

372,265.36$        607,661.40$        Total Bid Cost


