
Product Name Product Description Estimated 
Quantity

Unit Price
Brand/ 

Manufacturer
Unit Price

Brand/ 
Manufacturer

Unit Price

Apron

Apparel: Apron, Standard Bib, high bib front, poly/cotton blend,  wrinkle 
and soil-resistant fabric, one size fits most 35"L x 30"W, Color: Black, 
Happy Chef item # 1435 or equal.

750

5.85$          
Uncommon 
Threads 9.72$        

Happy Chef
1435 9.58$          

Pants

Apparel: Pants, Classic Unisex Baggy, poly/cotton blend, wrinkle and soil 
resistant, elastic waistband, drawstring, zipper fly, 2" hem, sizes XS-XL, 
Color - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # HC10 or equal.

1500

19.20$        
Uncommon 
Threads 27.50$      

Happy Chef
HC10 18.70$        

Pants

Apparel: Pants, Classic Unisex Baggy, poly/cotton blend, wrinkle and soil 
resistant, elastic waistband, drawstring, zipper fly, 2" hem, size 2XL, 
Color - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # HC10 or equal.

EA

22.15$        
Uncommon 
Threads 29.50$      

Happy Chef
HC10 20.70$        

Collared Shirts

Apparel: Top, Broadcloth Shirt, Men's long sleeve, button front, 
poly/cotton blend, wrinkle and soil-resistant, stay collar, chest pocket, 
sizes S-XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # 
N513 or equal.

80

16.15$        Edwards 23.45$      
Happy Chef
N513 14.90$        

Collared Shirts

Apparel: Top, Broadcloth Shirt, Men's long sleeve, button front, 
poly/cotton blend, wrinkle and soil-resistant, stay collar, chest pocket, 
size 2XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # N513 
or equal.

EA

19.15$        Edwards 25.45$      
Happy Chef
N513 16.90$        

Collared Shirts

Apparel: Top, Broadcloth Shirt, Women's long sleeve, button front, 
poly/cotton blend, wrinkle and soil-resistant, stay collar, narrow reverse 
placket, sizes S-XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef 
item # N613 or equal.

120

16.15$        Edwards 23.45$      
Happy Chef
N613 14.92$        

Mens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Men's short sleeve, 3-button boxed 
placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, poly/cotton micro pique 
knit, sizes S-XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # 
N560 or equal.

770

11.90$        Sanmar 21.16$      
Happy Chef
N560 12.90$        

Mens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Men's short sleeve, 3-button boxed 
placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, poly/cotton micro pique 
knit, size 2XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # 
N560 or equal.

120

14.20$        Sanmar 23.16$      
Happy Chef
N560 14.90$        

Mens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Men's short sleeve, 3-button boxed 
placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, poly/cotton micro pique 
knit, size 3XL, Color: Solid - list all colors available, Happy Chef item # 
N560 or equal.

80

16.80$        Sanmar 24.16$      
Happy Chef
N560 15.90$        

Womens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Women's short sleeve, 4-button 
narrow reverse placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, 
poly/cotton micro pique knit, sizes XS-XL, Color: Solid - list all colors 
available, Happy Chef item # N660 or equal.

120

11.90$        Sanmar 21.16$      
Happy Chef
N660 12.90$        

Womens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Women's short sleeve, 4-button 
narrow reverse placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, 
poly/cotton micro pique knit, size 2XL, Color: Solid - list all colors 
available, Happy Chef item # N660 or equal.

1000

14.20$        Sanmar 23.16$      
Happy Chef
N660 14.90$        

Womens polo

Apparel: Top, Micro Pique Knit Polo, Women's short sleeve, 4-button 
narrow reverse placket, knit collar, rib cuffs, bottom/side vents, 
poly/cotton micro pique knit, size 3XL, Color: Solid - list all colors 
available, Happy Chef item # N660 or equal.

100

16.70$        Sanmar 24.16$      
Happy Chef
N660 16.90$        

Mens footwear

Footwear: Slip- and oil-resistant, Manmade materials upper, non-
marking rubber sole with grip, Men's sizes, list all styles and sizes 
available, safeTstep by Payless brand or equal.

250

39.50$        Genuine Grip 58.44$      
Happy Chef
GG2060 35.00$        

Women's footwear

Footwear: Slip- and oil-resistant, Manmade materials upper, non-
marking rubber sole with grip, Women's sizes, list all styles and sizes 
available, safeTstep by Payless brand or equal.

500

39.50$        Genuine Grip 58.44$      
Happy Chef
GG260 35.00$        

Embroidery 5.35$          EA 5.00$        EA

$5.00
$3.90
$3.50

Delivery/Shipping

Freight included in cost

96,006.85$                                  

Total Cost

Logo Embroidery

Can deliver to all locations Can deliver to all locationsDelivery to all locations Can deliver to all locations

 $5,000.00
individual freight TBD at time of 
order 

$                                   146,180.40$                           

Free shipping

Uniforms #04-IFB-CNP-2223
Concept Uniform Co. Empire Printing LLC Fort Worth Promo dba 

Just Right Products

Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3



Brand/ 
Manufacturer

Unit Price
Brand/ 

Manufacturer
Unit Price

Brand/ 
Manufacturer

Unit Price Brand/ Manufacturer Unit Price Brand/ Manufacturer Unit Price

6.12$                Chef Designs by Vf 9.95$       Happy Chef 8.95$                       HC 7.90$                      
Redkap
1430 9.95$           

21.58$              Red Kap by VF 22.95$     Happy Chef
 $22.50
$24.50 

HC
HC 24.99$                    

Redkap
5360
Black 24.95$        

23.58$              Red Kap by VF 24.95$     Happy Chef
 $24.50
$26.50 

HC
HC 26.50$                    

Redkap
5360
Black 27.95$        

W80V
LW808 16.45$              Edwards 20.95$     Happy Chef

 $29.95
$21.50 

HC
Port Authority W100 27.50$                    

Redkap
SR70
Blue 25.95$        

18.45$              Edwards 22.95$     Happy Chef
 $37.45
$24.50 

HC
Port Authority W100 38.50$                    

Redkap
SR70
Blue 28.95$        

LW100
LW108 16.45$              Edwards 20.95$     Happy Chef

 $29.95
$21.50 

HC
Port Authority LW100 27.49$                    

Redkap
SR71
Blue 25.95$        

11.25$              Port Authority 19.95$     Happy Chef
 $26.95
$15.00 

HC
Port Authority K100 17.25$                    

Sportek
ST650
18 colors 19.95$        

KP158 13.25$              Port Authority 21.95$     Happy Chef
 $32.95
$17.15 

HC
Port Authority K100 21.99$                    

Sportek
ST650
18 colors 22.95$        

14.25$              Port Authority 22.95$     Happy Chef
 $32.95
$21.15 

HC
Port Authority K100 22.95$                    

Sportek
ST650
18 colors 24.95$        

LKP155 11.25$              Port Authority 19.95$     Happy Chef
 $26.95
$15.00 

HC
Port Authority L100 17.25$                    

Sportek
LST650
9 colors 19.95$        

LKP155 13.25$              Port Authority 21.95$     Happy Chef
 $32.95
$17.15 

HC
Port Authority L100 21.75$                    

Sportek
LST650
9 colors 22.95$        

LKP158 14.25$              Port Authority 22.95$     Happy Chef
 $32.95
$21.50 

HC
Port Authority L100 21.75$                    

Sportek
LST650
9 colors 24.95$        

32.00$              
Payless or Similar
Steel Lite NO BID N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID

32.00$              
Payless or Similar
Steel Lite NO BID N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID

Emblem
Healthy kids Patch
IDEA Patch

$4.00
$3.00

Healthy kids logo
IDEA logo 9.00$       PER UNIT 7.50$                       EA 5.99$                      EA

$8.95
$17.95

$8.95

Vendor 6 Vendor 7 Vendor 8
Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies

Option 1 & 2

TBD at time of order 4,995.00$                                                                

 $114,023.00 Uniforms only Option 1
$ 81,162.50 Uniforms only Option 2 

Can deliver to all locations

 $141,168.00 w/ shipping Option 1
$109,707.50 w/ shipping Option 2
includes estimated logo quantities 

Included w/ minimum order $250

91,263.00$                                                           $                                     94,875.87$                                           

3.5% (91,667.50) = $3,208.37

Can deliver to all locations Can deliver to all locationsCan deliver to all locations Can deliver to all locations Can deliver to all locations

Included in unit cost
individual freight TBD at time of 

95,598.40$                                    

Specialty Advertisers Happy ChefAce Promotions BranditFort Worth Promo dba 
Just Right Products

Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor 5



Brand/ 
Manufacturer

Unit Price Brand/ Manufacturer Unit Price
Brand/ 

Manufacturer
Unit Price

Brand/ 
Manufacturer

HAPPY CHEF 11.00$        
Port Authority
A520 4.90$         ADI N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF 17.40$        WW5058 18.80$      

Black, White
Blk/White Check
Chef Design N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF 19.10$        WW5058 18.80$      Chef Design N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF 21.00$        
Port Authority
S663 14.72$      

Red Kap
Black, Burgundy, 
Khaki, Lt. Blue, 
Navy, Royal, Red, 
White N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF 22.00$        
Port Authority
S663 14.72$      

Red Kap
Black, Burgundy, 
Khaki, Lt. Blue, 
Navy, Royal, Red, 
White N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF 21.00$        
Port Authority
L663 14.72$      

Red Kap
Black, Burgundy, 
Khaki, Lt. Blue, 
Navy, Royal, Red, 
White N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

 $13.00
$13.50
$13.50
$14.00
$20.50 

Sport-Tek ST550
Port Authority K100
Port & Company KP155
Port Authority K540
Corner Stone CS412 9.79$         Port Authority N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

 $14.00
$14.50
$15.00
$15.00
$21.50 

Sport-Tek ST550
Port Authority K100
Port & Company KP155
Port Authority K540
Corner Stone CS412 11.19$      Port Authority N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

 $16.00
$16.50
$16.00
$17.00
$23.50 

Sport-Tek ST550
Port Authority K100
Port & Company KP155
Port Authority K540
Corner Stone CS412 13.99$      Port Authority N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

$13.00
$13.50
$13.50
$20.50

Sport-Tek LST550
Port Authority L100
Port & Company LKP155
Corner Stone CS413 9.79$         Port Authority N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

$14.00
$14.50
$15.00
$21.50

Sport-Tek LST550
Port Authority L100
Port & Company LKP155
Corner Stone CS413 11.19$      Port Authority N/A N/A

HAPPY CHEF

$16.00
$16.50
$16.00
$23.50

Sport-Tek LST550
Port Authority L100
Port & Company LKP155
Corner Stone CS413 13.99$      Port Authority N/A N/A

N/A N/A N/A N/A 66.50$          
Fila
1SGW0002-001

N/A N/A N/A N/A 66.50$          
Fila
5SG30002-001

Up to 5K stitches
Healthy kids logo
IDEA logo Included in Price 4.50$         EA N/A N/A

1.00$         Per Shipped Item

Vendor 11Vendor 8 Vendor 9 Vendor 10

49,875.00$                                 

Shipping included in the cost

High End Advertisement Mission Linen Supply

58,583.10$                                 $69,750.00 Approx.

750.00$                                                            

Work Wear Safety

Can deliver to all locationsCan deliver to all locations
98,028.00$                                      

Can deliver to all locations Can deliver to all locations

Included in unit cost

Happy Chef


