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Price  Product No. 

Catalog 
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1 Pen
BIC Round Stic Xtra-Life Ballpoint Pen, Medium Point, 1mm, 
Assorted Ink

128
$13.66 0-45% n/a BIC GSM609AST 912

BIC USA INC,  MFG # 
GSM609-AST $5.00 $640.00

SSL # 2005878, sold and 
priced pk/60

2 Cash Bag Honeywell Key Lock Deposit Bag, Navy (6505)
0

MMF $38.50 0-45% n/a MMF 2330981W08 416
SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
SPR02868 $36.29 $0.00 SSL # 2050314

3 Calculator Canon LS-82Z 4075A007AA 8-Digit Portable Calculator, White
192

$12.99 0-45% n/a CNM LS82Z 356 School Smart $2.89 $554.88 SSL # 1596818

4 Binder (3 inch)
Avery TouchGuard Protection Heavy Duty 4" 3-Ring View Binder, 
White (17145)

128
$31.02 0-45% n/a AVE 17145 248

SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
AVE17145 $20.65 $2,643.20 SSL # 1330352

5 Binder (2 inch)
Avery TouchGuard Protection Heavy Duty 2" 3-Ring View Binder, 
White (17143)

128
$17.41 0-45% n/a AVE 17143 248

SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
AVE17143 $11.63 $1,488.64 SSL # 1308225

6 Binder (1 inch) Avery Showcase Economy 1" 3-Ring View Binder, White (1961)
64

$9.26 0-45% n/a AVE 05711 248
Economy Round Ring 

View Binder School Smart $1.58 $101.12 SSL # 2006482

7 Bulletin Board
Staples Standard Durable Cork Bulletin Board, Oak Frame, 3'W x 
2'H (28336-CC)

0
Master Vision $63.99 0-45% n/a BVC SB0420001233 277

MOORECO INC,  MFG # 
311AB-XX $74.78 $0.00

SSL # 1362427, aluminum 
frame

8 Cable Ties Monoprice Nylon Cable Ties, 8"L, White (5762)
64

Tatco $69.95 0-45% n/a TCO 22600 1125 black ties

RUPERT GIBBON AND 
SPIDER INC,  MFG # 
ZIPB100 $18.72 $1,198.08

SSL # 1588938, sold and 
priced pk/100, 11 3/4" long

9 Desk Pad
2022 TRU RED™ 17" x 22" Desk Pad Calendar, Black/White 
(TR12951-22)

64 House of 
Doolittle 11..56 0-45% n/a HOD 150HD 400 School Smart $5.15 $329.60 SSL # 2089177, 17 month

10 Cash Box
Honeywell Cash Management Box, 4 Compartments, Black 
(6202)

0
CARL $54.95 0-45% n/a CUI 82011 417 No bid

11 Pocket Chart Learning Resources Standard Pocket Chart (LER2206)
0

No Bid n/a
LEARNING RESOURCES 
INC,  MFG # LER2206 $15.94 $0.00

SSL # 1391741, pocket chart 
stand

12 Clipboard
Staples Hardboard Clipboards, Letter Size, Natural Brown, 3/Pack 
(44291)

320 Business 
Source $13.53 0-45% n/a BSN 16519 425 School Smart $1.21 $1,161.60

SSL # 1272480, sold and 
priced per each

13 Hooks
Command™ Medium Utility Hooks Mega Pack, White, 20 Hooks 
(17001-MPES)

64
$29.40 0-45% n/a MMM 17001MPES 600 3M,  MFG # 17001MPES $15.98 $1,022.72 SSL # 1571928

14 Coffee Maker
0

No Bid n/a
LEGACY COMPANIES,  MFG 
# 33600 $152.88 $0.00 SSL # 1592642

15 Hanging Strips
Command™ Small Picture Hanging Strips, White, 4 Sets 
(17202ES)

64
$6.29 0-45% n/a MMM 172014PKES 599 Medium 3M,  MFG # 17202ES $2.76 $176.64 SSL # 075554

16 Paper
Staples Multipurpose Paper, 8.5" x 11", 22 lbs., Bright White, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton (22098)

1600

The 
Navigator 
Company $141.20 0-45% n/a SNA PIO1122F 867 No bid

17 Correction tape Staples Correction Tape, White, 10/Pack (ST59822)
128 MONO 

Correction $23.06 0-45% n/a TOM 68722 483
BIC USA INC,  MFG # 
WOTAP10 $15.14 $1,937.92 SSL # 1272203

18 Blue Cardstock
Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Lunar Blue, 
250/Pack (22721)

256
$28.17 0-45% n/a WAU 22721 871

NEENAH PAPER INC,  MFG # 
22721 $11.48 $2,938.88 SSL # 1280642

19 Yellow Cardstock
Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Solar Yellow, 
250/Pack (22731)

256
$28.17 0-45% n/a WAU 22731 871

NEENAH PAPER INC,  MFG # 
22731 $11.48 $2,938.88 SSL # 1280355

20 Certificate NuDell 8.5"W x 11"L Certificate Frame, Black/Gold, Each (19210)
320

Lorell $13.00 0-45% n/a LLR 49215 596 No bid

Ray's Business Products 
200 E. Interstate 2, Suite l, Pharr, TX 78577

Ray Cano 956-782-1554
raycano60@yahoo.com

BID TAB: 03-IFB-CNP-2122 Office Supplies
School Specialty, LLC.

W 6316 Design Dr. Greenville, WI 54942
 Sarah Peterson 888-388-3224
bidnotice@schoolspecialty.com



21 Whiteboard
Staples Standard Durable Melamine Dry-Erase Whiteboard, Black 
Aluminum Frame, 4' x 3' (28681-CC)

0
Quartet $130.27 0-45% n/a QRT S534B 272

MOORECO INC,  MFG # 
212AC $140.09 $0.00 SSL # 674526

22 Markers EXPO Starter Set Kit, Assorted Colors (80653)
64

$15.19 0-45% n/a SAN 80653 922 SANFORD LP,  MFG # 80653 $7.71 $493.44 SSL # 088346

23 Tape
Duck Basic Strength General Purpose Duct Tape, Poly, 1.88" x 
55 Yards, Gray (DX660)

192
$16.01 0-45% n/a DUC 394468 1114 1.88" X 45 Yds. 3M,  MFG # 1055 $4.68 $898.56 SSL # 1403117

24 Pencil Sharpner Staples® Electric Pencil Sharpener, Gray/Silver (34462)
0

X-ACTO $35.62 0-45% n/a EPI 1818X 889
AMAX INC,  MFG # EPS4-
BLACK $14.79 $0.00 SSL # 1296306

25 Extension Cord CCI Polar/Solar Extension Cord, 100' (172-01489)
0 COMPU 

CESSORY $103.99 0-45% n/a CCS 25150 1101 No bid

26 Extension Cord
GE Indoor/Outdoor 50' General Purpose Extension Cord, 1-
Outlet, Orange (99599)

0
Fellowes $98.49 0-45% n/a FEL 99598 1101 No bid

27
File Cabinet (4 

drawer)
Staples 4-Drawer Light Duty Vertical File Cabinet, Locking, Letter, 
Black, 18"D (52152)

0
LORELL $558.00 20% n/a LLR 42294 195 Classroom Select $182.41 $0.00

SSL # 1447115, 
15"Wx25"Dx52"H

28 File folder
TRU RED™ File Folder, 1/3 Cut Tab, Letter Size, Manila, 100/Box 
(TR56675)

128
SMEAD $37.78 0-45% n/a SMD 10301 535 School Smart $4.90 $627.20 SSL # 015741

29 Folders
Oxford 2-Pocket Fastener Folders, Assorted Colors, 25/Box (OXF 
99811)

128 Business 
Source $39.29 0-45% n/a BSN 78531 938 School Smart $5.16 $660.48 SSL # 084901

30 Desk holder
Safco Onyx 3 Horizontal, 5 Upright Sections Mesh Desk 
Organizer, White (3266WH)

0
LORELL $67.00 0-45% n/a LLR 95255 495 No bid

31 First Aid Kit First Aid Only 107 pc. First Aid Kit for 25 People (223-U/FAO)
0

First Aid Only $57.78 0-45% n/a FAO 60002 632 School Smart $23.67 $0.00 SSL # 2003340

32 Hanging Folders 
TRU RED™ Reinforced Hanging File Folders, 5-Tab, Letter Size, 
Blue/Green/Red/Orange/Yellow, 25/Box (TR18654)

64
SMEAD $44.10 0-45% n/a SMD 64059 554 School Smart $4.45 $284.80 SSL # 085107

33 Highlighter
Sharpie Tank Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Assorted Colors, Dozen 
(25053)

128
AVERY $12.95 0-45% n/a AVE 98034 927

SANFORD LP,  MFG # 
2133496 $18.95 $2,425.60

SSL # 2047959, sold and 
priced st/36

34 Velcro Fastener
Velcro® Brand 3/4" x 15' Sticky Back Hook & Loop Fastener Roll, 
Black (90081)

64
$28.69 0-45% n/a VEK 90081 602

VELCRO USA INC,  MFG # 
90081 $13.07 $836.48 SSL # 079074

35 Clear Tape
Scotch® Magic™ Invisible Tape, 3/4" x 27.77 yds., 6 Rolls 
(810C40BK)

128
$39.86 0-45% n/a MMM 810C40BK 1105 3M,  MFG # 810C40BK $15.46 $1,978.88 SSL # 044366

36 Utility Knife Irwin® Folding Utility Knife
64

STANLEY $12.25 0-45% n/a BOS 10189C 774 No bid

37 Label Maker Tape 
Brother Genuine P-touch TZe-231 Laminated Label Maker Tape, 
0.47"W, Black On White

0
$18.99 0-45% n/a BRT TZE31 786

SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
BRTTZE231 $17.46 $0.00 SSL # 1074692

38 Label Maker Brother P-Touch PTD210 Desktop Label Maker
0

$59.95 0-45% n/a BRT PTD210 785
SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
BRTPTD210 $52.50 $0.00 SSL # 1533552

39 Step stool Cosco Big Step 3.8'H Steel Folding Step Stool (11408PBL1E)
0

$107.16 0-45% n/a CSC 11408PBL1E 798 No bid

40 Laminator 3M Scotch™ Thermal Laminator, Silver, Up To 5 mil Pouch
0

Swingline $117.05 0-45% n/a SWI 1701867 803 3M,  MFG # TL1302 $77.77 $0.00 SSL # 1494668

41 Wall Filer Safco Onyx 10-Pocket Steel Wall File, Black (5579BL)
0

$164.00 0-45% n/a SAF 5579BL 812
SAFCO PRODUCTS CO,  
MFG # 5579BL $89.50 $0.00 SSL # 1125401

42 Shelf Honey-Can-Do 3-Shelf Metal Unit, 24", Black (SHF-01905)
0

LORELL $107.00 20% n/a LLR 66962 208 No bid

43 Microwave
Sharp Carousel 1.1 Cu. Ft. 1000W Countertop Microwave Oven 
in Black

0
Avanti $254.37 0-45% n/a AVA MT112KOW 291 White & Black

ALMO DISTRIBUTING WI 
INC,  MFG # MCM1110W $107.81 $0.00 SSL # 2002553

44 ID Badge Holder
Advantus ID Badge Holder - Horizontal with Clip, 4" x 3" Insert 
Size, 50/Pack (75456)

128
$22.07 0-45% n/a AVT 75456 233

BAUMGARTENS,  MFG # 
67840 $12.87 $1,647.36 SSL # 1402411

45 Shipping Tape
Scotch® Greener Commercial-Grade Shipping Packing Tape, 
1.88" x 49.2 yds., Clear, 6 Rolls (3750G-6)

128
$62.58 0-45% n/a MMM 37506 1108 3M,  MFG # 3750G-6 $33.45 $4,281.60 SSL # 1466606

46 Paper Clips 
Staples® Jumbo Paper Clips, Nonskid, 10/Pack with 100/box 
(A7026606/72577)

64 Business 
Source $23.75 0-45% n/a BSN 53366 427 School Smart $7.21 $461.44

SSL # 1500603, sold and 
priced bx/1000

47 3 Hole Punch
Bostitch EZ Squeeze™ Three-Hole Punch, 40 Sheet Capacity, 
Silver (2240)

0
$70.34 0-45% n/a BOS HP40 1007 AMAX INC,  MFG # 2240 $42.45 $0.00 SSL # 1493159



48 Paper Cutter
Swingline® ClassicCut® Lite Guillotine Trimmer, 15" Cut Length, 
10 Sheet Capacity, Gray (9315)

0
$115.64 0-45% n/a SWI 1002 1128 School Smart $55.42 $0.00

SSL # 1485663, wood, 15 
sheets

49 Sharpie Markers
Sharpie Super Permanent Marker, Fine Tip, Black, Dozen 
(33001)

64
$20.04 0-45% n/a SAN 30001 928

SANFORD LP,  MFG # 
33001PK $15.91 $1,018.24 SSL # 1333716

50 Folding Table Staples Folding Table, 72"L x 29"W, Gray (79123)
64

Lorell $205.00 20% n/a LLR 66655 96
NATIONAL PUBLIC SEATING,  
MFG # BT3072 $86.47 $5,534.08 SSL # 676050

51 Sticky Notes
Post-it® Super Sticky Notes Cabinet Pack, 3" x 3", Rio de Janeiro 
Collection, 70 Sheets/Pad, 24 Pads/Pack (654-24SSAU-CP)

128
$45.22 0-45% n/a MMM 65424SSAUCP 860 3M,  MFG # 654-24SSAU-CP $24.21 $3,098.88 SSL # 1463189

52 Post it Tabs
Post-it® Tabs Value Pack, 1" Wide and 2" Wide, Assorted Colors, 
114 Tabs/Pack (686-VAD1)

64
$14.97 0-45% n/a MMM 686VAD1 651 3M,  MFG # 686-VAD1 $8.00 $512.00 SSL # 1434825

53 Power Strip GE 3 Outlet Power Strip, Gray (50552/43027)
64

No Bid n/a
FELLOWES INC,  MFG # 
99000 $9.02 $577.28

SSL # 680093, 6 outlet, 
beige

54 Receipt Book
Adams® Carbonless Receipt Book, 3" x 8", 2-Part, 200 Sets/Book 
(SC1182)

64
TOPS $25.93 0-45% n/a TOP 46806 592 Hammond & Stevens $8.32 $532.48

SSL # 1473616, white and 
pink, st/240

55 Stapler
TRU RED™ Desktop Stapler Kit, 20-Sheet Capacity, Black 
(TR58081)

128 Business 
Source $17.50 0-45% n/a BSN 65648 1090 School Smart $2.45 $313.60 SSL # 1274192

56 Clear Menu Frame Staples Sign Holder, 8.5" x 11", Clear Plastic (16656-CC)
128

Deflecto $18.65 0-45% n/a DEF 69201 1067 No bid

57 Rubber Bands
Staples Economy Rubber Bands, #33, 1 lb. Bag, 820/Pack 
(28619-CC)

64 Business 
Source $14.15 0-45% n/a BSN 15743 1011

ALLIANCE RUBBER CO,  
MFG # 06337 $0.81 $51.84 SSL # 020871, 1/4 # bag

58 Steel Safe SentrySafe Steel Gun Safe with Keypad, 0.58 cu. ft. (X055)
0

$198.10 20% n/a SEN X055 185

SP RICHARDS CO 
FURNITURE DIVISION,  MFG 
# SENX055 $125.33 $0.00 SSL # 1313455

59 Scissors
TRU RED™ 8" Titanium Coated Scissors, Straight Handle, 
2/Pack (TR55023)

128
Performance $25.79 0-45% n/a FSK 154130131 1046

ACME UNITED CORP,  MFG 
# 13901 $14.47 $1,852.16 SSL # 1444381

60 Sheet Protectors Staples Heavyweight Sheet Protectors, Clear, 200/Box (34846)
128 Business 

Source $37.96 0-45% n/a BSN 74552 1048 School Smart $3.45 $441.60
SSL # 067506, sold and 
priced bx/100

61 note pads
TRU RED™ Memo Books, 4" x 6", College Ruled, Assorted 
Colors, 50 Sheets/Pad, 5 Pads/Pack (TR11495)

128
AMPAD $9.69 0-45% n/a TOP 45093 850 3" X 5" School Smart $0.81 $518.40

SSL # 085208, sold and 
priced per each

62 Pre- Ink Stamp
Offistamp Pre-Inked Stamp, Received, Black and Red Ink 
(034507)

0
ECOPRINTY $3.95 0-45% n/a USS E4752 1075

SP RICHARDS CO,  MFG # 
USSE4752 $24.35 $0.00 SSL # 1375462, blue and red

63 Staples
TRU RED™ Standard Staples, 1/4" Leg Length, 5000 
Staples/Box, 5/Pack (TR58092)

64 Business 
Source $22.65 0-45% n/a BSN 65651 1094 School Smart $0.56 $179.20

SSL # 061059, sold and 
priced per box/5000

64 push pins Staples Push Pins, Assorted Colors, 100/Pack (10563-CC)
64 Business 

Source $7.00 0-45% n/a BSN 81001 286 School Smart $0.51 $32.64 SSL # 003351

65 wall clock Staples Wall Clock, Plastic, 10" Diameter (32436)
128

LORELL $23.00 0-45% n/a LLR 60987 431 9" School Smart $9.87 $1,263.36 SSL # 1543108

66 wall mesh file
Eldon Expressions 3-Pocket Metal Letter Size Wall File, Black 
(21961)

0
Officemate $50.71 0-45% n/a OIC 21611 571 Plastic

OFFICEMATE LLC,  MFG # 
26092 $13.46 $0.00 SSL # 1368945, plastic

67 3V Battery Duracell 2032 3V Lithium Coin Battery, 2/Pack (DL2032B2PK)
256

Energizer $5.31 0-45% n/a EVE 2032BP2 239
ENERGIZER LLC,  MFG # 
2032 PB-2 $2.17 $555.52 SSL # 1457430

68 wood pencils Ticonderoga Wooden Pencils, No. 2 Soft Lead, 30/Pack (13830)
128

$15.55 0-45% n/a DIX 13830 885
DIXON TICONDEROGA CO,  
MFG # X13830 $6.51 $833.28 SSL # 1396854

69 Tab dividers
Avery Big Tab Insertable Paper 5 Tab Dividers, Multicolor, Set 
(11109)

192
$1.41 0-45% n/a AVE 11109 645

AVERY PRODUCTS CORP,  
MFG # 11109 $0.62 $119.04 SSL # 2010280

70 clip boards
Staples Hardboard Clipboards, Letter Size, Natural Brown, 3/Pack 
(44291)

128 Business 
Source $13.53 0-45% n/a BSN 16519 425 School Smart $1.21 $464.64

SSL # 1272480, sold and 
priced per each

71 flashlight Eveready 7.09" LED Flashlight, Red (EVEL25IN)
64

$7.99 0-45% n/a EVE L15HS 1039
ENERGIZER LLC,  MFG # 
EVEL15HS $2.43 $155.52 SSL # 1589693

72 Notepads
Staples Notepads, 5" x 8", Narrow Ruled, White, 50 Sheets/Pad, 
Dozen Pads/Pack (ST57338)

128
AMPAD $4.97 0-45% n/a TOP 25472 849 EACH School Smart $3.81 $487.68 SSL # 027445

73 tape dispenser Scotch® Desktop Tape Dispenser, Black Two-Tone (C60-BK)
64

$9.49 0-45% n/a MMM C60BK 1104 3M,  MFG # C60-BK $2.77 $177.28 SSL # 078588

74 box cutters Staples Box Cutters, Gray, 12/Pack (610137)
64

PHC $21.04 0-45% n/a PHC HC100 773 No bid



75 perm markers
Staples DuraMark Permanent Marker, Chisel Point, Black, 
12/Pack (10403-CC)

128
AVERY $19.80 0-45% n/a AVE 08888 932 School Smart $2.98 $381.44 SSL # 1354255

76 perm markers
Staples DuraMark Permanent Markers, Medium Point, Red, 
12/Pack (18892)

128
AVERY $19.80 0-45% n/a AVE 08887 932 School Smart $2.98 $381.44 SSL # 1400755

77 AA B atteries
Duracell Coppertop AA, Alkaline Batteries, 24/Pack 
(MN1500B240001)

64
Energizer $37.00 0-45% n/a EVE E92BP24 239

ENERGIZER LLC,  MFG # 
E91BP24 $21.64 $1,384.96 SSL # 090167

78 AAA Batteries
Duracell Coppertop AAA Alkaline Batteries, 24/Pack 
(MN2400B240002)

64
Energizer $37.60 0-45% n/a EVE E91BP24 239

ENERGIZER LLC,  MFG # 
E92BP24 $21.44 $1,372.16 SSL # 1541437

79 Mounting tape Gorilla Tough & Clear Double-Sided Mounting Tape (6036002)
64

$17.99 0-45% n/a GOR 6036002 603 No bid

80 fingertip moist Sortkwik Lee 0.38 Oz. Fingertip Moisteners, Pink, 3/Pack (10053)
128

$6.03 0-45% n/a LEE 10053 829
LEE PRODUCTS CO,  MFG # 
10400 $1.39 $533.76

SSL # 073158, sold and 
priced per each

81 masking tape pck
Staples Masking Tape, 0.94" x 60 yds., Natural, 4/Pack (468413-
CC)

128 Business 
Source $3.33 0-45% n/a BSN 16461 1113 EA. 1" X 60 YDS. 3M,  MFG # 2600 1 X 60 $1.48 $757.76

SSL # 040590, sold and 
priced per each

82 fan
Holmes Lil Blizzard 12"H 2 Speed Oscillating Portable Fan, Black 
(HAOF87BLZ-UC)

0
Lorell $36.41 0-45% n/a LLR 44564 532 No bid

83 staple remover TRU RED™ Claw Staple Remover, Black, 3/Pack (TR58087)
128 Business 

Source $6.85 0-45% n/a BSN 65650 1095 EA.  School Smart $0.31 $119.04
SSL # 000189, brown, sold 
and priced per each

84 ruler Staples 12" Wooden Imperial/Metric Ruler (51891)
128

WESCOTT $2.10 0-45% n/a ACM 05011 1012 School Smart $0.23 $29.44 SSL # 081903

85 Grn Cardstock
Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Terra Green, 
250/Pack (22781)

64
$28.17 0-45% n/a WAU 22781 871

NEENAH PAPER INC,  MFG # 
22781 $11.48 $734.72 SSL # 1284413

86 Orng Cardstock
Astrobrights Cardstock Paper, 65 lbs, 8.5" x 11", Cosmic Orange, 
250/Pack (22851)

64
$28.17 0-45% n/a WAU 22851 871

NEENAH PAPER INC,  MFG # 
22851 $11.48 $734.72 SSL # 1301583

87 Extension Cord
GE Indoor/Outdoor 50' General Purpose Extension Cord, 1-
Outlet, Orange (99599)

0
Fellowes $98.49 0-45% n/a FEL 99598 1101 No bid

88 Thermal ID Pouches Staples Thermal Pouches, ID Tag, 25/Pack (19150)
64 Business 

Source $22.45 0-45% n/a BSN 20852 804 100/PK No bid

89 Thermal Pouches Staples Thermal Pouches, Letter, 100/Pack (17468)
64 Business 

Source $43.90 0-45% n/a BSN 20848 804 3M,  MFG # TP3854-100 $17.13 $1,096.32 SSL # 1438680

90 Toner CF380A HP 312A Black Standard Yield Toner Cartridge
0

$139.66 16% n/a HEW CF380A 963 No bid

91 Toner CF381A HP 312A Cyan Standard Yield Toner Cartridge
64

$186.98 16% n/a HEW CF381A 963 No bid

92 Toner CF 382A HP 312 Yellow Standard Yield Toner Cartridge
64

$186.98 16% n/a HEW CF382A 963 No bid

93 Toner CF 383A HP 312 Magenta Standard Yield Toner Cartridge 64
$186.98 16% n/a HEW CF383A 963 No bid

Notes:      Vendor responded to 90 of the 93 items requested Notes:      Vendor responded to 74 of the 93 items requested

Estimated Yearly Spend N/A $57,972.48


